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Dr. David Lineberry is currently a Research Engineer for the 
UAHuntsville Propulsion Research Center.  He is responsible for 
laboratory operations in the PRC research labs.  In his duties as 
laboratory manager, he oversees all experimental programs which 
occur in the lab, provides safety reviews prior to experimental 
campaigns, and advises graduate student research activity.  Dr. 
Lineberry designed the PRC High Pressure Spray Facility, helped to 
develop the PRC test stand liquid oxygen propellant delivery capability, 
and built the PRC High Flow Rate Cryogenic Test Rig.  In addition, Dr. 
Lineberry has worked on and been PI for numerous research projects 
for the PRC, including research in Combustion Instability, Cryogenic 
Flow Behavior, Turbopump testing, liquid, solid, and hybrid rocket hot-
fire testing, liquid rocket injector injection characteristics, and rocket 
based combined cycle cold flow testing.   
Dr. Lineberry completed his Ph.D., titled “Characterization of a Cold 
Flow Non-Axisymmetric Supersonic Ejector,” as well as his M.S., titled 
“Uncertainty Assessment of A Liquid Hydrogen Liquid Oxygen First 
Stage Engine”  through the PRC.  He has taught courses for the 
Mechanical and Aerospace Engineering Department, including 
Aerodynamics, Compressible Fluid Mechanics, Fluid Mechanics, and 
currently is teaching a Senior Design Course for Rocket Design-Build-Fly.  
He is a member of the AIAA Liquid Propulsion Technical Committee, 
and a member of the ASME Propulsion Committee.  He completed the 
ASTM oxygen safety training courses.   
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