
T-SHIRT BID NO. (B002476)
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ITEM NO. 1 - GILDAN 5000 UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

HYWT COTTON - (SHORT SL) COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 1.89$         1.71$          2.49$               1.99$                      1.90$            1.60$                 2.07$         1.85$        2.64$                           2.48$         2.74$                      2.54$           1.83$              1.61$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 1.89$         1.71$          2.39$               1.95$                      1.90$            1.60$                 2.07$         1.85$        2.14$                           1.98$         2.44$                      2.44$           1.83$              1.61$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 1.89$         1.71$          2.29$               1.90$                      1.90$            1.60$                 2.07$         1.85$        2.04$                           1.88$         2.54$                      2.34$           1.71$              1.54$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 1.89$         1.71$          2.20$               1.85$                      1.90$            1.60$                 2.07$         1.85$        1.94$                           1.78$         2.54$                      2.24$           1.71$              1.54$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 1.89$         1.71$          2.10$               1.80$                      1.90$            1.60$                 2.07$         1.85$        1.84$                           1.68$         2.49$                      2.24$           1.63$              1.43$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 1.89$         1.71$          2.03$               1.75$                      1.90$            1.60$                 2.07$         1.85$        1.74$                           1.58$         2.34$                      2.14$           1.63$              1.43$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 3.85$         3.51$          4.35$               3.45$                      3.65$            3.25$                 4.61$         4.14$        4.88$                           4.56$         5.14$                      4.05$           3.87$              3.37$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 3.85$         3.51$          4.25$               3.35$                      3.65$            3.25$                 4.61$         4.14$        4.38$                           4.06$         5.04$                      3.95$           3.87$              3.37$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)401 - 600)* 3.85$         3.51$          4.15$               3.25$                      3.65$            3.25$                 4.61$         4.14$        4.28$                           3.96$         4.94$                      3.90$           3.65$              3.19$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 3.85$         3.51$          4.10$               3.15$                      3.65$            3.25$                 4.61$         4.14$        4.18$                           3.86$         4.94$                      3.80$           3.65$              3.19$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 3.85$         3.51$          4.10$               3.10$                      3.65$            3.25$                 4.61$         4.14$        4.08$                           3.76$         4.84$                      3.80$           3.43$              2.99$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 3.85$         3.51$          3.99$               3.05$                      3.65$            3.25$                 4.61$         4.14$        3.98$                           3.66$         4.84$                      3.75$           3.43$              2.99$      

4XL (1 - 200) 3.85$         3.51$          4.35$               3.45$                      4.65$            4.25$                 5.11$         4.59$        5.00$                           5.00$         7.12$                      6.02$           5.97$              5.37$      

4XL (201 - 400) 3.85$         3.51$          4.25$               3.35$                      4.65$            4.25$                 5.11$         4.59$        5.00$                           5.00$         7.12$                      6.02$           5.63$              5.07$      

*Add $0.95 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $0.95 

to unit price 

for 3XL
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ITEM NO. 2 - GILDAN (LONG  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

SL) COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLOR WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 3.78$         2.66$          4.59$               3.65$                      3.95$            3.65$                 4.90$         3.47$        4.90$                           4.90$         2.74$                      2.54$           4.49$              3.15$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 3.78$         2.66$          4.50$               3.60$                      3.95$            3.65$                 4.90$         3.47$        4.40$                           4.40$         2.44$                      2.44$           4.49$              3.15$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 3.78$         2.66$          4.45$               3.55$                      3.95$            3.65$                 4.90$         3.47$        4.30$                           4.30$         2.34$                      2.34$           4.23$              2.99$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 3.78$         2.66$          4.40$               3.50$                      3.95$            3.65$                 4.90$         3.47$        4.20$                           4.20$         2.54$                      2.24$           4.23$              2.99$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 3.78$         2.66$          4.30$               3.45$                      3.95$            3.65$                 4.90$         3.47$        4.10$                           4.10$         2.49$                      2.24$           3.99$              2.81$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 3.78$         2.66$          4.20$               3.40$                      3.95$            3.65$                 4.90$         3.47$        4.00$                           4.00$         2.34$                      2.14$           3.99$              2.81$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 4.91$         3.69$          6.75$               4.60$                      4.95$            4.65$                 6.52$         4.84$        6.48$                           5.99$         5.14$                      4.05$           5.71$              4.23$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)*201 - 400)* 4.91$         3.69$          6.70$               4.50$                      4.95$            4.65$                 6.52$         4.84$        5.98$                           5.49$         5.04$                      3.95$           5.71$              4.23$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)*401 - 600)* 4.91$         3.69$          6.60$               4.40$                      4.95$            4.65$                 6.52$         4.84$        5.88$                           5.39$         4.94$                      3.90$           5.41$              3.99$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 4.91$         3.69$          6.50$               4.30$                      4.95$            4.65$                 6.52$         4.84$        5.78$                           5.29$         4.94$                      3.80$           5.41$              3.99$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 4.91$         3.69$          6.40$               4.20$                      4.95$            4.65$                 6.52$         4.84$        5.68$                           5.19$         4.84$                      3.80$           5.11$              3.75$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 4.91$         3.69$          6.30$               4.10$                      4.95$            4.65$                 6.52$         4.84$        5.58$                           5.09$         4.84$                      3.75$           5.11$              3.75$      

4XL (1 - 200) 4.91$         N/A 6.75$               4.60$                      6.95$            6.65$                 N/A N/A N/A N/A 7.12$                      6.02$           N/A N/A

4XL (201 - 400) 4.91$         N/A 6.70$               4.50$                      6.95$            6.65$                 N/A N/A N/A N/A 7.12$                      6.02$           N/A N/A
*Add $2.50 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $2.50 

to unit price 
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ITEM NO. 3 - GILDAN SOFT-  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

STYLE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLOR WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 2.96$         2.69$          2.95$               2.59$                      2.50$            2.20$                 2.58$         2.30$        2.98$                           2.78$         5.00$                      4.05$           2.47$              2.23$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 2.96$         2.69$          2.85$               2.49$                      2.50$            2.20$                 2.58$         2.30$        2.48$                           2.28$         4.90$                      4.00$           2.47$              2.23$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 2.96$         2.69$          2.75$               2.39$                      2.50$            2.20$                 2.58$         2.30$        2.38$                           2.18$         4.80$                      3.90$           2.33$              2.11$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 2.96$         2.69$          2.70$               2.29$                      2.50$            2.20$                 2.58$         2.30$        2.28$                           2.08$         4.75$                      3.80$           2.33$              2.11$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 2.96$         2.69$          2.65$               2.25$                      2.50$            2.20$                 2.58$         2.30$        2.18$                           1.98$         4.60$                      3.70$           2.21$              2.01$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 2.96$         2.69$          2.50$               2.15$                      2.50$            2.20$                 2.58$         2.30$        2.08$                           1.88$         4.55$                      3.70$           2.21$              2.01$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 5.85$         4.86$          5.35$               3.99$                      4.25$            4.25$                 4.83$         4.41$        4.88$                           4.78$         7.05$                      5.85$           5.49$              4.61$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 5.85$         4.86$          5.25$               3.89$                      4.25$            4.25$                 4.83$         4.41$        4.38$                           4.28$         6.90$                      5.80$           5.49$              4.61$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)401 - 600)* 5.85$         4.86$          5.10$               3.79$                      4.25$            4.25$                 4.83$         4.41$        4.28$                           4.18$         6.85$                      5.70$           5.23$              4.35$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 5.85$         4.86$          5.00$               3.70$                      4.25$            4.25$                 4.83$         4.41$        4.18$                           4.08$         6.70$                      5.60$           5.23$              4.35$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 5.85$         4.86$          4.99$               3.65$                      4.25$            4.25$                 4.83$         4.41$        4.08$                           3.98$         6.60$                      5.50$           4.91$              4.15$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 5.85$         4.86$          4.80$               3.60$                      4.25$            4.25$                 4.83$         4.41$        3.98$                           3.88$         6.55$                      5.50$           4.91$              4.15$      

4XL (1 - 200) N/A N/A 5.35$               3.99$                      6.50$            6.25$                 N/A N/A 5.00$                           5.00$         8.02$                      7.02$           N/A N/A

4XL (201 - 400) N/A N/A 5.25$               3.89$                      6.50$            6.25$                 N/A N/A 5.00$                           5.00$         8.02$                      7.02$           N/A N/A

*Add $0.95 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $1.50 

to unit price 

for 3XL
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Small - XL  (1 - 200) 6.86$         5.60$          5.45$               4.45$                      4.99$            3.99$                 6.45$         4.97$        5.88$                           4.68$         5.16$                      4.10$           5.29$              4.01$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 6.86$         5.60$          5.35$               4.35$                      4.99$            3.99$                 6.45$         4.97$        5.38$                           4.18$         5.06$                      4.05$           5.29$              4.01$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 6.86$         5.60$          5.25$               4.25$                      4.99$            3.99$                 6.45$         4.97$        5.28$                           4.08$         4.96$                      4.00$           4.99$              3.81$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 6.86$         5.60$          5.15$               4.15$                      4.99$            3.99$                 6.45$         4.97$        5.18$                           3.98$         4.86$                      3.90$           4.99$              3.81$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 6.86$         5.60$          5.10$               4.00$                      4.99$            3.99$                 6.45$         4.97$        5.08$                           3.88$         4.76$                      3.80$           4.75$              3.63$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 6.86$         5.60$          5.05$               3.95$                      4.99$            3.99$                 6.45$         4.97$        4.98$                           3.78$         4.60$                      3.70$           4.75$              3.63$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 8.66$         7.19$          7.45$               6.45$                      6.85$            5.75$                 7.53$         5.95$        7.78$                           6.68$         6.30$                      5.69$           8.19$              6.81$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 8.66$         7.19$          7.40$               6.35$                      6.85$            5.75$                 7.53$         5.95$        7.28$                           6.18$         6.20$                      5.59$           8.19$              6.81$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)401 - 600)* 8.66$         7.19$          7.35$               6.25$                      6.85$            5.75$                 7.53$         5.95$        7.18$                           6.08$         6.10$                      5.49$           7.83$              6.41$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 8.66$         7.19$          7.30$               6.15$                      6.85$            5.75$                 7.53$         5.95$        7.08$                           5.98$         6.00$                      5.29$           7.83$              6.41$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 8.66$         7.19$          7.25$               6.00$                      6.85$            5.75$                 7.53$         5.95$        6.98$                           5.88$         5.90$                      5.29$           7.45$              8.19$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 8.66$         7.19$          7.20$               5.00$                      6.85$            5.75$                 7.53$         5.95$        6.88$                           5.78$         5.90$                      5.19$           7.45$              8.19$      

4XL (1 - 200) N/A N/A 7.45$               6.45$                      7.99$            7.75$                 N/A N/A 8.00$                           8.00$         7.35$                      7.35$           N/A N/A

4XL (201 - 400) N/A N/A 7.40$               6.35$                      7.99$            7.75$                 N/A N/A 8.00$                           8.00$         7.35$                      7.35$           N/A N/A

*Add $2.50 to unit 

price for 3XL
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T-SHIRT BID NO. (B002476)

ITEM NO. 5 - HANES BEEFY-T 
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COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 5.56$         4.06$          3.99$               3.80$                      3.50$            3.25$                 4.05$         3.77$        4.60$                           4.20$         4.07$                      3.72$           3.47$              3.11$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 5.56$         4.06$          3.95$               3.70$                      3.50$            3.25$                 4.05$         3.77$        4.10$                           3.70$         4.07$                      3.62$           3.47$              3.11$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 5.56$         4.06$          3.90$               3.60$                      3.50$            3.25$                 4.05$         3.77$        4.00$                           3.60$         3.97$                      3.52$           3.27$              2.99$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 5.56$         4.06$          3.80$               3.50$                      3.50$            3.25$                 4.05$         3.77$        3.90$                           3.50$         3.87$                      3.52$           3.27$              2.99$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 5.56$         4.06$          3.75$               3.50$                      3.50$            3.25$                 4.05$         3.77$        3.80$                           3.40$         3.77$                      3.42$           3.13$              2.87$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 5.56$         4.06$          3.70$               3.40$                      3.50$            3.25$                 4.05$         3.77$        3.70$                           3.30$         3.67$                      3.32$           3.13$              2.87$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 7.41$         6.45$          6.50$               3.30$                      6.50$            5.80$                 7.57$         5.99$        6.80$                           6.15$         6.60$                      5.94$           5.39$              4.87$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 7.41$         6.45$          6.40$               5.95$                      6.50$            5.80$                 7.57$         5.99$        6.30$                           5.65$         6.50$                      5.84$           5.39$              4.87$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)401 - 600)* 7.41$         6.45$          6.30$               5.85$                      6.50$            5.80$                 7.57$         5.99$        6.20$                           5.55$         6.40$                      5.74$           5.15$              4.51$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 7.41$         6.45$          6.20$               5.80$                      6.50$            5.80$                 7.57$         5.99$        6.10$                           5.45$         6.40$                      5.69$           5.15$              4.51$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 7.41$         6.45$          6.10$               5.65$                      6.50$            5.80$                 7.57$         5.99$        6.00$                           5.35$         6.30$                      5.60$           4.83$              4.37$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 7.41$         6.45$          5.95$               5.55$                      6.50$            5.80$                 7.57$         5.99$        5.90$                           5.25$         6.15$                      5.55$           4.83$              4.37$      

4XL (1 - 200) 7.41$         6.45$          6.50$               5.50$                      7.50$            6.80$                 8.43$         7.56$        8.00$                           7.50$         7.05$                      5.94$           6.59$              5.93$      

4XL (201 - 400) 7.41$         6.45$          6.50$               5.90$                      7.50$            6.80$                 8.43$         7.56$        8.00$                           7.25$         7.05$                      5.94$           6.27$              5.71$      

*Add $1.50 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $1.50 

to unit price 

for 3XL

ITEM NO. 6 - HANES BEEFY-T 
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(LONG SL)  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLOR WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 8.03$         6.95$          7.40$               6.35$                      6.75$            5.75$                 8.39$         6.85$        7.40$                           6.50$         4.07$                      3.72$           6.43$              5.41$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 8.03$         6.95$          7.30$               6.25$                      6.75$            5.75$                 8.39$         6.85$        6.90$                           6.00$         4.07$                      3.62$           6.43$              5.41$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 8.03$         6.95$          7.20$               6.15$                      6.75$            5.75$                 8.39$         6.85$        6.80$                           5.90$         3.91$                      3.52$           6.19$              5.09$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 8.03$         6.95$          7.10$               6.05$                      6.75$            5.75$                 8.39$         6.85$        6.70$                           5.80$         3.87$                      3.42$           6.19$              5.09$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 8.03$         6.95$          7.00$               5.95$                      6.75$            5.75$                 8.39$         6.85$        6.60$                           5.70$         3.77$                      3.42$           5.97$              4.97$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 8.03$         6.95$          7.95$               5.85$                      6.75$            5.75$                 8.39$         6.85$        6.50$                           5.60$         3.67$                      3.32$           5.97$              4.97$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 10.55$       8.83$          9.40$               8.10$                      9.95$            8.60$                 11.37$       9.59$        9.20$                           7.80$         6.60$                      5.94$           7.71$              6.53$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 10.55$       8.83$          9.30$               8.00$                      9.95$            8.60$                 11.37$       9.59$        8.70$                           7.30$         3.62$                      5.84$           7.71$              6.53$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)*401 - 600)* 10.55$       8.83$          9.20$               7.95$                      9.95$            8.60$                 11.37$       9.59$        8.60$                           7.20$         6.40$                      5.74$           7.49$              6.27$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 10.55$       8.83$          9.10$               7.85$                      9.95$            8.60$                 11.37$       9.59$        8.50$                           7.10$         3.40$                      5.64$           7.49$              6.27$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 10.55$       8.83$          9.00$               7.75$                      9.95$            8.60$                 11.37$       9.59$        8.40$                           7.00$         3.30$                      5.60$           7.31$              6.11$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 10.55$       8.83$          8.90$               7.65$                      9.95$            8.60$                 11.37$       9.59$        8.28$                           6.90$         3.20$                      5.55$           7.31$              6.11$      

4XL (1 - 200) N/A N/A 9.40$               8.10$                      10.99$          9.99$                 N/A N/A 10.00$                         10.00$       7.05$                      5.94$           N/A N/A

4XL (201 - 400) N/A N/A 9.30$               8.00$                      10.99$          9.99$                 N/A N/A 10.00$                         10.00$       7.05$                      5.94$           N/A N/A

*Add $2.50 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $2.50 

to unit price 

for 3XL
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T-SHIRT BID NO. (B002476)

ITEM NO. 7 - COMFORT COLORS 
 BOOSTERS 

INC  

 BOOSTERS 

INC  

 WORLD OF 

PROMOTIONS 

 WORLD OF 

PROMOTIONS 

 WILL 

ENTERPRISES  WILL ENTERPRISES SPORT DECALS

SPORT 

DECALS BARU AGENCY INC

BARU 

AGENCY INC LEONS CAPS LEONS CAPS

AD-WEAR & 

SPECIALTY OF TX*

AD-WEAR & 

SPECIALTY 

OF TX* 4 IMPRINT STONE RIVER

(SHORT SL)  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 5.80$         5.80$          5.55$               5.55$                      5.00$            5.00$                 6.69$         6.69$        5.70$                           5.70$         7.31$                      6.21$           5.53$              5.53$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 5.80$         5.80$          5.45$               5.45$                      5.00$            5.00$                 6.69$         6.69$        5.20$                           5.20$         7.31$                      6.11$           5.53$              5.53$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 5.80$         5.80$          5.35$               5.35$                      5.00$            5.00$                 6.69$         6.69$        5.10$                           5.10$         7.21$                      6.01$           5.23$              5.23$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 5.80$         5.80$          5.25$               5.25$                      5.00$            5.00$                 6.69$         6.69$        5.00$                           5.00$         7.11$                      5.90$           5.23$              5.23$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 5.80$         5.80$          5.15$               5.15$                      5.00$            5.00$                 6.69$         6.69$        4.90$                           4.90$         7.01$                      5.80$           5.11$              5.11$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 5.80$         5.80$          5.10$               5.10$                      5.00$            5.00$                 6.69$         6.69$        4.80$                           4.80$         6.91$                      5.75$           5.11$              5.11$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 7.59$         7.59$          8.05$               8.05$                      7.75$            7.75$                 8.51$         8.51$        7.00$                           7.00$         8.89$                      7.56$           6.59$              6.59$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 7.59$         7.59$          8.00$               8.00$                      7.75$            7.75$                 8.51$         8.51$        6.50$                           6.50$         8.77$                      7.46$           6.59$              6.59$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)401 - 600)* 7.59$         7.59$          7.90$               7.90$                      7.75$            7.75$                 8.51$         8.51$        6.40$                           6.40$         8.67$                      7.36$           6.59$              6.59$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 7.59$         7.59$          7.80$               7.80$                      7.75$            7.75$                 8.51$         8.51$        6.30$                           6.30$         8.57$                      7.26$           6.59$              6.59$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 7.59$         7.59$          7.70$               7.70$                      7.75$            7.75$                 8.51$         8.51$        6.20$                           6.20$         8.44$                      7.16$           6.59$              6.59$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 7.59$         7.59$          7.60$               7.60$                      7.75$            7.75$                 8.51$         8.51$        6.10$                           6.10$         8.47$                      7.06$           6.59$              6.59$      

4XL (1 - 200) N/A N/A 8.05$               8.05$                      9.80$            9.80$                 N/A N/A 7.80$                           7.80$         10.02$                    8.15$           N/A N/A

4XL (201 - 400) N/A N/A 8.00$               8.00$                      9.80$            9.80$                 N/A N/A 7.50$                           7.50$         10.02$                    8.15$           N/A N/A

*Add $1.50 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $1.50 

to unit price 

for 3XL

ITEM NO. 8 - COMFORT COLORS 
 BOOSTERS 

INC  

 BOOSTERS 

INC  

 WORLD OF 

PROMOTIONS 

 WORLD OF 

PROMOTIONS 

 WILL 

ENTERPRISES  WILL ENTERPRISES 

SPORT 

DECALS

SPORT 

DECALS BARU AGENCY INC

BARU 

AGENCY INC LEONS CAPS LEONS CAPS

AD-WEAR & 

SPECIALTY OF 

TX*

AD-WEAR & 

SPECIALTY 

OF TX* 4 IMPRINT STONE RIVER

(LONG SL)  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 8.15$         8.15$          8.20$               8.20$                      7.65$            7.65$                 10.54$       10.54$      8.50$                                    8.50$             8.65$                      7.40$           7.09$              7.09$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 8.15$         8.15$          8.10$               8.10$                      7.65$            7.65$                 10.54$       10.54$      8.00$                                    8.00$             8.60$                      7.30$           7.09$              7.09$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 8.15$         8.15$          8.00$               8.00$                      7.65$            7.65$                 10.54$       10.54$      7.90$                                    7.90$             8.50$                      7.20$           7.09$              7.09$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 8.15$         8.15$          7.95$               7.95$                      7.65$            7.65$                 10.54$       10.54$      7.80$                                    7.80$             8.40$                      7.10$           7.09$              7.09$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 8.15$         8.15$          7.90$               7.90$                      7.65$            7.65$                 10.54$       10.54$      7.70$                                    7.70$             8.30$                      7.05$           7.09$              7.09$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 8.15$         8.15$          7.80$               7.80$                      7.65$            7.65$                 10.54$       10.54$      7.60$                                    7.60$             8.20$                      6.90$           7.09$              7.09$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 10.15$       10.15$        11.40$             11.40$                   11.50$          11.50$              12.98$       12.98$      11.60$                                  11.60$           10.85$                    7.65$           8.03$              8.03$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 10.15$       10.15$        11.30$             11.30$                   11.50$          11.50$              12.98$       12.98$      11.10$                                  11.10$           10.75$                    7.55$           8.03$              8.03$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)401 - 600) 10.15$       10.15$        11.20$             11.20$                   11.50$          11.50$              12.98$       12.98$      11.00$                                  11.00$           10.65$                    7.45$           8.03$              8.03$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800) 10.15$       10.15$        11.10$             11.10$                   11.50$          11.50$              12.98$       12.98$      10.90$                                  10.90$           10.55$                    7.35$           8.03$              8.03$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000) 10.15$       10.15$        11.00$             11.00$                   11.50$          11.50$              12.98$       12.98$      10.80$                                  10.80$           10.45$                    7.25$           8.03$              8.03$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000) 10.15$       10.15$        10.95$             10.95$                   11.50$          11.50$              12.98$       12.98$      10.70$                                  10.70$           10.30$                    7.15$           8.03$              8.03$      

4XL (1 - 200) 12.94$       12.94$        10.40$             11.40$                   12.75$          12.75$              16.18$       16.18$      12.50$                                  12.50$           11.05$                    9.80$           N/A N/A

4XL (201 - 400) 12.94$       12.94$        11.30$             11.30$                   12.75$          12.75$              16.18$       16.18$      12.00$                                  12.00$           11.05$                    9.70$           N/A N/A

*Add $1.50 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $1.50 

to unit price 

for 3XL
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T-SHIRT BID NO. (B002476)

ITEM NO. 9 -  JERZEES -
 BOOSTERS 

INC  

 BOOSTERS 

INC  

 WORLD OF 

PROMOTIONS 

 WORLD OF 

PROMOTIONS 

 WILL 

ENTERPRISES WILL ENTERPRISES

SPORT 

DECALS

SPORT 

DECALS BARU AGENCY INC

BARU 

AGENCY INC LEONS CAPS LEON CAPS

AD-WEAR & 

SPECIALTY OF 

TX*

AD-WEAR & 

SPECIALTY 

OF TX* 4 IMPRINT STONE RIVER

(SHORT SL)  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 3.45$         2.30$          3.15$               2.75$                      2.25$            1.85$                 2.18$         2.03$        3.00$                           2.70$         10.80$                    9.65$           1.95$              1.69 NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 3.45$         2.30$          3.10$               2.65$                      2.25$            1.85$                 2.18$         2.03$        2.50$                           2.20$         10.70$                    9.55$           1.95$              1.69

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 3.45$         2.30$          2.90$               2.55$                      2.25$            1.85$                 2.18$         2.03$        2.40$                           2.10$         10.60$                    9.45$           1.83$              1.59

Small - XL (601 - 800) 3.45$         2.30$          2.80$               2.45$                      2.25$            1.85$                 2.18$         2.03$        2.30$                           2.00$         10.50$                    9.35$           1.83$              1.59

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 3.45$         2.30$          2.70$               2.35$                      2.25$            1.85$                 2.18$         2.03$        2.20$                           1.90$         10.40$                    9.25$           1.77$              1.55

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 3.45$         2.30$          2.60$               2.25$                      2.25$            1.85$                 2.18$         2.03$        2.10$                           1.80$         10.30$                    9.25$           1.77$              1.55

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 5.78$         4.81$          6.25$               5.75$                      5.50$            5.25$                 4.28$         4.06$        5.00$                           4.60$         11.05$                    10.40$         3.99$              3.53

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 5.78$         4.81$          6.15$               5.65$                      5.50$            5.25$                 4.28$         4.06$        4.50$                           4.10$         11.05$                    10.30$         3.99$              3.53

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)401 - 600)* 5.78$         4.81$          6.10$               5.55$                      5.50$            5.25$                 4.28$         4.06$        4.40$                           4.00$         10.95$                    10.20$         3.77$              3.33

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 5.78$         4.81$          6.00$               5.45$                      5.50$            5.25$                 4.28$         4.06$        4.30$                           3.90$         10.85$                    10.10$         3.77$              3.33

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 5.78$         4.81$          5.90$               5.35$                      5.50$            5.25$                 4.28$         4.06$        4.20$                           3.80$         10.75$                    9.90$           3.65$              3.23

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 5.78$         4.81$          5.80$               5.25$                      5.50$            5.25$                 4.28$         4.06$        4.10$                           3.70$         10.65$                    9.85$           3.65$              3.23

4XL (1 - 200) 5.78$         4.81$          6.25$               5.75$                      6.50$            6.25$                 5.60$         5.40$        5.50$                           5.50$         12.05$                    11.85$         5.25$              4.67

4XL (201 - 400) 5.78$         4.81$          6.10$               5.65$                      6.50$            6.25$                 5.60$         5.40$        5.00$                           5.00$         12.05$                    11.15$         4.97$              4.43

*Add $2.50 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $2.50 

to unit price 

for 3XL

ITEM NO. 10 - JERZEES - 
 BOOSTERS 

INC  

 BOOSTERS 

INC  

 WORLD OF 

PROMOTIONS 

 WORLD OF 

PROMOTIONS 

 WILL 

ENTERPRISES  WILL ENTERPRISES

SPORT 

DECALS

SPORT 

DECALS BARU AGENCY INC 

BARU 

AGENCY INC LEONS CAPS LEONS CAPS

AD-WEAR & 

SPECIALTY OF 

TX*

AD-WEAR & 

SPECIALTY 

OF TX* 4 IMPRINT STONE RIVER

(LONG SL)  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE COLORS WHITE

Small - XL  (1 - 200) 6.01$         4.56$          4.99$               3.99$                      4.65$            4.65$                 5.59$         4.19$        5.90$                           4.80$         2.71$                      2.49$           3.97$              3.27$      NO BID NO BID

Small - XL  (201 - 400) 6.01$         4.56$          4.89$               3.89$                      4.65$            4.65$                 5.59$         4.19$        5.40$                           4.30$         2.61$                      2.39$           3.97$              3.27$      

Small - XL  (401 - 600) 6.01$         4.56$          4.79$               3.79$                      4.65$            4.65$                 5.59$         4.19$        5.30$                           4.20$         2.51$                      2.29$           3.77$              3.17$      

Small - XL (601 - 800) 6.01$         4.56$          4.69$               3.69$                      4.65$            4.65$                 5.59$         4.19$        5.20$                           4.10$         2.41$                      2.19$           3.77$              3.17$      

Small - XL (801 - 1,000) 6.01$         4.56$          4.60$               3.60$                      4.65$            4.65$                 5.59$         4.19$        5.10$                           4.00$         2.31$                      2.09$           3.67$              3.09$      

Small - XL (1,001 - 5,000) 6.01$         4.56$          4.55$               3.55$                      4.65$            4.65$                 5.59$         4.19$        5.00$                           3.90$         2.21$                      2.00$           3.67$              3.09$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)* 8.05$         6.43$          7.40$               5.99$                      5.70$            5.70$                 7.04$         5.25$        8.00$                           6.90$         5.65$                      4.09$           5.29$              4.59$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)201 - 400)* 8.05$         6.43$          7.30$               5.89$                      5.70$            5.70$                 7.04$         5.25$        7.50$                           6.40$         5.55$                      4.09$           5.29$              4.59$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)401 - 600)* 8.05$         6.43$          7.20$               5.79$                      5.70$            5.70$                 7.04$         5.25$        7.40$                           6.30$         5.45$                      3.90$           5.09$              4.35$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)601 -800)* 8.05$         6.43$          7.10$               5.69$                      5.70$            5.70$                 7.04$         5.25$        7.30$                           6.20$         5.35$                      3.80$           5.09$              4.35$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)801 - 1,000)* 8.05$         6.43$          6.90$               5.60$                      5.70$            5.70$                 7.04$         5.25$        7.20$                           6.10$         5.25$                      3.70$           4.93$              4.21$      

2XL - 3XL (1 - 200)1,001 - 5,000)* 8.05$         6.43$          6.80$               5.55$                      5.70$            5.70$                 7.04$         5.25$        7.10$                           6.00$         5.15$                      3.60$           4.93$              4.21$      

4XL (1 - 200) N/A N/A 7.40$               5.99$                      6.85$            6.85$                 N/A N/A 8.50$                           7.50$         5.70$                      5.20$           5.79$              4.99$      

4XL (201 - 400) N/A N/A 7.30$               5.89$                      6.85$            6.85$                 N/A N/A 8.00$                           7.00$         5.60$                      5.10$           5.53$              4.77$      
*Add $0.95 to unit 

price for 3XL

*Add $0.95 

to unit price 

for 3XL
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QUOTE IMPRINT UNIT COST - 

 Boosters, 

Inc. 

 World of 

Promotions 

 Will 

Enterprises Sport Decals Baru Agency Inc Leons caps

Ad-Wear & 

Specialty of 

Tx 4 Imprint

Stone 

River

One (1) Color, Front Only, Full Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Chest

1 - 1,000 1.55$         2.00$               0.65$            0.78$         0.32$                           0.50$                      0.43$              NO BID NO BID

1,001 - 5,000 0.85$         1.00$               0.59$            0.62$         0.22$                           0.40$                      0.41$              

One (1) Color, Front Only, Top 

Left Chest

1 - 1,000 1.55$         3.60$               0.65$            0.78$         0.32$                           0.50$                      0.43$              

1,001 - 5,000 0.85$         2.00$               0.59$            0.62$         0.22$                           0.40$                      0.41$              

One (1) Color, Front & Back 

1 - 1,000 3.11$         2.00$               1.05$            1.56$         0.60$                           0.90$                      0.73$              

1,001 - 5,000 1.69$         1.00$               0.95$            1.24$         0.50$                           0.70$                      0.71$              

QUOTE IMPRINT UNIT COST

 Boosters 

Inc. 

 World of 

Promotions 

 Will 

Enterprises 

Sport 

Decals Baru Agency Inc Leons Caps

Adwear & 

Specialty of 

TX 4 Imprint

Stone 

River

Two (2) Colors, Front Only, Full Unit Price

Chest

1 - 1,000 2.00$         2.00$               0.70$            0.87$         0.42$                           0.65$                      0.43$              NO BID NO BID

1,001 - 5,000 1.03$         1.00$               0.65$            0.70$         0.32$                           0.52$                      0.41$              

Two (2) Colors, Front Only, Top

Left Chest

1 - 1,000 2.00$         2.00$               0.70$            0.87$         0.42$                           0.65$                      0.43$              

1,001 - 5,000 1.03$         1.60$               0.65$            0.70$         0.32$                           0.52$                      0.41$              

Two (2) Colors, Front & Back

1 - 1,000 4.00$         2.00$               1.15$            1.74$         0.72$                           0.94$                      0.73$              

1,001 - 5,000 2.06$         1.60$               1.05$            1.40$         0.65$                           1.04$                      0.71$              
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QUOTE IMPRINT UNIT COST 

 Boosters 

Inc. 

 World of 

Promotions 

 Will 

Enterprises 

Sport 

Decals Baru Agency Inc Leons Caps

Adwear & 

Specialty of 

TX 4 Imprint

Stone 

River

Three (3) Colors, Front Only, Full Unit Price

Chest 2.43$         2.40$               0.75$            0.99$         0.48$                           0.72$                      0.59$              NO BID NO BID

1 - 1,000 1.22$         1.80$               0.70$            0.79$         0.38$                           0.56$                      0.53$              

1,001 - 5,000

Three (3) Colors, Front Only, Top 

Left Chest

1 - 1,000 2.43$         2.40$               0.75$            0.99$         0.48$                           0.72$                      0.59$              

1,001 - 5,000 1.22$         1.80$               0.70$            0.79$         0.38$                           0.56$                      0.53$              

Three (3) Colors, Front & Back

1 - 1,000 4.86$         4.00$               1.20$            1.98$         0.78$                           1.35$                      0.83$              

1,001 - 5,000 2.43$         2.30$               1.15$            1.58$         0.70$                           1.22$                      0.79$              

QUOTE IMPRINT UNIT COST 

 Boosters 

Inc. 

 World of 

Promotions 

 Will 

Enterprises 

Sport 

Decals Baru Agency Inc Leons Caps

Ad-wear  & 

Specialty of 

TX 4 Imprint

Stone 

River

Four (4) Colors, Front Only, Full Unit Price

Chest

1 - 1,000 2.88$         2.40$               0.80$            1.09$         0.58$                           0.90$                      0.59$              NO BID NO BID

1,001 - 5,000 1.43$         1.80$               0.75$            0.87$         0.48$                           0.64$                      0.59$              

Four (4) Colors, Front Only, Top

Left Chest

1 -  1,000 2.88$         2.40$               0.80$            1.09$         0.58$                           0.90$                      0.59$              

1,001 - 5,000 1.43$         1.90$               0.75$            0.87$         0.48$                           0.64$                      0.59$              

Four (4) Colors, Front & Back 

1 - 1,000 5.75$         4.50$               1.30$            2.18$         0.82$                           1.75$                      0.97$              

1,001 - 5,000 2.86$         2.95$               1.25$            1.74$         0.75$                           1.65$                      0.97$              
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FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH NO BID NO BID

TERMS NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30

WARRANTY N/A
Against 

Any Mfr 

defects

N/A

3-point 

quality 

check
N/A 30 days

As Per 

Factory

ESTIMATED DELIVERY N/A 10-15 days N/A 7-10 days 10 Business Days 10 days 10 Business Days

YOUR REF. NO. N/A N/A N/A UAH Bid 2017 SB N/A N/A

QUOTATION EFF UNTIL N/A One Year N/A Dec-17 12/31/2017 12/24/2017 Dec. 2017

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB WD SB SB SB SB SD

BASED ON A RANDOM SAMPLING OF PAST ORDERS, THIS BID IS AWARDED TO BARU AGENCY.

EMP: 2/9/2017
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