Printing Square | bpi media Advance Brand Street Parris Jones Hot Graphic UAB Printing
Mailer (B002531) group Central | FCL Graphics LLC Printing Printing  |Printing
RV02 RV02 Original RV02 RV02 RV01 RV02
Item |Description | Total Price | Total Price Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price
1) |Square Mailer Stock: 80# McCoy Gloss Cover Mailing Flat 6x18 Finished 6x6
5,000 $1,635.00 $1,716.00 $1,468.57 $1,900.00 $1,839.59 | $2,506.06 No Bid
10,000| $2,148.00 $2,275.00 $2,414.29 $2,525.00 $2,317.52 | $3,326.36 No Bid
20,000 $3,210.00 $3,386.00 $4,254.29 $3,800.00 $3,256.55 | $5,132.66 No Bid
30,000| $4,257.00 $4,499.00 $5,642.86 $5,100.00 $4,149.37 | $6,747.17 No Bid
40,000| $5,261.00 $5,374.00 $7,334.29 $6,400.00 $4,917.34 | $8,158.80 No Bid
50,000| $6,284.00 | $6,101.00 $5,610.00 $8,522.86 | $7,600.00 | $5,763.48 | $9,790.48 No Bid
60,000| $7,339.00 | $6,923.00 $6,460.00 $9,977.14 | $9,000.00 | $6,574.09 | $11,443.19 No Bid
70,000] $8,413.00 | $7,797.00 $7,305.00 | $11,320.00 | $10,300.00 | $7,444.74 | $13,071.19 No Bid
80,000 $7,867.00
90,000 $8,669.00
100,000 $9,521.00
2) |Square Maller Stock: 8U# McCoy Gloss Cover NON-Mailing Flat 6x18 Finisnhed bxo
5,000 $1,453.00 | $1,205.00 $1,032.86 | $1,625.00 | $1,839.59 | $2,263.69 No Bid
10,000] $1,873.00 | $1,625.00 $1,585.71 | $2,100.00 | $2,317.52 | $2,900.43 No Bid
20,000] $2,750.00 $2,465.00 $2,640.00 $3,200.00 $3,256.55 | $4,185.62 No Bid
30,000] $3,612.00 $3,305.00 $3,242.86 $4,225.00 $4,149.37 | $5,443.67 No Bid
40,000| $4,444.00 $4,067.00 $4,148.57 $5,275.00 $4,917.34 | $6,546.65 No Bid
50,000] $5,268.00 $4,658.00 $4,305.00 $4,551.43 $6,175.00 $5,763.48 | $7,885.54 No Bid
60,000| $6,133.00 | $5,338.00 $4,960.00 $5,220.00 | $7,100.00 | $6,574.09 | $9,175.22 No Bid
70,000] $7,016.00 $6,088.00 $5,636.00 $5,777.14 $8,100.00 $7,444.74 | $10,522.10 No Bid
80,000 $6,030.00
90,000 $6,661.00
100,000 $7,305.00
3) |[Square Maller 1U0# McCoy Gloss Cover Malling Flat bX18 Finished bxo
5,000] $1,860.00 $1,863.00 $1,542.86 $2,100.00 $2,274.90 | $2,812.82 No Bid
10,000| $2,478.00 $2,522.00 $2,542.86 $2,800.00 $2,867.82 | $3,689.84 No Bid
20,000 $3,756.00 $3,784.00 $4,522.86 $4,300.00 $4,001.71 | $5,469.30 No Bid
30,000| $5,026.00 | $5,043.00 $5,948.57 | $5,850.00 | $5,126.68 | $7,207.18 No Bid
40,000 $6,200.00 $6,064.00 $7,745.71 $7,400.00 $6,227.42 | $8,800.19 No Bid
50,000| $7,420.00 | $6,808.00 $6,334.00 $9,020.00 | $8,750.00 | $7,362.86 | $10,630.26 No Bid
60,000| $8,703.00 $7,793.00 $7,310.00 $10,568.57 | $10,400.00 | $8,526.08 | $12,439.30 No Bid
70,000| $9,969.00 | $8,787.00 $8,287.00 | $11,988.57 | $11,900.00 | $9,641.30 | $14,265.68 No Bid
80,000 $8,970.00
90,000 $9,894.00
100,000 $10,819.00




| bpi media | Advance |FCL Graphics|Brand Street] Parris |  Jones  |Hot Graphic | UAB Printing
4) |Square Mailer 100# McCoy Gloss Cover NON- Mailing Flat 6x18 Finished ox6
5,000] $1,667.00 | $1,342.00 $1,107.14 | $1,800.00 | $2,274.90 | $2,377.12 No Bid
10,000 $2,189.00 | $1,864.00 $1,714.29 | $2,400.00 | $2,867.82 | $3,263.90 No Bid
20,000 $3,272.00 | $2,853.00 $2,908.57 | $3,600.00 | $4,001.71 | $4,689.22 No Bid
30,000 $4,347.00 | $3,840.00 $3,548.57 | $5,000.00 | $5,126.68 | $6,118.48 No Bid
40,000] $5,327.00 | $4,758.00 $4,560.00 | $6,150.00 | $6,227.42 | $7,361.84 No Bid
50,000| $6,352.00 | $5,360.00 | $5,055.00 | $5,048.57 | $7,300.00 | $7,362.86 | $8,830.33 No Bid
60,000| $7,440.00 | $6,208.00 | $5,877.00 | $5,811.43 | $8,600.00 | $8,526.08 | $10,324.22 No Bid
70,000| $8,511.00 | $7,078.00 | $6,695.00 | $6,445.71 | $9,800.00 | $9,641.30 | $11,985.57 No Bid
80,000 $7,180.00
90,000 $7,890.00
100,000 $8,598.00
5) |Square Mailer Stock: 120# McCoy Gloss Cover Malling Flat 6X18 Finished 6x6
5,000| $2,031.00 | $2,005.00 $1,668.57 | $2,300.00 | $2,408.64 | $2,959.76 No Bid
10,000 $2,720.00 | $2,688.00 $2,757.14 | $3,100.00 | $3,063.14 | $3,838.64 No Bid
20,000| $4,162.00 | $4,089.00 $4,711.43 | $4,900.00 | $4,351.89 | $5,958.39 No Bid
30,000| $5,575.00 | $5,646.00 $6,274.29 | $6,600.00 | $5,599.96 | $7,871.91 No Bid
40,000| $6,901.00 | $6,690.00 $8,165.71 | $8,300.00 | $6,867.73 | $9,555.80 No Bid
50,000| $8,280.00 | $7,701.00 | $7,054.00 | $9,785.71 | $9,900.00 | $8,162.10 | $11,675.85 No Bid
60,000| $9,707.00 | $8,870.00 | $8,164.00 | $11,434.29 | $11,700.00 | $9,432.80 | $13,596.66 No Bid
70,000| $11,135.00 | $9,990.00 | $9,320.00 | $12,997.14 | $13,500.00 | $10,730.67 | $15,716.73 No Bid
80,000 $10,024.00
90,000 $11,068.00
100,000 $12,165.00
6) |Square Mailer Stock: 120# McCoy Gloss Cover NON-Mailing Flat 6X18 FInished 6x6
5,000] $1,829.00 | $1,488.00 $1,232.86 | $2,000.00 | $2,408.64 | $3,531.78 No Bid
10,000 $2,426.00 | $2,035.00 $1,928.57 | $2,700.00 | $3,063.14 | $3,416.40 No Bid
20,000 $3,680.00 | $3,163.00 $3,097.14 | $4,175.00 | $4,351.89 | $5,186.36 No Bid
30,000| $4,897.00 | $4,290.00 $3,874.29 | $5,750.00 | $5,599.96 | $6,818.36 No Bid
40,000] $6,036.00 | $5,378.00 $4,980.00 | $7,250.00 | $6,867.73 | $8,171.49 No Bid
50,000 $7,218.00 | $6,253.00 $5,820.00 | $5,814.29 | $8,500.00 | $8,162.10 | $9,821.14 No Bid
60,000 $8,459.00 | $7,285.00 $6,795.00 | $6,677.14 | $10,100.00 | $9,432.80 | $11,649.83 No Bid
70,000 $9,701.00 | $8,306.00 $7,741.00 | $7,454.29 | $11,600.00 | $10,730.67 | $13,301.08 No Bid
80,000 $8,230.00
90,000 $9,060.00
100,000 $9,950.00
Totals[$250,370.00] $228,666.00 | $251,389.00 |$257,010.01] $294,950.00 [ $265,816.76 [$362,434.26 $0.00




bpi media | Advance |FCL Graphics|Brand Street Parris Jones Hot Graphic | UAB Printing
November 17, 2018 through November 16, 2019
2.00% | [ 2.00% N/A 3.00% 3.00% 0.00% No Bid
November 17, 2019 through November 16, 2020
2.00% | | 2.00% N/A 5.00% 3.00% 0.00% No Bid
Additional Costs and Notes:
Postage Actual indicate any
billed or pAH additional costs
Permit anticipate by the
vendor not included
in the base section
above. Postage
Cost cannot be
known until items
are sorted and
mailed. Changed
sparately with no
provider charges
associated- Price
directly from USPS
to Customer
bpi media | Central Service |FCL Graphics,|Brand Street Parris Jones Hot Graphic | UAB Printing
FOB UAH UAH Harwood Hits, UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH
Terms| net 30 days Net 30 net 30 days Net 30 Net 30
Warranty N/A N/A
Contingent of .
Estimated . 8-10 working | Files; 2 weeks 10 business
. per bid 10 days . days after
Delivery days estimate on
proof approval
Job
Your
Reference 495714958 / Est. 3169 42431913
4960
NO.
uutlauort
Effective 1/15/2018 3/31/2017 $43,101.00 60 days
LIntil
Business SB N/A SB LB SB WB
Classification
The bid is awarded by total low to Advance Central as the apparent lowest 11/27//2017
responsible bidder, meeting specifications. PKH




