
bpi  media 

group

Walker360 

Printing

Brand Street Courier 

Printing

Creasey 

Printing 

Advance 

Central 

Services

StoneRiver, 

Inc.

Birmingham 

Printing & 

Publishing, 

Item Description Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Option  

1   

Base price, catalog 

printing

Digital Printing - 16 

interior pages w/4 

page 4-color cover

Quantity 8,000      N/A $2,348.00 N/A

Not 

Economical No Bid $5,551.20 No Bid No Bid

Option  

2  

Offset Printing - 16 

interior pages w/4 

page 4-color cover

Quantity 8,000  $2,125.00 $2,348.00 $3,681.43 $2,883.00 $2,065.00 $5,551.20 No Bid No Bid
mailing 7200

Option  

3   

Base price, catalog 

printing

Digital Printing - 16 

interior pages w/4 

page 2-color cover

Quantity 8,000       N/A $2,348.00 N/A

Not 

Economical No Bid $5,551.20 No Bid No Bid
mailing 7200

Option  

4   

Offset Printing - 16 

interior pages w/4 

page 2-color cover

Quantity 8,000 $2,075.00 $2,348.00 $3,681.43 $2,714.00 $2,069.00 $5,551.20 No Bid No Bid

5)

Base price per 500, 

mail handling Print 

and/or affix labels, 

sort, and sack 3rd 

class, carrier route 

labels generated by 

vendor. $75.00 $25.00

included in 

price above, 

8000 quantity, 

not quoting 

500 $150.00 $20.00 $772.00 No Bid No Bid

$15.00/500 

with 150.00 

Min.

per 500

Total 8000
$1,200.00 $400.00 $0.00 $240.00 $320.00 $772.00 No Bid No Bid
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bpi  media 

group

Walker360 

Printing

Brand Street Courier 

Printing

Creasey 

Printing 

Advance 

Central 

Services

StoneRiver, 

Inc.

Birmingham 

Printing & 

Publishing, 

Option 

1

Totals includes Digital 

16 pgs 4 page 4-color 

cover,  8,000 mail 

handling item 5

no bid $2,748.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $6,323.20 No Bid No Bid

Option 

2

Totals includes Offset 

16 pgs 4 page 4-color 

cover,  8,000 mail 

handling item 5

$3,325.00 $2,748.00 $3,681.43 $3,123.00 $2,385.00 $6,323.20 No Bid No Bid

Option 

3

Totals includes Digital 

16 pgs  4 page 2-color 

cover, 8,000 mail 

handling item 5,

no bid $2,748.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $6,323.20 No Bid No Bid

Option 

4

Totals includes Offset 

16 pgs 4 page  2-color 

cover , 8,000  mail 

handling item 5 

$3,275.00 $2,748.00 $3,681.43 $2,954.00 $2,389.00 $6,323.20 No Bid No Bid

6)
Addition of 4 page 

body increments $425.00 $792.00

12 page + 

cover total 

$2,761.43 $390.00 $600.00 $0.70 No Bid No Bid

includes 

mailing 7200 

offset 

per book

6a)

Subtraction of 4 page 

body increments $425.00 $792.00

This vaies in 

subrtaction 

and addition, 

so quoting as 

a whole 20 

page + cover 

total 

$3,992.86 

includes 

mailing 7200 

offset $390.00 $0.00 $0.70 No Bid

7)
Additional charge for 

bleeds (Cover only)? $30.00 $0.00 N/A $0.00 N/C N/A No Bid No Bid

8)
Addition of 500 copy 

increments $115.00 $148.00 
N/A only quoting 

8,000
$93.00 $116.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid

8a)
Subtraction of 500 

copy increments $115.00 ($94.00)
N/A only quoting 

8,000 ($93.00) ($50.00) $0.00 No Bid No Bid

9) Additional charge for 

half tones?

N/C $0.00 N/A $0.00

N/C if furnished 

scanned and 

sized N/A No Bid No Bid



bpi  media 

group

Walker360 

Printing

Brand Street Courier 

Printing

Creasey 

Printing 

Advance 

Central 

Services

StoneRiver, 

Inc.

Birmingham 

Printing & 

Publishing, 

Inc.

10)

Shipping/freight 

charges for delivery to 

Huntsville, AL (If 

applicable) N/A $85.00 $35.00 $157.00 $362.00 N/A No Bid No Bid

11) Additional Costs

If doing the mail 

processing, 

inkjetting & 

sorting freight will 

reduce by $122

Authors 

alterations 

100.00/hr + cost 

to output new 

proof(s)

From October 1, 

2018 Through 

September 30, 2019

5% 0% 3% 1%

From October 1, 

2019 Through 

September 30, 2020

5% 0% 3% 2%

From October 1, 

2020 Through 

September 30, 2021 
5% 0% 3% 2%

From October 1, 

2021 Through 

September 30, 2022 
5% 0% 3% 2%

Option 

1

10/1/2017 Thru 9/30/ 

2018 option 1
no bid $2,748.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

2
$3,325.00 $2,748.00 $3,681.43 $3,123.00 $2,385.00 $6,323.20 no bid no bid

Option 

3
no bid $2,748.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

4
$3,275.00 $2,748.00 $3,681.43 $2,954.00 $2,389.00 $6,323.20 no bid no bid

Option 

1

10/1/2018 Thru 9/30/ 

2019
no bid $2,885.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

2
$3,325.00 $2,885.40 $3,681.43 $3,123.00 $2,456.55 $6,449.66 no bid no bid

Option 

3
no bid $2,885.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

4
$3,275.00 $2,885.40 $3,681.43 $2,954.00 $2,460.67 $6,449.66 no bid no bid

Option 

1

10/1/2019 Thru 9/30/ 

2020 no bid $3,029.67 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

2
$3,325.00 $3,029.67 $3,681.43 $3,123.00 $2,530.25 $6,578.66 no bid no bid

Option 

3
no bid $3,029.67 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

4
$3,275.00 $3,029.67 $3,681.43 $2,954.00 $2,534.49 $6,578.66 no bid no bid



bpi  media 

group

Walker360 

Printing

Brand Street Courier 

Printing

Creasey 

Printing 

Advance 

Central 

Services

StoneRiver, 

Inc.

Birmingham 

Printing & 

Publishing, 

Inc.Option 

1

10/1/2020 Thru 9/30/ 

2021 no bid $3,181.15 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

2
$3,325.00 $3,181.15 $3,681.43 $3,123.00 $2,606.15 $6,710.23 no bid no bid

Option 

3
no bid $3,181.15 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

4
$3,275.00 $3,181.15 $3,681.43 $2,954.00 $2,610.52 $6,710.23 no bid no bid

Option 

1

10/1/2021 Thru 9/30/ 

2022 no bid $3,340.21 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

2
$3,325.00 $3,340.21 $3,681.43 $3,123.00 $2,684.34 $6,844.44 no bid no bid

Option 

3
no bid $3,340.21 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

4
$3,275.00 $3,340.21 $3,681.43 $2,954.00 $2,688.84 $6,844.44 no bid no bid

Option 

1 Totals for 5 years no bid $15,184.43 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

2 Totals for 5 years $16,625.00 $15,184.43 $18,407.15 $15,615.00 $12,662.29 $32,906.19 no bid no bid

Option 

3 Totals for 5 years no bid $15,184.43 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Option 

4 Totals for 5 years $16,375.00 $15,184.43 $18,407.15 $14,770.00 $12,683.53 $32,906.19 no bid no bid

FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH

TERMS
 Net 30 days  Net 30

net 30 

Payment 

Terms

 Net 30 days  Net 30 days

WARRANTY

No warranty 

coverage

ESTIMATED 

DELIVERY

6 working 

days
As specified

6-8 business 

days after 

PO/Art

YOUR REFERENCE 

NO.
#4715 102584

QUOTATION 

EFFECTIVE UNTIL
10/18/2017 one(1) year

60 days fom bid 

opening

BUSINESS 

CLASSIFICATION
SB SB SB LB WB

10/24/2017  

PKH
The bid is awarded by total low to Walker 360 Printing for option 1 and 3, and Creasey Printing for option 

2 and item 4 as the apparent lowest responsible bidder, meeting specifications.


