
Printing Osher Lifelong Learning 

Institute editions B002407

Craftman 

Printing

Ambrose 

Printing
Colonial 

Printing

Courier 

Printing

Just Rite 

Printing

Creasey 

Printing 

Signature 

Offset

bpi  media 

group

Interstate 

Printing & 

Graphics

United 

Graphics, LLC

Item Description Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Total 

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

 1)   

Base price, catalog printing

Digital Printing - 16 interior 

pages w/4 page 4-color cover

Quantity 8,000      N/A N/A $2,275.00 $0.00 $3,608.00 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid N/A

 2)   

Offset Printing - 16 interior pages 

w/4 page 4-color cover

Quantity 8,000  $2,692.00 $2,496.00 $2,275.00 $2,995.00 $3,608.00 $2,204.00 $1,964.29 $2,086.00 $2,210.00 $1,532.00

  3)    

Base price, catalog printing

Digital Printing - 16 interior 

pages w/4 page 2-color cover

Quantity 8,000       

N/A N/A $2,100.00 $0.00 $3,416.00 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid N/A

4)

Offset Printing - 16 interior pages 

w/4 page 2-color cover

Quantity 8,000 $2,579.00 $2,478.25 $2,100.00 $2,895.00 $3,016.00 $2,204.00 $1,885.84 $1,963.00 $2,034.00 $1,536.00

5)

Base price per 500, mail 

handling Print and/or affix labels, 

sort, and sack 3rd class,

carrier route labels generated by 

vendor. $17.50 $29.30 $12.00 $200.00 $411.00 $20.00 $41.25 $12.00 $30.55

$370.00 for 

7200 copies

per 500 $422.00 Min. $591.00 per 500 per 500 per 500

total inkjet on piece 

and labels
Total 8000

$280.00 $422.00 $192.00 $200.00 $1,002.00 $320.00 $660.00 $192.00 $488.80 $412.00

*1

Totals includes Digital 16 pgs 4 

page 4-color cover,  8,000 mail 

handling item 5 $0.00 $0.00 $2,467.00 $0.00 $4,610.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

*2

Totals includes Offset 16 pgs 4 

page 4-color cover,  8,000 mail 

handling item 5 $2,972.00 $2,918.00 $2,467.00 $3,195.00 $4,610.00 $2,524.00 $2,624.29 $2,278.00 $2,698.80 $1,944.00

*3

Totals includes Digital 16 pgs  4 

page 2-color cover, 8,000 mail 

handling item 5, $0.00 $0.00 $2,292.00 $0.00 $4,418.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

*4
Totals includes Offset 16 pgs 4 

page  2-color cover , 8,000  mail 

handling item 5 $2,859.00 $2,900.25 $2,292.00 $3,095.00 $4,018.00 $2,524.00 $2,545.84 $2,155.00 $2,522.80 $1,948.00



Craftman 

Printing

Ambrose 

Printing
Colonial 

Printing

Courier 

Printing

Just Rite 

Printing

Creasey 

Printing 

Signature 

Offset

bpi  media 

group

Interstate 

Printing & 

Graphics

United 

Graphics, LLC

6)
Addition of 4 page body 

increments $95.10 $300.00 $250.00 $500.00 $212.85 $279.00

6a)
Subtraction of 4 page body 

increments $604.04 $300.00 $450.00 $75.00 $182.57 $36.00

16 total pgs 4 color cover $2,646.00

16 total pgs 2 color cover $257.00

24 total pgs 4 color cover $3,330.00

24 total pgs 2 color cover $3,211.00

7)
Additional charge for bleeds 

(Cover only)? N/A N/A N/C $0.00 N/C no charge

No 

additional 

charge N/C NC same price

8) Addition of 500 copy increments $2,543.00 75.64 $92.00 $124.00 $148.03 $93.00 $79.00

8a)
Subtraction of 500 copy 

increments $2,768.00 75.64 $92.00 $24.00 $142.77 $93.00 $63.00

9) Additional charge for half tones?

N/A N/A N/C

$0.00

N/C

no charge if 

scanned and 

sized

No 

additional 

charge N/C

NC

10)
Shipping/freight charges for 

delivery to Huntsville, AL (If 
$11-16 pgs 192.81

N/C $65.00 $45.00 Included Included N/C $750.00 $95.00

$29-20 pgs

$48-24pgs

11) Additional Costs

Actual 

postage 

additional 

Authors 

alterations at 

proofs 

100.00/hr + 

cost to output 

new proof(s)

FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH
TERMS  Net 30 net 30 days net 30 days  Net 30  Net 30 days  Net 30  Net 30  Net 30  Net 30 

WARRANTY NA 1 year

ESTIMATED DELIVERY

7-10 days

7days after 

proof 

approval

10 days or 

sooner

10-15 working 

days from 

receipt

10 

business 

days after 

proof 

approval 

6 working day per bid specs
Approx. 10 days 

from PO

YOUR REFERENCE NO. BradJ 79388 42431913 22331
QUOTATION EFFECTIVE 

UNTIL 2/1/2017
March 31st 

2016
job is ready $42,469.00 60 days $42,948.00 90 days 90 days

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB LB SB WB NA SB NA SB

3/10/2016 

PKH

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           

Colonial Printing for item 1 and 3, and United Graphics, LLC for item 2 and item 4 is the apparent lowest 

responsible bidder.

$272.00

$206.00

$325.00$120.00

$202.00$145.00



Colorxpress

Total Price

No bid

$2,364.00

No bid

$2,260.00

$25.00

$400.00

$0.00

$2,764.00

$0.00

$2,660.00



Colorxpress

$581.00

$183.00

N/C

$98.00

N/C

$450.00

Ship balance 

of 800 to 

35899  $56.00


