Oscilloscopes

i . Tequipment.net
(B002415.RVO1) Saelig Company, Inc Test Southeast BNC Newark quip Mouser
Item| Qty |Description Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price |Total Price| Unit Price
Tektronix DPO2014B-7
1) | 23 |Rigol Oscilloscope MSO1104z | $827.00 | $19,021.00| $947.15 | $21,784.45 | $19,491.35| $1,830.00 | $31,110.00 $900.00 |$20,700.00| No Bid
Tektronix MDO4024C.SAO0
2) | 4 |Rigol Oscilloscope DS6102 $6,389.00 | $25,556.00 | $7,249.60 | $28,998.40 | $26,792.00 | $5,175.00 | $10,350.00 | $6,888.00 [$27,552.00| No Bid
3) 1 |Onsite Training in Huntsville, AL $125.00 $250.00 no charge | nocharge | $2,500.00 | no charge | no charge $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Hrs. 2 hr 8 hr 4-6 hrs 4
4) 1 |Freight $0.00 $0.00 $591.00 $591.00 $580.00 | nocharge | no charge $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Total $44,827.00 $51,373.85 | $49,363.35 $41,460.00 $48,252.00| No Bid
FOB Fairport,NY Beaverton, OR UAH UAH UAH
Net 30 days Net 30 days
TERMS ARO upon approval Net 30 Net 30
WARRANTY 3 years 3 year
8 weeks 4-6 weeks DP02014B: 7-ASAP, 5 4/8,
ESTIMATED DELIVERY ft d AR 55/13, 6-8 weeks
Glslr elel=) 0 MDO4024C:SAOD -2ASAP
YOUR REFERENCE NO. 16032103 29665585
QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 30 days 30 days 4/23/2016
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB LB
Newark DPO2014B-7 does not meet the 12Mpoints (1M) memory and the Waveform Capture rate up to 30,000 wfms/s (5,000). PKH
MDO04024C.SAO does not meet the 140Mpts (20M) specifications. 03/30/2016

The bid is awarded total low to Saelig as the apparent lowest responsible bidder, meeting specifications.




