
Oscilloscope  and 

Accessories(B002408) Entest, Inc.

Continental 

Resources Entest, Inc.
Test Equity Newark Mouser

Allied 

Electronics
Microlease

Business 

Services

Mesa 

Capital 

Item Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

MDO4024C MDO4024C MDO4024C

1) 1
Tektronix Oscilloscope 

MDO4024C.SA6
$5,438.50 $9,675.00 $5,438.50 $9,310.00 $8,550.00 $12,900.00 $9,675.00 $5,256.00 $12,599.98 $9,460.00

2) 1 MDO4MSO Logic Analyzer $2,235.00 $2,250.00 $2,235.00 $2,100.00 $1,988.37 $3,000.00 $2,185.00 $2,160.00 $2,859.98 $2,140.00

*DP04BND-

promo free

3) 1 DPO4AERO
*included in  

item 8

*included in 

item 8 $1,236.70 $1,079.00 $0.00 $1,660.00 $1,260.00 $1,195.20 $1,579.98 $1,045.00

4) 1
MDO4AFG Arbitray 

Function Generator
$596.00 $750.00 $596.00 $650.00 $662.79 $1,000.00 $768.00 $720.00 $949.98 $715.00

*DP04BND-

promo free

5) 1 DPO4COMP
*included in  

item 8

*included in 

item 8
$1,117.50 $975.00

$0.00
$1,500.00 $1,135.00 $1,080.00 $1,429.98 $100.00

6) 1 DPO4ENET
*included in  

item 8

*included in 

item 8
$1,236.70 $1,079.00

$0.00
$1,660.00 $1,250.00 $1,195.20 $1,579.98 $1,045.00

7) 1 DPO4EMBD
*included in  

item 8

*included in 

item 8
$1,117.50 $975.00

$0.00
$1,500.00 $1,130.00 $1,080.00 $1,429.98 $100.00

DP04BND DP04BND
*DP04BND-

promo free

8) 1 DPO4AUTO $2,905.50 $2,925.00 $1,117.50 $975.00 $0.00 $1,500.00 $1,135.00 $1,080.00 $1,429.98 $0.00

9) 1 MDO4024C R5 warranty $1,326.10 $1,335.00 $1,326.10 $1,513.00 $1,691.00 $2,116.42 $1,350.00 $1,281.60 $1,889.98 $1,263.00

101A 101A 101A 101A 101A

10) 1 4 Probe Set $324.50 $236.00 $324.50 $221.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $265.00 $739.98 $295.00

150A 150A 150A 150A

11) 1 150A AMPLIFIER  $577.50 $420.00 $577.50 $393.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $498.00 $559.98 $515.00
110A 110A 110A 110A 112A

12) 1 CABLE $49.50 $36.00 $49.50 $33.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.00 $89.98 $43.00

0309-0001 0309-0001 0309-0001 0309-0001

13) 1 ADAPTER $20.90 $15.00 $20.90 $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $39.98 $19.00

14) N/A Freight To UAH $0.00 $225.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $150.00 $62.00 $0.00 free $22.00

 Total $13,473.50 $17,867.00 $16,393.90 $19,318.75 $12,892.16 $26,986.42 $19,950.00 $15,872.00 $27,179.74 $16,762.00
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Notes

*DP04BND is a 

bundle with 10 

software 

DP04AERO, 

DP04auto, 

DP04Comp, 

DP04Enet, 

DP04EMBD, 

DP04ENet, 

DP04LMT, 

DP04PWR, 

DP04 USB, 

DP04VID

*DP04BND is a 

bundle includes 

above 5 pieces 

DP04AERO, 

DP04Auto, 

DP04Comp, 

DP04Enet, 

DP04EMBD, 

FREE *items 

3,4,5,6,7,8, 

DP04BND-

promo is a 

bundle with 10 

software 

DP04AERO, 

DP04auto, 

DP04Comp, 

DP04Enet, 

DP04EMBD, 

DP04ENet, 

DP04LMT, 

DP04PWR, 

DP04 USB, 

DP04VID

Includes 

Raspberry 

PI-Mini 

computer

FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH 

TERMS Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 N 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 N 30 

WARRANTY 3 year, 1year
New factory 

warranty
3 year, 1year 3 years

3 years on 

MDO4000C 

and 1 year on 

probes covers 

all parts and 

labor 

90 days 

(Mouser)

3 years Standard             

5 years Extended 

3-years 

manufacturer
1 year

5 year return to 

Tektonix 

ESTIMATED DELIVERY 4 weeks 3-4 weeks 4 weeks
 4 weeks APO 

at longest
3 days ARO, 6 weeks 6 weekr 10-12 ARO 3 week ARO

YOUR REFERENCE 

NO.
ENTQ9996 20142958 ENTQ9995 29486349 Q8057D4 1000966273 RUNQ63194

QUOTATION 

EFFECTIVE UNTIL 3/31/2016 4/1/2016 3/31/2016 14-Mar-16 March 1, 2016 2/25/2016 4/11/2016 30 days 21-Feb-17 3-Apr-16

BUSINESS SB WB SB SB LB LB LB SB SB

PKH 

03/11/2016

Entest, Inc. and Microlease quoted only on the oscilloscope and not the spectrum analyzer (SA6). Newark only quote 1-9 and  

Mesa Capital Company did not quote item 8.                                                                     

The bid is awarded total low to Continental Resources as the apparent lowest responsible bidder, meeting 

specifications.


