
B002466

INLINE GRAYBAR WESCO CUMBERLAND DISTRIBUTORS DISCOUNT LIGHT DEPOT/MCOR

LIGHTING SUPPLIES (Part A)

1 BALLAST ELECTRONIC FOR T8 3-4 LAMP 120/277V #B432IUNVHPA $11.50 $9.75 $10.25 $15.58 $10.73

2 BALLAST GE 232-MVPS-N 120/277V 2 LAMP $9.50 $11.68 $10.25 $14.20 $8.13

3 BALLAST GE-332-MVPS-N 120/277V 3 LAMP $10.50 $13.26 $12.75 $15.42 $9.43

4 BALLAST GE-432 MVPS-N 120/277V 4 LAMP $11.50 $14.67 $13.75 $18.70 $10.73

5 BULB FLUORESCENT GE F32T8/841/PRO/EC $1.88 $1.32 $1.60 $2.35 $1.29

6 BULB FLUORESCENT GE F13DBX/841/ECO4P $1.48 $2.61 $1.60 $3.55 $1.24

7 BULB INCADESCENT WEST 65BR30/FL $1.00 $1.21 $0.96 $1.63 $0.78

8 BULB FLUORESCENT GE F13BX/841/ECO $1.45 $1.36 $1.45 $1.18 $1.03

9 BULB FLUORESCENT GE F26DBX/841/ECO4P $1.75 $3.04 $1.78 $4.96 $1.37

10 BULB FLUORESCENT GE F32T8SP41/U6/ECO $7.00 $4.90 $5.40 $7.15 $4.55

11 BULB FLUORESCENT GE F39W/T5/841/ECO $8.51 $3.80 $3.60 $6.25 $1.89

12 BULB METAL HALIDE 400W 120/277V 4000K MOG BASE $7.48 $7.99 $7.82 $8.75 $7.28

13 BULB METAL HALIDE 175W  120/277V 4000K MED BASE $8.69 $10.90 $7.82 $8.80 $6.50

14 BULB HID ven MPI1000/BU OR EQUAL $25.42 $31.52 $32.00 $16.78 $20.48

15 BULB FLUORESCENT 25W 85 CRI OR GREATER T8 2P 48" $1.71 $2.50 $2.10 $2.40 $1.63

16 BULB FLUORESCENT 28W 85 CRI OR GREATER T8 2P 48" $1.41 $2.16 $2.10 $1.71 $1.76

17 BULB FLUORESCENT 32W 85 CRI OR GREATER T8 2P 48" $1.88 $2.00 $1.50 $2.35 $1.29

18 BULB FLUORESCENT 3-TUBE 26W 130V 4-PIN 1-SLOT $1.77 $3.04 $2.50 $7.44 $2.02

19 BULB FLUORESCENT CW 17W 120V T8  2 PIN 24" $1.34 $2.07 $1.50 $2.95 $1.34

20 BULB FLUORESCENT MULTI-TUBE 13W 4-PIN 2-SLOT $1.50 $2.61 $1.55 $3.55 $1.24

21 BULB FLUORESCENT MULTI TUBE 26W 130V 2-PIN 1-SLOT $1.53 $3.04 $1.70 $4.61 $1.37

22 BULB FLUORESCENT 32W 75 CRI OR GREATER T8 2P 48" $1.88 $1.32 $1.50 $2.35 $1.29

23 BULB FLUORESCENT MULTI TUBE 32W 130V 4-PIN S-SLOT $3.01 $4.08 $3.15 $7.44 $2.41

24 BULB FLUORESCENT TWIN TUBE 13W 130V 2-PIN 2-SLOT $1.47 $1.36 $1.55 $1.18 $0.98

25 BULB INCADESCENT 52W 130V A19 MED BASE $0.20 $2.50 $0.38 $0.42 $0.46

26 BULB INCADESCENT 75W 130V A19 MED BASE $0.20 $0.90 $0.69 $0.64 $0.46

27 BULB INCADESCENT FLOOD 120W 130V R40 MED BASE $1.00 $4.32 $3.35 $14.23 $2.54

28 BULB INCADESCENT FLOOD 150W MED BASE $1.78 $4.32 $1.48 $14.23 No Bid

29 BULB INCADESCENT FLOOD 65W PAR30 130V MED $1.00 $7.61 $2.75 $1.63 $2.80

30 BULB METAL HALIDE 100W 120/277V MED BASE $8.95 $16.30 $7.80 $12.10 $7.28

31 BULB METAL HALIDE 175W 120/277V BT28MOG BASE $7.37 $9.38 $7.80 $8.25 $6.83

32 BULB METAL HALIDE 250W 120/277 BT28 MOG BASE $8.15 $9.38 $7.80 $8.25 $6.50

33 BULB QUARTZ 250W SCREW IN CLEAR $1.35 $3.90 $1.30 $2.07 $1.50

34 BULB HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM 1000W 120/277V MOG BASE $18.84 $21.34 $18.90 $19.54 $19.31

35 BULB HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM 100W 120/277V MOG BASE $6.00 $8.70 $5.50 $9.08 $4.10

36 BULB HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM 100W 120/277V MED BASE $6.00 $8.80 $5.50 $10.18 $3.86

37 BULB HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM 150W 120/277V MOG BASE $6.60 $6.70 $5.50 $9.08 $4.10

38 BULB HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM 250W 120/277 MOG BASE $6.60 $7.22 $5.50 $9.08 $5.03

39 BULB HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM 70W 10/277V MED BASE $5.58 $8.78 $5.50 $9.08 $3.86

40 BULB HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM 100W B17 MEDIUM BASE $5.56 $8.80 $5.50 $10.18 $3.86

$210.34 $271.14 $215.43 $299.32 $173.25

LIGHTING & ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES



ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES (Part B)

INLINE GRAYBAR WESCO CUMBERLAND DISCOUNT LIGHT DEPOT

1 CONDUIT FLEX, 3/8 ALUMINUM 12/2 IMC 250' ROLL $0.31 $0.33 $0.13 $0.35 No Bid

2 CONNECTOR BOX FLEX CONDUIT SETSCREW AL. 3/8 $0.37 $0.44 $0.60 $0.39 No Bid

3 ELECTRICAL METALIC TUBING 1/2" $0.23 $0.25 $0.24 $0.28 No Bid

4 ELECTRICAL METALIC TUBING 3/4" $0.40 $0.43 $0.42 $0.48 No Bid

5 ELECTRICAL METALIC TUBING CONN 1/2" STEEL $0.07 $0.12 $0.10 $0.09 No Bid

6 ELECTRICAL METALIC TUBING CONN 3/4" STEEL $0.13 $0.19 $0.15 $0.15 No Bid

7 HANDY BOX STAINLESS STEEL 1/2" $0.51 $0.96 $0.65 $0.86 No Bid

8 JUNCTION BOX 1/2 &3/4 "KNOCK OUT, 1-1/2" DEEP 4" SQUARE $0.47 $0.59 $0.50 $0.48 No Bid

9 PHOTOCELL TORK , INTERMATIC #K4121, 120V 1800W $6.80 $8.12 $9.30 $9.32 No Bid

10 PHOTOCELL TORK 208/277V 2000W TUNGSTEN 4123 $6.72 $10.29 $20.60 $12.06 No Bid

11 PLATE COVER BLANK 4" STAINLESS STEEL $0.17 $0.26 $0.18 $0.20 No Bid

12 PLATE COVER RECEP 1 GANG IVORY $0.18 $0.18 $0.18 $0.21 No Bid

13 PLATE COVER RECEP 1 GANG STAINLESS STEEL $0.60 $0.88 $0.64 $0.87 No Bid

14 PLATE COVER RECEP 1 GANG WHITE $0.18 $0.18 $0.18 $0.21 No Bid

15 PLATE COVER SWITCH 1 GANG IVORY $0.18 $0.18 $0.18 $0.23 No Bid

16 PLATE COVER SWITCH 1 GANG WHITE $0.18 $0.18 $0.18 $0.23 No Bid

17 RECEPT DUPLEX, 20A 120V, GREY-LEVITON OR EQUAL $1.02 $1.04 $1.00 $1.38 No Bid

18 RECEPT DUPLEX, 20A 120V, IVORY-LEVITON OR EQUAL $1.02 $1.04 $1.00 $1.08 No Bid

19 RECEPT DUPLEX, 20A 120V, WHITE- LEVITON OR EQUAL $1.02 $1.04 $1.00 $1.08 No Bid

20 SWITCH TOGGLE, 20A 1P 120/277V IVORY-LEVITON OR EQUAL $1.50 $1.64 $1.50 $1.60 No Bid

21 SWITCH TOGGLE, 20A 1P 120/277V WHITE-LEVITON OR EQUAL $1.50 $1.64 $1.50 $1.60 No Bid

22 WIRE CORD S/O INSULATED #12/3 BLACK $0.59 $0.55 $0.64 $0.89 No Bid

23 W-MOLD V-700 IVORY RACEWAY $0.96 $0.96 $1.06 $1.08 No Bid

24 W-MOLD V-700 BOXES DEEP $12.38 $12.63 $14.10 $13.47 No Bid

25 W-MOLD V-700 BOXES SHALLOW $5.30 $4.39 $4.91 $4.96 No Bid

26 W-MOLD V-700 BOXES THUMBNAIL $4.39 $4.75 $10.68 $2.92 No Bid

27 W-MOLD V-700 STRAP $0.34 $0.35 $0.39 $0.39 No Bid

28 W-MOLD V-700 ELBOW $1.73 $1.29 $1.45 $1.47 No Bid

29 3/8" ONE HOLE STRAP $0.07 $0.05 $0.08 $0.04 No Bid

30 1/2" ONE HOLE STRAP $0.03 $0.06 $0.08 $0.03 No Bid

31 3/4" ONE HOLE STRAP $0.05 $0.08 $0.10 $0.05 No Bid

32 3/8" STAND OFF STRAP $0.14 $0.19 $0.35 $0.13 No Bid

33 1/2" STAND OFF STRAP $0.14 $0.19 $0.35 $0.13 No Bid

34 3/4 STAND OFF STRAP $0.15 $0.20 $0.36 $1.19 No Bid

35 BLACK ELECTRICAL TAPE 3/4" X 66' $0.72 $0.70 $0.90 $0.70 No Bid

36 STEEL CITY CY 1/2 SWITCH BOX, GANGABLE, 3 1/2 "DEEP, CONDUIT KNOCKOUTS, EARS$1.06 $1.71 $2.00 $1.37 No Bid

37 STEEL CITY CY 1/2 SWITCH BOX, GANGABLE, 3 " DEEP, CONDUIT KNOCKOUTS EARS$1.06 $1.71 $2.00 $1.43 No Bid

$52.68 $59.79 $79.68 $63.40 NO BID 

DISCOUNT OFF LIGHTING NOT LISTED 20.00% 25.00% 65.00% ? 40.00%

DISCOUNT OFF ELECTRICAL NOT LISTED 20.00% 25.00% 65.00% ? 40.00%

TERMS 30 DAYS 30 DAYS 30 DAYS 30-45 days

DELIVERY STOCK 1 DAY STOCK - 3 DAYS STOCK - 24 HRS 2-3 days 3-days

SPECIAL ORDER

1 TO 3 DAYS

QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 1 YEAR 9/30/2017 11/2/2017 2017

BUSINESS CLASS SB ? LB

eVERIFY eVERIFY eVERIFY  eVERIFY  eVERIFY

PRIMARY VENDOR 

BID AWARDED TO INLINE LIGHTING for Part A and Part B

AS THE LOWEST VENDOR  MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

SECONDARY VENDORS

SECONDARY VENDOR IS WESCO for Part A - LIGHTING

SECONDARY VENDOR IS GRAYBAR for Part B - ELECTRICAL 11/11/2016 JUDY CURTIS

AS THE LOWEST VENDORS  MEETING SPECIFICATIONS


