
2017-2018 SPRING TRACK & FIELD CHARTER BUSES (B002530)

CLINE TOURS
CAPITAL 

TRAILWAYS

CAMELOT BUS 

CHARTERS SPIRIT COACH

GRAY LINE OF 

TENNESSEE

COAST TO 

COAST*

ITEM TRACK & FIELD DESTINATION

LINE ITEMS 3 AND 9 HAVE BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID

1 1/13/2018 Birmingham, AL 1,673.00$         670.00$           1,025.00$      1,402.00$       2,635.00$       N/A

2 1/21/2018 Birmingham, AL 1,673.00$         670.00$           1,025.00$      1,073.00$       2,938.00$       N/A

3 1/26/18 - 1/28/18 Lynchburg, VA 8,066.00$         3,190.00$        3,175.00$      4,495.00$       6,705.00$       N/A

4 2/8/18 - 2/9/18 Emerson, GA 2,164.00$         1,480.00$        1,644.00$      2,200.00$       2,690.00$       N/A

5 3/16/18 - 3/17/18 Memphis, TN 3,031.00$         No Bid 1,780.00$      2,200.00$       3,035.00$       N/A

6 3/23/18 - 3/24/18 Starksville, MS 2,839.00$         No Bid 1,700.00$      2,200.00$       2,900.00$       N/A

7 3/30/2018 Birmingham, AL 1,921.00$         No Bid 1,025.00$      1,073.00$       2,560.00$       N/A

8 4/6/18 - 4/7/18 Bowling Green, KY 2,650.00$         1,480.00$        2,350.00$      2,200.00$       2,900.00$       N/A

9 4/13/18 - 4/14/18 Auburn, AL 3,331.00$         No Bid 2,400.00$      2,590.00$       3,315.00$       N/A

10 4/18/18 -4/21/18 Clinton, MS 5,128.00$         3,200.00$        3,675.00$      5,000.00$       5,600.00$       N/A

TOTAL 21,079.00$      7,500.00$        14,224.00$   17,348.00$     25,258.00$     

BID REC'D 

LATE*

FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH

TERMS Net 30 30 Days Net 30 DAYS Net 30 N/A

WARRANTY N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

ESTIMATE DELIVERY N/A N/A N/A N/A 11/17/2017

CHANGE FEE $0.00 $750.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

YOUR REFERENCE N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

QUOTATION EFF UNTIL N/A 11/17/2017 N/A 11/30/2017 12/1/2017

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB SB SB         SB                    LB

This Bid has been Awarded by Line Item Low to Capital Trailways and Camelot Bus Charters 

as the bidders who met the Bid Specifications.

Capital Trailways - Line Items 1, 2, 4, 8 and 10.

Camelot Bus Services - Line Items 5, 6 and 7.

Line Items 3 and 9 have been removed from the Bid.

EMP: 12/1/17


