ATHLETIC TURF-SOFTBALL FIELD

(B002473)
WARNERS ATHLETIC PRORAIN KORMAG, LLC.
(GROUP A) CONST. COMPANY
PRICING SUMMARY: UAH TO SELECT ONE OPTION BELOW
PRICING LIST
1) Turf Option #1: Shaw Sports Turf Elevate 48w/8mm Pad $18,458.00 NO BID $21,935.00
2) Turf Option #2: Go Green Double w/5mmIPad I I $16,927.00 NO BID $19,050.00
3) Turf Option #3: Go Green Double w/3mm Pad I I $15,560.00 NO BID $17,860.00
4) Turf Option #4: Shaw Sports Turf Elevate !18 —No Pa(li I $12,209.00 NO BID $15,700.00
5) Turf Option #5: Go Green Double — No Pald | | $12,045.00 NO BID $14,830.00
TOTAL $75,199.00 NO BID $89,375.00

(GROUP B)
TOTAL TURF PREP COSTS

3 EACH (RELOCATION OF EXISTING SPRINKLERS) $250.00 $300.00 NO BID

3, 033 SF ESCAVATION OF 4” INFIELD MIIX | $2,500.00 $1,516.50 NO BID

3, 033 SF LASER AND TAMP FOR TURF I | $650.00 $454.95 NO BID

220 LF INSTALLATION OF TREATED 4” XI4” NAILER |NAILER $600.00 $1,320.00 NO BID

214 LF INSTALLATION OF TREATED 2” XI4” NAILER $600.00 $1,284.00 NO BID

3,600 SF INSTALLATION OF FILTER FABRIIC | $350.00 $900.00 NO BID

56 TN 4” #78 WASHED GRAVEL I | $1,250.00 $1,680.00 NO BID

INSTALLATION OF GRAVEL I | $1,850.00 $1,112.10 NO BID

1 LS MATERIAL (4 X 4, 2 X 4, FABRIC, DOIWEL, ANCHORS) $1,200.00 $825.00 NO BID

TOTAL $9,250.00 $9,392.55 NO BID
BID AWARDED TO WARNERS AS THE
LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING TOTAL GROUP A & B $84,449.00

ALL SPECIFICATIONS ON GROUP A and B
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