
Carolina 

Biological 

Supply

Nasco Frey Scientific
ETA 

hand2mind

Item Qty Description Unit cost Unit cost Unit cost Unit cost

1 ANIMAL STUDIES:

UHAS1LC LC00796 86060
Card #1 16 Dwarf African Frogs 574389 pk/3 $16.84

32 Elodea Sprigs or substitute
270-3425 pk/36 

$24.40
Card #1 Total 89.50 $94.00 $1,050.24 104.19

972400BLC LC00797 532187 pk/3 86061
Card #2 16 Fiddler Crabs, (8 male, 8 female) $18.52

Card #2 Total 72.50 75.00 $296.32 103.48

 UHAS3LC LC01005 596907 st/24 86062

Card #3 16 Millipedes $145.31

3 Moss Mats no bid

Card #3 Total 52.00 80.00 2,325.00 114.45

part of #3 LC01017 528984 86063

Card #4 3 Gymnosperm 233.51
Card #4 Total 0.00 24.00 700.53 29.68

Plant Kingdom 

Survey 

Total Cards #1, #2, #3, and #4 214.00 249.00 4,372.10 351.80

2 DYNAMICS OF ECOSYSTEMS:
972800ALC LC01024 86064

Card #1 44 Elodea Sprigs or substitute
270-3425 pk/36  

$24.40

1 Pack of 330 Duckweed Plants 563527 $7.60

4 Algae Mix, Jar 563608 pk/30 $42.04
30 Pond Snails 563839 pk/12 13.48
30 Gambusia/Mosquito Fish no bid

Card #1 Total 77.25 $85.00 $1,653.76 116.35
972800BLC LC00800 86065

Card #2 30 Crickets 563869 pk/150 $52.12

30 Isopods/Pill Bugs 532199 pk/30 $10.96

Card #2 Total 51.75 $32.50 1892.24 52.68

Total Cards #1  and #2 129.00 117.50 3,546.20 169.03

3
INVESTIGATING BIODIVERSITY AND 

INTERDEPENDENCE:
STL2141000LC

Card #1 2 WOW Bugs (Melittobia digitata), N/A No bid

1 Black worms (Lumbriculus variegatus), No bid

1 Pack of 225 Duckweed (Lemna minor) 563527 $7.60

Card #1 Total 56.95 No Bid $7.60 No BID
STL5143000LC LC01025 86067

Card #2 12 Elodea Sprigs or substitute
270-3425 pk/36 

$24.40

1 Algae, Collected Spirogyra 563593 pk/30 $8.44

Card #2 Total 28.95 30.25 301.24 41.71
STL914400L LC01021 86068

Card #3 1 Protozoa, Amoeba Proteus Culture 563737 pk/30 $8.44

1 Protozoa, Euglena Jar Culture 564145 pk/30 $8.44

1 Protozoa, Paramecium Multi Culture 563782 pk/30 $8.44

1 Algae, Volvox Globator, Jar 563599 pk/30 $8.44
Card #3 Total 38.25 $67.85 $33.76 60.26

UHBD4LC LC01023 86069
Card #4 1 Black worms (Lumbriculus variegatus), No bid

1 L565-Daphnia 563917 $26.92
1 L55-Hydra 563956 &12.64

AMSTI Living Material Letters (B002449)



1 L51C-Daphnia Food, 4-oz 563440 $10.96
Card #4 Total 31.00 $53.00 50.52 79.77

Total Cards #1, #2, #3, and #4 155.15 151.10 393.12 181.74
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4 STUDYING THE DEVELOPMENT 

STL5143000LC LC01007 86070
Card #1 1 Algae, Collected, Spirogyra culture 563593 pk/30 $8.44

12 Elodea Sprigs or substitute
270-3425 pk/36 

$24.44

1 Pack of 225 Duckweed (Lemna minor) 563527 $7.61

Card #1 Total 28.95 $45.00 308.85 44.94
STL6142000LC No BID

Card #2 8 Brassica Butterfly Eggs N/A
270-1610 pk/25 

$60.47

Card #2 Total 28.95 No Bid 483.76

Total Cards #1 and  #2 57.90 45.00 44.94

5 WILD ORGANISMS:
971100C LC00795 86071

Card #1 16 Pill Bugs 563986 pk/25 $16.84

8 Millipedes or Bess Beetles 596907 st/24 $145.31

Card #1 Total 62.00 67.95 162.15 70.19
971100B LC00794 86072

Card #2 18 Guppies (9 male, 9 female) 563893 pk/12  $13.48

1 Aquatic Snails 563839 pk/12  $13.48

Card #2 Total 51.75 $52.95 $242.64 80.81
971100A LC00793 86073

Card #3 9 Elodea Sprigs or substitute
270-3425 pk/36 

$24.40

7 Gymnosperm-Tree Seedlings 20-4083 $43.64

7 Cabomba 563536 pk/12 $11.80

4 Moss Mats no bid

Card #3 Total 51.75 $109.25 $607.68 68.18

Total Cards #1, #2, and #3 165.50 230.15 2,282.22 219.18

6 PLANTS AND ANIMALS:

511012ALC LC01018 86074

Card #1 1 Succulent Plant 1494626 $20.99

1 Polypodium 563677 $11.80

1 Pine Seeding 1288614 $33.59

1 Coleus 532164 $10.12

Card #1 Total 53.35 $35.00 $76.50 79.42

511012BLC LC01019 86075

Card #2 2 Zebrafish, unsexed, pk 2

12 Mike weed Bugs Adults

Card #2 Total 82.25 $38.00 $0.00 54.74

Total Cards #1, and #2 135.60 73.00 76.50 134.16

7 HERIDITERY & DIVERSITY

SMC593LC LC01020 86076

Card #1 12 Crayfish (Male and Female)
598068 pail of 10 

$14.27

12 Elodea Sprigs or substitute
270-3425 pk/36 

$24.40

Card #1 Total 59.95 $67.00 464.04 92.32



Grand Totals 917.10 932.75 11,926.72 1,193.17
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hand2mind

Description

FOB UAH UAH UAH

Terms Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30

Warranty

Visit our website for 

warranty

no warranty 

coverage 

Estimated delivery

coupon Immediately                  

3-4 week redemption

3-4 weeks after 

redemption of your 

card.

two weeks 

from receipt 

of PO

Reference number
23312

B8id # 7781456582

See pricing 

document

Quotation effective until 30-Sep-17 8/18/16 to 12/31/16
10/1/2016-

9/30/2017
Business classification Corporation LB ED

8/24/2016

PKHThe bid is awarded by total low to Carolina Biological Supply Company as the apparent 

lowest responsible bidder, meeting specifications. 


