Scientific Misc. Parts (B002411) Fisher Scientific School Specialty, Inc. Nasco
Item | Qty [Description Unit Price | Line Total Part # Unit Price | Line Total | Part # | Unit Price
1) | 6 [PASPORT Absolute Pressure Sensor, PS-2107 | $80.40 | $482.40 |sS9824313ND| $81.99 | $491.94 [ 1526593 No Bid
2) | 6 [Basic Calorimetry Set, TD-8557A no Bid $0.00 $46.99 | $281.94 | 532018
3 7 |Partial Immersion Thermometers, SE-9084B $15.53 $108.71 13-201-604 | $13.00 $91.00 1017400
4 6 |PASPORT Temperature Sensor, PS2125 $27.27 | $163.62 |[s9824331ND| $31.99 | $191.94 | 1526586
5 6 |Electrical Equivalent of Heat apparatus, TD-8552| no Bid $0.00 no Bid $0.00
6 6 |Heavy-duty Ammeter, SF-9569A $20.66 $123.96 S77860A $11.19 $67.14 584736
7 6 |Heavy-duty Voltmeter, SF-9568A $21.04 | $126.24 S77813A $11.19 $67.14 584709
1 set
8 1 [Banana plug cord sets, 30cm, SE-7123 $2.90 $23.20 595888 $9.79 $9.79 574245
1 set pack 5
9 1 |Alligator clip adapters SE-9756 $1.29 $12.90 $95302 $2.09 $2.09 595818
60 min.
10 | 25 [Light Bulbs set # 14 25 pack, EM8627 $2.43 $145.80 $43905 $2.79 $69.75 563636
11 | 25 [Light Bulbs sockets 10 pack, EM-8630 $0.84 $21.00 S12990 $6.29 $157.25 | 563603
30 min.
12 | 15 [Batteries “D” 4 pack, PI-6602 $3.68 $110.40 543923 $3.49 $52.35 595612
13 | 6 [Power Amplifier Il, (Mac and Win), CI-6552A | $199.00 | $1,194.00 | S15958ND | no Bid $0.00
14 | 6 [Voltage Sensor, unshrouded, UI-5100 $42.44 $254.64 | S982437ND | $38.99 | $233.94 | 1526584
15 | 6 [Voltage-Current Sensors, Cl-6556 $42.44 | $254.64 | s982436ND | $38.99 | $233.94 | 1526585
16 | 6 [RLC Circuit, CI-6512 $227.91 | $1,367.46 S07839 $100.79| $604.74 575322
17 | 6 [Decade Resistance Box, SE-7124 $83.26 $499.56 S96527 no Bid $0.00
20 pack
18 | 8 [Liquid-Filled Compasses 5 pack, EM-8631A | $31.21 | $124.84 S43152 $3.49 $27.92 263430
24 pack
19 | 6 [Meter Sticks, 6 pack, SE-8827 $46.73 $140.19 S40625 $2.30 $13.80 81902
20 | 6 |Alnico Bar Magnets 2 packs, EM-8620 $20.09 | $120.54 $90340 $16.09 $96.54 [131-7347
21 | 10 |Extech DC Power Supply 18V, 3A, SE-8828 | $213.65 | $2,136.50 S441853 no Bid $0.00
22 | 20 |USB Link, PS-2100A $42.36 $847.20 |S9824345ND| $39.99 | $799.80 | 1526632
23 | 10 |Force Sensors, PS-2104 $128.00 | $1,280.00 | S98143 9ND | $108.99 | $1,089.90 | 1526594
24 | 10 |Open Speaker, WA-9900 no Bid $0.00 no Bid $0.00
25 | 10 |Function Generator, PI-8127 $276.03 | $2,760.30 S96563 $399.99 | $3,999.90 | 594651
26 | 2 |Microwave Transmitter, WA-9801 no Bid $0.00 no Bid $0.00
27 | 2 |Microwave Receiver, WA-9800A no Bid $0.00 no Bid $0.00
28 | 4 |HE-NE Laser, SE-9449A $518.08 | $2,072.32 S427151 | $489.99 | $1,959.96 | 1411464
29 | 6 |SE-8830 Hot Plate $154.03 | $924.18 S97266 $129.49| $776.94 528332
Shipping $0.00 free
Total $15,294.60 $11,319.71
FOB UAH UAH
TERMS Net 30 Net 30 Days
WARRANTY
ESTIMATED DELIVERY S 7-30 days ARO
YOUR REFERENCE NO. e?(l)g;gg;g-lllé 7780392642
3/29/16-
QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 4/27/2016 12/31/16
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION LB LB




The bid is awarded by line items low to Fisher Scientific for line items 1, 4, 11, 13, 17, 21, and 25 and School
Specialty, Inc. on items 3, 6-10, 12, 14-16, 18-20, 22, 23, 28, and 29 as the apparent lowest responsible bidder.
Iltems 5, 24, 26, and 27 are no award.
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