
Printing of the Professional and 

Continuing Studies Term 

Catalog B002464

Sauers 

Group

Action 

Printing

PWI 

Printing EP Graphics

Indiana 

Printing and 

Publishing 

Company Inc.

Advance 

Central 

services

Walker 

360

First Class 

Printing 

Inc.

Just Rite 

Printing

Item Description Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Total 

Price

Total 

Price

Total 

Price

 1)   

Base price, catalog printing, 24 

interior pages w/4 page 4-color 

cover Qty 50,000 $7,752.51 $7,455.19 $9,508.00 $7,491.00 $7,922.00 $13,665.00 No bid No bid No bid

 2)   

Base price , catalog printing, 24 

interior pages w/4 page 2-color 

cover Qty 50,000 $7,710.07 $7,353.19 $9,508.00 $7,355.00 $8,147.00 $13,665.00 No bid No bid No bid

 3)    

Base price , catalog printing, 32 

interior pages w/4 page  4-color 

cover Qty 50,000 $8,450.91 $8,012.74 $10,158.00 $8,225.00 $8,758.00 $15,240.00 No bid No bid No bid

4)                                                                        

Base price ,  catalog printing, 32 

interior pages w/4 page 2-color 

cover Qty 50,000 $8,437.12 $7,910.74 $10,158.00 $8,088.00 $9,010.00 $15,240.00 No bid No bid No bid

5)

Base price per 1000 mail 

handling  Print and/or affix 

labels, sort, and sack 3rd class, 

class, carrier route labels 

generated by vendor. $15.00 $18.00 $1,125.00 $15.00 Included $55.95 No bid No bid No bid

$750.00 $900.00 $750.00 $2,797.50

6)

Addition/Subtraction of 4 page 

body increments. $1,200.00

$-185.00  

+$1,600.00 $1,060.00 $939.00 $373.00

$-867.00  

+$2,283.00 No bid No bid No bid
8 page +8/-8 page 

7) Addition/charge for Bleed? No charge No charge No charge N/A Included $0.00 No bid No bid No bid

8) Addition/charge for varnish? $750.00 No charge No charge $650.00 $360.00 $0.00 No bid No bid No bid
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9)

Addition/Subtraction of 1,000 

copy increments $175.00

$124.00 for 

24 pages 

$134.00 for 

32 pages 

$153.00 for 

24 pages 

$165.00 for 

32 pages $137.02 $59.00

$-253.00  

+$230.00 No bid No bid No bid

10) Addition charge for half tones? No charge No charge No charge N/A Included $450.00 No bid No bid No bid

11)

Shipping/freight charges for 

delivery to Huntsville, AL $750.00 $940.00 $150.00 $770.00 Included $280.00 No bid No bid No bid

12) Additional Costs

set-up to 

Inkjet 

addresses 

$75.00 NA

Ms $153.00 

28 pages

Alerations 

$20.00/page

Postage  

Variable with 

each mailing

Delivery to 

Huntsville 

Post Office 

$400.00

Ms $165.00 

36 pages

Additional 

expenses 

incurred not 

defined in bid 

TBD

Totals includes mail handling 

and shipping

*1

Totals includes 24 pgs 4 page 4-

color cover, 50,000 mail 

handling item 5, varnish.
$9,252.51 $9,295.19 $10,783.00 $9,011.00 $7,922.00 $16,742.50 No bid No bid No bid

*2

Totals includes 24 pgs  4 page 2-

color cover, 50,000 mail 

handling item 5, varnish. $9,210.07 $9,193.19 $10,783.00 $8,875.00 $8,147.00 $16,742.50 No bid No bid No bid

*3

Totals includes 32 pgs 4 page 4-

color cover,  50,000 mail 

handling item 5, varnish $9,950.91 $9,852.74 $11,433.00 $9,745.00 $8,758.00 $18,317.50 No bid No bid No bid
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*4 Totals includes 32 pgs 4 page  2- $9,937.12 $9,750.74 $11,433.00 $9,608.00 $9,010.00 $18,317.50 No bid No bid No bid

$38,350.61 $38,091.86 $44,432.00 $37,239.00 $33,837.00 $70,120.00

FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH
TERMS 30 days  Net 30 30 days  Net 30  Net 30 days

WARRANTY

no warranty 

coverage

Standard 

Manuf, 

Warranty

N/A

ESTIMATED DELIVERY
7-10 Days 2.5 weeks 12/1/2016

7-10 business 

Days

7 business days 

with proof 

approval

YOUR REFERENCE NO. 119608 N/A

QUOTATION EFFECTIVE 

UNTIL

60 days 7/1/2017 $42,947.00 90days 90 days

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB LB N/A

10/4/2016 

PKH

The bid is awarded total low to Indiana Printing and Publishing Company 

Inc. as the apparent lowest responsible bidder, meeting specifications.


