Plastic Containers with attached lids (B002361)

Orbis

Item [Description Qty
Unit Price Total
FP 243 25.2"Lx15.5"Wx11.5"
1 [Plastic Gray Round Trip with attached Lid 20 $20.27 $405.40
Totes, Orbis FP-242, inside 25.3"L x 50 $20.27 $1,013.50
15.5"Wx11.5” clearances, # S-9745GR 100 $20.27 $2,027.00
200 $20.27 $4,054.00
250 $20.27 $5,067.50
2 |Plastic Gray Round Trip with attached Lid 20 $22.81 $456.20
Totes, Lewis FP-261, inside 50 $22.81 $1,140.50
22.5"L.x18"Wx11.5"clearances, 100 $22.81 $2,281.00
# S-9746GR 200 $22.81 $4,562.00
250 $22.81 $5,702.50
3 |Plastic Red Round Trip with attached Lid 20 no bid no bid
Totes, Lewis FP-261, inside 50 no bid no bid
22.5"Lx18"Wx11.5” clearances, # S-9746R 100 no bid no bid
200 no bid no bid
250 $22.81 $5,702.50
4 [Plastic Clear Round Trip with attached Lid, 20 no bid no bid
Totes, inside 22.5"Lx18"Wx11.5” 50 no bid no bid
clearances, # S-12679 100 no bid no bid
200 no bid no bid
250 no bid no bid
5 |Plastic Blue Round Trip with attached Lid, 20 no bid no bid
Totes, inside 22.5”Lx18”Wx11.5” clearances, 50 no bid no bid
# S-9746BLU 100 no bid no bid
200 no bid no bid
250 no bid no bid
6 |Plastic Blue Round Trip with attached Lid, 20 $12.12 $242.40
Totes, FP06 13.8”Lx8.9”Wx8.8” clearances, 50 $12.12 $606.00
# S-12676BLU 100 $12.12 $1,212.00
200 $12.12 $2,424.00
250 $12.12 $3,030.00
FP 243 25.2"Lx15.5"Wx11.5"
7 |Plastic Red Round Trip with attached Lid 20 $20.27 $405.40
Totes, Orbis FP-242, inside 50 $20.27 $1,013.50
25.3”L x 15.5”Wx11.5” clearances, # S-9745R 100 $20.27 $2,027.00
200 $20.27 $4,054.00
250 $20.27 $5,067.50
Setup Charges $500.00
From September 1, 2015 through August 31, 2016 no bid
From September 1, 2016 through August 31, 2017 no bid
Total $52,993.90
FOB UAH
TERMS FOL1 Collect
WARRANTY
ESTIMATED DELIVERY
YOUR REFERENCE NO. 170296.0
QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 9/17/2015
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION LB




Bid is a no award due to being over budget.

PKH 9/11/2015




