
Oscilloscope (B002350) Gapwireless
RDB 

Enterprises

Business 

Services

Allied 

Electronics
Newark Testequity 

Test 

Equipment
Microlease

Item Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Agilent 

MDOX4104A

1) 1

MDO4104B-6 Tektronix Mixed Domain Oscilloscope, 

1 GHZ analog channels 16 digital channels, 6 GHZ 

spectrum analyzer channel Certificate of traceable 

calibration standard 

$8,251.69 $24,700.00 $22,789.98 $17,005.54 $15,250.00 $19,275.00 $25,692.00 $15,570.00

DSOX4APPBNDL

2) 1

DPO4BND application Module Bundle module for 

MDO/MSO/DPO4000B and MDO4000 series 

includes DPO4AERO, DPO4AUDIO, DPO4AUTO, 

DPO4COMP, DPO4EMBD, DPO4ENET, DPO4LMT, 

DPO4PWR, DPO4USB, DPO4VID

$4,966.53 $4,400.00 $1,589.98 $0.02 $0.00 $0.00 $4,300.00
free with 

promotion

N9311X-100

3) 1 100C EMC Probe Beehive Electronics $1,375.85 $105.00 $139.98 no bid no bid $0.00 no bid $95.00
N9311X-541

4) 1
0309-0006 BNC Probe adapter Beehive 

Electronics
$20.80 $24.00 $59.98 no bid no bid $0.00 no bid $19.00

R-518-001-5F     

R-518-001-5Z
MDO4104B-R5 MDO4104B-R5 MDO4104B-R5 MDO4104B-R5

5) 1

Oscilloscope standard warranty, extended up to 5 

years and probes 1 year up to 3 years after 

purchase. Cover parts, labor and 2-day shipping 

within country. Guarantees faster repair coverage. All 

repairs include calibration and updates, Hassle free 

$1,380.89 $1,010.00 $1,069.98 $798.87 $716.40 $858.50 no bid $735.00

6) 1 Shipping and Handling included free $53.20 $45.00 $0.00 included free ground

 Total $15,995.76 $30,239.00 $25,649.90 $17,857.63 $16,011.40 $20,133.50 $29,992.00 $16,419.00

FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH 

TERMS Net 30 Net 10 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

WARRANTY 5 years 5 years one year 5 years 5 years 5 years 90 days Manufacturer

ESTIMATED DELIVERY 5 weeks ARO 3-5 weeks 7-14 ARO 6 weeks

1 week at 

receipt of order 10-14 days

complete 4 

weeks

YOUR REFERENCE NO. AAAQ12814 1000895649 028225339 Q342581 477749 RUNQ41240

QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 30 days 90 days 8/7/2015 8/20/2015 8/15/2015 1-Aug-15 31-Jul-15 1-Aug-15

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION LB SB SB SB

PKH 

07/16/2015

Gapwireless is quoting a Aglient oscilloscope.                                                                                                                                               

The bid is awarded to Newark as the apparent lowest responsible bidder, meeting specifications.


