HOCKEY EQUIPMENT (B002439)

GROUP A (WARRIOR |TEMS) WARRIOR SPORTS BSN SPORTS DULUTH HOCKEY CO. |SKATE WORLD, INC
EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom | ary UNIT  [EXTENDED cosT|uniT cosT  [UNIT cost UNITJcost
MEN'S SENIOR PRO STOCK DYNASTY,
COVERT, VARIOUS STOCK PATTERN, EA 500
1 GRIP AND FLEX INCLUDED INCLUDED ~ [NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID
MEN'S SENIOR, CUSTOMS WARRIOR 0
la SWAGGER GOAL STICKS EA 6 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
WARRIOR COVERT AX1/DYNASTY DT1
1b CUSTOM GLOVES PR 45 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
MEN'S SENTOR, VARIOUS SIZES,
CUSTOM PRO WARRIOR FRANCISE EA 4
1c CUSTOM HOCKEY PANTS " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK
WARRIOR SWAGGER CUSTOM GOAL EA 4
1d PANTS (GHPSWAS-BLACK) " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
EA 16
le WARRIOR GIRDLE " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1f WARRIOR GIRDLE SHELL EA 16 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1g NEW BALANCE FLEECE PANTS EA 40 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID
1h NEW BALANCE N TRANSIT QUARTER ZIp|  EA 50 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NO BID
EA 50
1i NEW BALANCE BASEBALL TECH HOODIE " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
NEW BALANCE 4040 COMP TOP/SS
TECH BASEBALL/TRINAMIC SS EA 80
1j TOP/BASEBALL ASYM LAYER " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
NEW BALANCE TRINAMIC TIGHT/4040 PR 30
1k COMP SHORT/TRINAMIC SHORT " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1l ZANTEV2 TEAM SET 80 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID  |NOBID NOBID |NOBID
PR 15
im BLACK/WHITE WARRIOR WARM-UPS " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
PERFORMANCE CUT PROOF SOCKS OR 0
1n MEN'S SENIOR, WARRIOR EA 7 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1o SSTECH TEE EA 300 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
NEW BALANCE BASEBALL TECH
1p SHORT/NEW BALANCE WOVEN SHORT EA 60 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID
MEN'S CORE TEAM POLO, WPTM502
1q GREY EA 60 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1r NEW BALANCE 6 PANET HAT EA 70 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1s NEW BALANCE PRO SLIDE PR 35 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1t WARRIOR SHAVING KITS CUSTOM, BLUE EA 10 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID
1u WARRIOR TEAM TRAVEL DUFFLE EA 40 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1v NEW BALANCE LIFESTYLE BACKPACK EA 40 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1w WARRIOR BLACK BEANIE EA 40 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
1x NEW BALANCE DOWN JACKET EA 40 " " NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NOBID
ITEM 1 AND (1a - 1x) INCLUSIVE
PACKAGE PRICE $55,000.00 |NO BID NOBID  [NOBID  |NOBID NOBID [NOBID




HOCKEY EQUIPMENT (B002439)

GROUP B (BAUER ITEMS) WARRIOR SPORTS BSN SPORTS| DULUTH HOCKEY ~ COMPANY SKATE WORLD, INC.
EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom Qry UNIT CosT UNIT CosT UNIT ALT PRICE EXTENDED COST UNIT ALT PRICE | EXTENDED COST
SUPREME 15 (VARIOUS SENIOR
2 SIZES) PR 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 760.14 $ 7,601.40 | $539.00 $ 5,390.00
Supreme Supreme
GOALIE SUPREME TOTAL ONE NXG 18 1S
3 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $668.92 [ $  668.92 $435.00 | $  435.00
REACTOR 9000 GOAL SKATES
4 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) EA 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 547.30 S 1,094.60 | $389.00 S 778.00
VAPOR 1X SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR
5 SIZES) EA 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NoBID | S 733.38 $ 4,400.28 | $519.00 $ 3,114.00
6 NEXUS IN SKATE (VARIOUS SIZES) EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 760.14 $ 3,040.56 | $539.00 $ 2,156.00
SUPREME 1S (VARIOUS SENIOR
7 SIZES) (CUSTOM) EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 760.14 $  760.14 | $519.00 $  519.00
GOALIE SUPREME 1S (VARIOUS
8 SENIOR SIZES) (CUSTOM) EA 1 NO BID NO BID S 733.38 S 733.38 | $435.00 S 435.00
Reactor Supreme
REACTOR 6000 GOAL SKATE 7000 1S
9 (VARIOUS SIZES) (CUSTOM) EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $358.11 | $ 358.11 [ $475.00 | $475.00 [ $  475.00
VAPOR 1X SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR
10 SIZES) (CUSTOM) EA 1 NO BID NO BID S 73338 $  733.38 | $519.00 $  519.00
NEXUS IN SKATE (VARIOUS SIZES)
11 (cusTom) EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 733.38 S 733.38 | $519.00 S 519.00
TUUK LS EDGE HOLDER (VARIOUS
12 SENIOR SIZES) SET 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$  54.73 S 54730 $ 20.25 S 202.50
TUUK LS EDGE 2 STAINLESS STEEL
13 RUNNER (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) SET 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 39.53 S 39.53 | $ 29.25 S 29.25
TUUK LS EDGE 3 RUNNER (VARIOUS
14 SENIOR SIZES) SET 35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 45.61 $ 1,596.35| $ 33.75 $ 1,181.25
TUUK LS EDGE FUSION RUNNER
15 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) SET 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 87.57 S 87.57 | $ 64.80 S 64.80
TOTAL NO BID NO BID $22,394.90 $15,817.80
This Bid has been Awarded by Group Low, for Group A and B, as the lowest responsible bidders that meets the bid specifications.
Line Item 3 of Group B is corrected to read Goalie Supreme 1S (Various) Senior Sizes.
Line Item 9 of Group B is corrected to read Supreme 9000 Goal Skate (Various Sizes Custom). The Alternate pricing has been accepted.
GROUP A
Warrior Sports - Awarded Line Item 1 (1a - 1x).
GROUP B
Skate World - Awarded Line Items 2 - 15.
FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH
TERMS Net 60 Days N/A Net 30 Net 30
Sticks Only - Manufacturer's
Unnecessary Warranty
WARRANTY breakage N/A Applies Factory
B/22716
Flexibility
requested
based upon
manufacturers
product
ESTIMATE DELIVERY Aug-16 N/A availability 2-4 Weeks
Bid UAH 2016-
YOUR REF NO. N/A N/A 2017 UAH 2016/17
QUOTATION EFF UNTIL 8/31/2016 N/A 8/1/2016 3/15/2017
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION LB N/A SB SB

EMP: 8/2/16




