HOCKEY EQUIPMENT (B002346)

EDGE
GROUP A (WARRIOR ITEMS) 'WARRIOR SPORTS PERFORMANCE GREAT SKATE REEBOK CCM HOCKEY [SKATE WORLD, INC
[EXTENDED [EXTENDED [EXTENDED [EXTENDED |
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom | ary UNIT | EXTENDED cosT |uniT cost  [UNT cost UNIT lcost uNIT cost
MEN'S SENIOR PRO STOCK DYNASTY,
COVERT, VARIOUS STOCK PATTERN, EA 500
1 GRIP AND FLEX INCLUDED INCLUDED __ |NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID

MEN'S SENIOR, CUSTOMS WARRIOR

la SWAGGER GOAL STICKS EA 60 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR COVERT AX1/DYNASTY DT1

1b CUSTOM GLOVES PR 35 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NOBID NO BID NO BID
MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, CUSTOM
PRO WARRIOR FRANCISE CUSTOM EA 15

1c HOCKEY PANTS : " NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK
WARRIOR SWAGGER CUSTOM GOAL EA 3

1d PANTS (GHPSWAS-BLACK) " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, CUSTOM
PRO WARRIOR FRANCISE CUSTOM EA 10

le HOCKEY PANTS SHELL " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR HP PULL OVER 2.5 VARIOUS A

1f SIZES, BLACK, WPTM456 E 50 : " NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR CORE TEAM PANT,

1g WPPMS515, BLACK EA 40 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR TEAM QUARTER ZIP A 4

1h WPTM308, BK E > : " NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR COVERT/SYNASTY SS OR LS
TOP, VARIOUS SIZES AND STYLES EA 80

1i WPTM451, WPTM450 : " NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR TEAM COMPRESSION SHORTS
OR PANTS OR TECH TIGHT PANT,
VARIOUS SIZES WPPM401, WPSM301, EA 80

1j WPP0017 : " NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR SHOES, PREGAME VARIOUS

1k SIZES, ROYAL BLUE/SILVER, PREQUEL20 | PR 80 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID

1l BLACK/WHITE WARRIOR WARM-UPS SET 45 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
MEN'S SENIOR, DYNASTY AXL
PERFORMANCE CUT PROOF SOCKS OR
MEN'S SENIOR, WARRIOR PR 50

1m  COMPRESSION SOCK : " NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
MEN'S SS TECH TEE, VARIOUS SIZES

1n TEAM ROYAL, WPT079 EA 300 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
MEN'S NEXT TECH SHORT, VARIOUS A 20

1o SIZES, BLUE WHITE GREY, WPSM450 E " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
MEN'S CORE TEAM POLO, WPTM502,

1p ROYAL EA 60 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
MEN'S CORE TEAM POLO, WPTM502

1q BLACK EA 60 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR NEW LOGO FLEX CAP,

1r VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK EA 80 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NOBID NO BID NO BID
WARRIOR SHOWER SANDALS, VARIOUS

1s SIZES, BLACK PR 40 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID

1t WARRIOR SHAVING KITS CUsToM, BLUE | EA 15 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NOBID NO BID NO BID

1u WARRIOR CUSTOM EQUIPMENT BAG EA 40 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NOBID NO BID NO BID

1v WARRIOR BLACK BEANIE EA 40 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NOBID NO BID NO BID

1w WARRIOR CUSTOM COACHES BAG EA 10 " " NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NOBID NO BID NO BID

1x WARRIOR WINTER COAT EA 45 " " NO BID NOBID |[NOBID NO BID NOBID |NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 1 AND (1a - 1x) INCLUSIVE
PACKAGE PRICE $ 55,000.00 No BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID |NOBID NO BID NO BID




HOCKEY EQUIPMENT (B002346)

EDGE
GROUP B (BAUER ITEMS) WARRIOR SPORTS PERFORMANCE GREAT SKATE REEBOK CCM HOCKEY ~ [SKATE WORLD, INC.
EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM __|DESCRIPTION uom | ary UNIT cost UNIT EXTENDED COST UNIT  |EXTENDED COST|  UNIT cosT UNIT | EXTENDED COST
SUPREME TOTAL ONE MX3
2 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES EA 15 NO BID NOBID |$ 517.00 $ 7,755.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 8,400.00 [ NOBID NOBID | $495.00 | $ 7,425.00
GOALIE SUPREME TOTAL ONE NXG
3 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) EA 3 NO BID NoBID |$ 390.00 S 1,17000 [ $ 425.00 [ $ 1,275.00 | NOBID NOBID [ $395.00|$ 1,185.00
REACTOR 6000 GOAL SKATES
4 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) EA 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 445.00 | $ 1,335.00 | NOBID NOBID | $415.00 | $ 1,245.00
ALTERNATE
REACTOR 9000
EA 3 $ 410.00| GOALSKATES | $ 1,230.00
VAPOR 1X SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR
5 SIZES) EA 15 NO BID NOBID |$ 546.00 $ 8,190.00| $ 595.00 | $ 8,925.00 | NOBID NOBID [ $518.00 |$ 7,770.00
6 NEXUS 8000 SKATE (VARIOUS SIZES)|  EA 10 NO BID NOBID |$ 455.00 $ 4,550.00 | $ 495.00 | $ 4,950.00 [ NOBID NOBID | $475.00 | $ 4,750.00
SUPREME TOTAL ONE MX3
7 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) (CUSTOM) |  EA 15 NO BID NOBID [$ 517.00 S 7,755.00 [ $ 635.00 [ $ 9,525.00 | NOBID NoBID [ $518.00 |$ 7,770.00
GOALIE SUPREME TOTAL ONE NXG
8 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) (CUSTOM) | EA 3 NO BID NOBID |$ 435.00 $ 1,305.00 [ $ 425.00 | $ 1,275.00 | NOBID NOBID | $475.00 | $ 1,425.00
REACTOR 6000 GOAL SKATE
9 (VARIOUS SIZES) (CUSTOM) EA 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 545.00 | $ 1,635.00 | NOBID NOBID [ $485.00|$ 1,455.00
ALTERNATE
REACTOR 9000
GOAL SKATES
EA 3 S 455.00 | (cusTom) | $ 1,365.00
VAPOR 1X SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR
10 SIZES) (CUSTOM) EA 15 NO BID NOBID |$ 546.00 $ 8,190.00| $ 635.00 | $ 9,525.00 | NOBID NoBID [ $518.00|$ 7,770.00
NEXUS 8000 SKATE (VARIOUS SIZES)
11 (cusToMm) EA 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NoBID | $ 635.00 | $ 6,350.00 | NOBID NOBID | $518.00 | S 5,180.00
TUUK LS EDGE HOLDER (VARIOUS
12 SENIOR SIZES) SET 10 NO BID NOBID |[$ 23.50 $ 235.00| $ 44.00 | $  440.00 | NOBID NOBID [$ 49.00|$  490.00
TUUK LS EDGE 2 STAINLESS STEEL
13 RUNNER (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) SET 10 NO BID NOBID |$ 38.00 $ 38000| $ 32.00$  320.00 | NOBID NOBID [ $ 39.00|$ 390.00
TUUK LS EDGE 3 RUNNER (VARIOUS
14 SENIOR SIZES) SET 10 NO BID NOBID |[$ 38.00 $ 380.00| $ 37.00 | $ 370.00 | NOBID NOBID [$ 43.00|$  430.00
TUUK LS EDGE FUSION RUNNER
15 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) SET 10 NO BID NOBID |$ 73.00 $ 73000| $ 71.25|$ 71250 [ NOBID NOBID [ $ 75.00|$ 750.00
TOTAL NO BID $  43,235.00 $  55,037.50 NO BID $ 48,035.00




HOCKEY EQUIPMENT (B002346)

EDGE REEBOK CCM SKATE
GROUP C (CCM ITEMS) WARRIOR SPORTS PERFORMANCE GREAT SKATE HOCKEY WORLD, INC.
EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom | Qry |uNIT cosT UNIT cosT UNIT CoSsT UNIT cosT UNIT cosT
CCM JETSPEED SKATE (FULL
CUSTOM PRO (SKJS), VARIOUS
16 SENIOR SIZES) PR 10 _|NOBID NO BID $ 660.00 [ $  6,600.00| $  600.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 550.00 $ 550000 $ 650.00 | $ 6,500.00
ALTERNATE
$  459.00| STOCK [$  4,590.00
CCM TACKS (FULL CUSTOM PRO,|
17 VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PR 10 _|NOBID NO BID $ 648.00 [ $  6,480.00|$  590.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $  550.00 $ 550000 $ 640.00 | $ 6,400.00
ALTERNATE
$  45900| STOCK |$  4,590.00
CCM SPEEDBLADE 4.0 HOLDER
18 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PR 5 |noBID NO BID $ 40.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 33.60|$  168.00[$ 1530 $ 76.50| S 49.00 | $  245.00
CCM SPEEDBLADE STAINLESS
STEEL RUNNER (VARIOUS
19 SENIOR SIZES) PR 5 |noBID NO BID $ 49.00 | $ 245.00 | $ 33.60|$  168.00[ S  30.60 $  153.00|$ 49.00 | $  245.00
CCM FULL STAINLESS STEEL
RUNNER (VARIOUS SENIOR
20 SIZES) PR 5 |noBID NO BID $ 49.00 | $ 245.00 | $ 33.60 | $ 168.00| $  30.60 $  153.00|$ 49.00 | $  245.00
REEBOK RIBCOR 50K SKATE
21 (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PR 4 [NnoBID NO BID $ 530.00|$  2,120.00| $  44500|$ 1,780.00 [ $  540.00 $ 2,160.00 [ $ 510.00 | $ 2,040.00
ALTERNATE
$  408.00| STOCK |$  1,632.00
TOTAL NO BID $  15,890.00 $ 14,184.00 $ 24,354.50 $  15,675.00
WARRIOR |EDGE
SPORTS PERFORMANCE GREAT SKATE REEBOK CCM SKATE WORLD
FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH
3 credit
TERMS payments: Net 30 Days Net 30 Net 30 /CC Net 30
Dec. Jan. &
Feb.
Warrior i:;eriee A&
WARRANTY Standard for endum 90 Days Manuf 90 Day Factory
Reebok is Std
Colleges
Factory
Will meet 45-60d 2 weeks on
ill meef - ays
_V Stock/ 4-6
ESTIMATED DELIVERY UAH from receipt 9/1/2015
3 -4 weeks weeks on
Schedule of Order
from order Custom
YOUR REF. NO. UAH16 UAH 2015 62372 15CCMUAH UAH2015
QUOTATION EFF UNTIL 30-May-16 15-Apr-16 15-Apr-16 1-Jan-16 15-Mar-16
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION LB SB SB SB SB

This Bid has been Awarded by Line Item Low, to the lowest responsible bidder that meets the bid specifications
Custom Made Skates are required for team members with wider skate sizes and for those who have fractiona
measurement requirements of their feet sizes. Subsequently, these Alternate products do not meet the Specification for Line Items 16, 17 and 21

GROUP A

Warrior Sports - Awarded Line Item 1 (1a - 1x).

GROUP B

1. Edge Performance - Awarded Line Items 3, 4, 6, 7, 9 and 12.
2. Great Skate - Awarded Line Items 8, 13, 14 and 15.

3. Skate World - Awarded Line Items 2, 5, 10 and 11.

GROUP C

1. Great Skate Awarded Line ltem 21

2. Reebok.CCM Awarded Line Items, 16, 17, 18, 19 and 20.

EMP: 6/11/15




