HOCKEY APPAREL (B002444)
Gemini Athletic |Eastbay,
Wear, Inc. Inc.
FIRST YEAR - COLOR: ROYAL BLUE
ITEM DESCRIPTION SHRINKAGE % Jersey/Socks QTY UNIT PRICE
1 Replacement Game Jerseys & Socks Package $152/$32| 32 | S 184.00|$ 5,888.00 | NOBID
1a Practice Jerseys & Socks Package $44/$28 | 26 | S 72.00 | 1,872.00 | NOBID
1b Additional Practice Jerseys EA|S 1.00 [ NOBID NO BID
1c Additional Practice Socks EA|S 1.00 [ NOBID NO BID
d Sublimated Special Game Jersey & Socks $72/$28 | 30 | $100.00 |$ 3,000.00 | NOBID
le Additional Replacement Game Jerseys 12 | $159.00 |$ 1,908.00 | NOBID
FIRST YEAR TOTAL $  12,668.00 | NOBID
SECOND YEAR - COLOR: GRAY
2 Replacement Game Jerseys & Socks Package $152/$32| 32 | $184.00 | $ 5,888.00 NO BID
2a Practice Jerseys & Socks Package $48/$32 | 10 | S 80.00 s 800.00 NO BID
2b Additional Practice Jerseys EA | S 1.00 | NO BID NO BID
2c Additional Practice Socks EA |S 1.00 [ NOBID NO BID
2d Sublimated Special Game Jersey & Socks $72/$28 | 30 | $100.00 s 3,000.00 | NOBID
2e Additional Replacement Game Jerseys 12 | $159.00 | $ 1,908.00 | NOBID
SECOND YEAR TOTAL $11,596.00| NO BID
THIRD YEAR - COLOR: WHITE
3 Replacement Game Jerseys & Socks Package $152/$32| 32 | $184.00 | S 5,888.00 | NOBID
3a Practice Jerseys & Socks Package $48/$32 | 10 | S 80.00 |$ 800.00 NO BID
3b Additional Practice Jerseys EA |S 1.00 [ NOBID NO BID
3c Additional Practice Socks EA|S 1.00 |NOBID NO BID
3d Sublimated Special Game Jersey & Socks $72/$28 | 30 | $100.00 |$ 3,000.00 | NOBID
3e Additional Replacement Game Jerseys 12 | $159.00 |$ 1,908.00 | NOBID
11,596.00
THIRD YEAR TOTAL ’ NO BID
GRAND TOTAL S 35,860.00
The Bid has been awarded by Line Item Low to the responsible bidder who met the Bid Specifications.

FOB UAH UAH

TERMS Net 30 N/A

WARRANTY Yes N/A

ESTIMATED DELIVERY 9/15/16 - 10/6/16 N/A

YOUR REF NO. B002444 N/A

QUOTATION EFF UNTIL 8/1/2016 N/A

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB N/A

EMP:8/2/16




