
Fiber Optic Patch Cables (B002410.RV01)

MVA Power Fiberdyne Labs NTSG Inc Katek Solutions Graybar Wesco Distribution Howard Technology Response Microwave Inc Electrep, Inc

485.97$          1,075.95$              789.76$     1,176.66$               1,889.30$    1,566.65$                      933.00$                            1,516.05$                                   416.61$            

1,343.85$       5,173.00$              No Bid 3,690.61$               9,194.29$    5,243.43$                      No Bid 4,123.45$                                   4,540.87$        

441.35$          1,351.44$              No Bid 1,425.37$               1,014.29$    1,022.46$                      1,358.00$                        No Bid N/A

2,271.17$       7,600.39$              789.76$     6,292.64$               12,097.88$  7,832.54$                      2,291.00$                        5,639.50$                                   4,957.48$        

2% No Bid No Bid 1% No Bid Cost + 16% N/A No Bid N/A

4/13/2016 - BID AWARDED BY TOTAL LOW TO MVA POWER THE APPARENT, LOWEST, 

RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.--JIB

Additional % off Additional Like Items

Total

Common Fiber Optic Cable

Specialty Fiber Optic Cable

Other


