
2017 WINTER CHARTER BUSES (B002480)

SPIRIT COACH CAPITAL TRAILWAYS
GRAYLINE OF
TN* 

TRACK & FIELD
1 1/14/2017 $ 1,050.00 $ 600.00 Bid received
2 1/22/2017 $ 1,050.00 $ 600.00 after bid
3 1/29/2017 $ 1,050.00 $ 600.00 opening on 
4 2/11/2017 $ 1,275.00 $ 600.00 12/16/2017
5 3/17/17 - 3/18/17 $ 2,050.00 No Bid
6 3/24/17 - 3/25/17 $ 2,050.00 $ 1,300.00
7 4/1/2017 $ 1,050.00 $ 650.00
8 4/7/17 - 4/8/17 $ 2,500.00 $ 1,499.00
9 4/20/17 - 4/22/17 $ 3,075.00 $ 2,100.00

TOTAL $ 15,150.00 $ 7,949.00 *No Bid

LINE ITEMS 1 & 2 REMOVED FROM BID 
DUE TO BUDGET CONSTRAINTS

WOMEN'S LACROSSE
1 3/3/17 - 3/4/17 $ 4,198.00 No Bid
2 3/11/17 - 3/19/17 $ 11,250.00 No Bid

TOTAL $ 15,448.00 No Bid

FOB UAH UAH UAH
TERMS Net 30 N/A

WARRANTY N/A N/A
ESTIMATE DELIVERY N/A N/A

YOUR REF NO. N/A N/A
QUOTATION EFF UNTIL 1/16/2017 N/A



BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB SB No Bid

The Bid has been Awarded by Line Item Low to Spirit Coach and
Capital Trailways, as the lowest responsible bidders 
who met the Bid Specifications.

Capital Trailways Line Items: 1, 2, 3, 4, 6, 7, 8 and 9. 
Spirit Coach Line Item: 5.
*GrayLine of TN - No Bid.

EMP: 12/19/16


