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Item Description Qty UOM  Unit Cost  Extended 
Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended 

Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended 
Cost 

1 Radio, Talkabout MH230R- 2way, Motorola, MFG# MH230R 4 EA 44.83$       179.32$            39.00$                      156.00$                            24.99$       99.96$              45.00$       180.00$                      44.32$       177.28$                38.95$                   155.80$            
2 Monitor, EJBM 19" wide LCD, Acer   MFG # ET.CV3WP.E06 15 EA 112.61$     1,689.15$         101.00$                    1,515.00$                         119.99$     1,799.85$         115.00$     1,725.00$                   107.37$     1,610.55$             105.75$                 1,586.25$         
3 Microphone System, UHF Wireless Body-pack Bogen, MFG #UDMS16BP 1 EA 219.47$     219.47$            160.00$                    160.00$                            189.99$     189.99$            205.00$     205.00$                      165.36$     165.36$                NO BID NO BID
4 Speaker System, Portable, 15-in 2-way Self-Powered, JBL, MFG #EON315 1 EA 482.76$     482.76$            405.00$                    405.00$                            449.99$     449.99$            430.00$     430.00$                      NO BID NO BID 478.00$                 478.00$            
5 Memory Card, Flash, 8 GB SDHC, Kingston, MFG #SD4/8GB 4 EA 14.77$       59.08$              12.50$                      50.00$                               16.99$       67.96$              15.00$       60.00$                        18.21$       72.84$                  11.45$                   45.80$               
6 Wall Mount, Universal Flat Panel, Peerless Paramount, MFG #PF650 1 EA 49.73$       49.73$              50.00$                      50.00$                               44.99$       44.99$              45.00$       45.00$                        48.33$       48.33$                  50.80$                   50.80$               
7 Television, 40-in Widescreen TFT LCD, Coby, MFG #TFTV4028 3 EA 521.50$     1,564.50$         474.00$                    1,422.00$                         449.99$     1,349.97$         450.00$     1,350.00$                   460.58$     1,381.74$             512.45$                 1,537.35$         
8 UTP Transmission/Receivers, 1x4 VGA with Audio Extender, Comprehensive, MFG #CVE-TRX02 6 EA 253.17$     1,519.02$         254.00$                    1,524.00$                         259.99$     1,559.94$         270.00$     1,620.00$                   NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 Audio and Video Switcher, 2x1 XGA / Stereo, Comprehensive, MFG #CSW-VGA211K 1 EA 137.12$     137.12$            140.00$                    140.00$                            139.99$     139.99$            140.00$     140.00$                      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10

Wireless Microphone System, Shure PGX Series Includes: PGX4 Receiver, PGX1 Bodypack Transmitter and 
WL93 Lavalier Microphone (H6/524 - 542MHz)
MFG #PGX14/93-H6 

1 EA

269.11$     269.11$            

295.00$                    

295.00$                            319.99$     319.99$            330.00$     330.00$                      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 Stereo Microphone Mixer, Shure, MFG #SCM262 1 EA 201.10$     201.10$            220.00$                    220.00$                            214.99$     214.99$            220.00$     220.00$                      NO BID NO BID 225.25$             225.25$            
12 Video Tripod, Fluid Head, Pearstone, MFG#VT-2100 3 EA 58.60$       175.80$            90.00$                      270.00$                            85.99$       257.97$            80.00$       240.00$                      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 Camcorder, Flash Memory, Canon FS400, MFG# 5026B003 3 EA 217.88$     653.64$            279.00$                    837.00$                            314.99$     944.97$            320.00$     960.00$                      NO BID NO BID 229.40$             688.20$            
14 Projector, DLP, 2300 Lumens, NEC, MFG #NP43 2 EA 765.90$     1,531.80$         719.00$                    1,438.00$                         749.99$     1,499.98$         830.00$     1,660.00$                   762.59$     1,525.18$             730.85$                 1,461.70$         
15 Remote Presenter for PowerPoint, Global RF, Interlink Electronics Remotepoint, MFG #VP4350 3 EA 119.10$     357.30$            122.02$                    366.06$                            134.99$     404.97$            150.00$     450.00$                      122.68$     368.04$                109.50$                 328.50$            

16

Wireless Microphone System, Shure PGX Series
Includes: PGX4 Receiver, PGX1 Bodypack Transmitter 
and WL93 Lavalier Microphone (L5/644 - 662MHz)
MFG #PGX14/93-L5 

3 EA

269.11$     807.33$            

295.00$                    

885.00$                            319.99$     959.97$            330.00$     990.00$                      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 Active PA and Monitor Speaker System, Behringer 17. Active PA and Monitor Speaker System, Behringer 3 EA 107.88$     323.64$            110.00$                    330.00$                            179.99$     539.97$            170.00$     510.00$                      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 Memory Card, 8GB Class 6 SDHC, Transcend, MFG #TS8GSDHC6 6 EA 14.27$       85.62$              12.25$                      73.50$                               17.99$       107.94$            15.00$       90.00$                        18.16$       108.96$                11.30$                   67.80$               
19 Camcorder (Red), HF R20 Flash Memory, Canon VIXIA, MFG #4905B005 3 EA 336.71$     1,010.13$         399.00$                    1,197.00$                         439.99$     1,319.97$         430.00$     1,290.00$                   NO BID NO BID 327.00$                 981.00$            
20 KVM Switch with Audio and Microphone, 2-Port DVI-D, Iogear, MFG #GCS932UB 1 EA 98.20$       98.20$              90.00$                      90.00$                               99.99$       99.99$              150.00$     150.00$                      95.64$       95.64$                  85.50$                   85.50$               
21 Document Camera, Elmo CO-10, MFG #1306 3 EA 340.21$     1,020.63$         349.00$                    1,047.00$                         389.99$     1,169.97$         370.00$     1,110.00$                   NO BID NO BID 359.45$                 1,078.35$         
22 Projector, Portable Mini LED, 300 Lumens, LG, MFG #HX300G 3 EA 653.71$     1,961.13$         637.12$                    1,911.36$                         679.99$     2,039.97$         830.00$     2,490.00$                   595.68$     1,787.04$             640.20$                 1,920.60$         

15,583.29$      

14,395.58$   14,381.92$                  16,783.29$   16,245.00$            7,340.99$         10,690.90$    

Notes

BIDDERS THAT DID NOT RESPOND TO ALL ITEMS WERE REMOVED FROM TOTAL LOW ANALYSIS
THE BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
ITEM 7 - VSA INC PROVIDED AN ALTERNATE THAT DID NOT MEET THE SPECIFICATION OF TFT DISPLAY,  AUDIO OUTPUT, AND BRIGHTNESS. 
ITEM 13- REMOVED FROM BID DUE TO A CHANGE IN REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

Ticket # 16839
December 15, 2011

UAH DESTINATION
0%, NET30

Standard MFG
2-7 Bus. Days on all in-stock items

Global Gov/ ED

2 Weeks after award

VSA INC Perimutter Purch. Power Multi-Media Masters

SB
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION

 ITEM 12 - ALTERNATE 
QUOTED, Smith Vicson 
P920/TB4409(tripod with bag)                                       
ITEM 13- ALTERNATE 
QUOTED  SONY DCRSX45 

 14,096.50 valid until 9/30,  ITEM 15 increases 
to 122.022 on 9/30  Item 22 increases to 
637.12 on 9/30/11 

 Item total error on item 2 
Vendor totaled it as 2,999.85  
Their bid total of 16,783.29 
does not equal sum of quoted 
prices at 15,583.29 

Xerox Audio Visual Solutions

LB
UAH DESTINATION

NET30
Per Manufacturer's

21 Days P.A.D
UAH-2093-922119211136 B002093 NA

December 31, 2011 December 15, 2011 October 22, 2011

NET30 NET30 NET30
MFG's US Standard MFG Standard MFG Warranty

5-30 Days ARO 14-21 Days

December 15, 2011

SDF Prof. Computers INC.

WB
UAH DESTINATION

NET30
STANDARD
7-10 DARO

December 31, 2011



 Unit Cost  Extended 
Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended 

Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Line Item Low Bid 

NO BID NO BID 78.34$                   313.36$               42.22$                   168.88$                 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 47.08$                   188.32$              45.00$                   180.00$               NO BID NO BID 99.96$                       
NO BID NO BID 112.40$                 1,686.00$            116.78$                 1,751.70$              124.00$                 1,860.00$              NO BID NO BID 117.86$                 1,767.90$           114.00$                 1,710.00$            NO BID NO BID 1,515.00$                 

148.00$                 148.00$         141.03$                 141.03$               158.10$                 158.10$                 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 183.06$                 183.06$              NO BID NO BID 172.80$                 172.80$              141.03$                     
394.00$                 394.00$         408.53$                 408.53$               419.27$                 419.27$                 440.00$                 440.00$                 NO BID NO BID 471.75$                 471.75$              NO BID NO BID 419.58$                 419.58$              394.00$                     

NO BID NO BID 14.84$                   59.36$                 11.97$                   47.88$                   19.00$                   76.00$                   NO BID NO BID 15.13$                   60.52$                18.00$                   72.00$                 NO BID NO BID 45.80$                       
43.00$                   43.00$           38.14$                   38.14$                 44.03$                   44.03$                   69.00$                   69.00$                   NO BID NO BID 58.73$                   58.73$                51.00$                   51.00$                 46.25$                   46.25$                38.14$                       

NO BID NO BID 504.29$                 1,512.87$            533.25$                 1,599.75$              588.00$                 1,764.00$              NO BID NO BID 424.28$                 1,272.84$           497.00$                 1,491.00$            NO BID NO BID 1,272.84$                 
NO BID NO BID 241.21$                 1,447.26$            189.00$                 1,134.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 371.38$                 2,228.28$           NO BID NO BID 275.26$                 1,651.56$           189.00$                     
NO BID NO BID 127.58$                 127.58$               116.00$                 116.00$                 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 196.43$                 196.43$              145.00$                 145.00$               145.59$                 145.59$              116.00$                     

290.00$                 290.00$         280.07$                 280.07$               296.80$                 296.80$                 274.00$                 274.00$                 312.00$                 312.00$            344.05$                 344.05$              321.00$                 321.00$               306.00$                 306.00$              269.11$                     
211.00$                 211.00$         199.00$                 199.00$               208.60$                 208.60$                 205.00$                 205.00$                 209.00$                 209.00$            227.38$                 227.38$              334.00$                 334.00$               224.71$                 224.71$              199.00$                     

NO BID NO BID 75.96$                   227.88$               33.00$                   99.00$                   NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 83.20$                   249.60$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 99.00$                       
251.99$                 755.97$         237.28$                 711.84$               283.00$                 849.00$                 271.00$                 813.00$                 NO BID NO BID 316.67$                 950.01$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 653.67$                     

NO BID NO BID 732.82$                 1,465.64$            761.00$                 1,522.00$              747.00$                 1,494.00$              810.00$                 1,620.00$         861.67$                 1,723.34$           NO BID NO BID 826.14$                 1,652.28$           1,438.00$                 
NO BID NO BID 135.05$                 405.15$               132.69$                 398.07$                 133.00$                 399.00$                 NO BID NO BID 134.52$                 403.56$              134.00$                 402.00$               125.88$                 377.64$              357.30$                     

290.00$                 870.00$         280.07$                 840.21$               296.80$                 890.40$                 271.00$                 813.00$                 312.00$                 936.00$            344.05$                 1,032.15$           321.00$                 963.00$               306.00$                 918.00$              807.33$                     
110.00$                 330.00$         132.05$                 396.15$               157.48$                 472.44$                 -$                       NO BID NO BID 177.38$                 532.14$              NO BID NO BID 143.53$                 430.59$              323.64$                     

NO BID NO BID 13.53$                   81.18$                 11.54$                   69.24$                   -$                       NO BID NO BID 14.99$                   89.94$                19.00$                   114.00$               NO BID NO BID 67.80$                       
359.99$                 1,079.97$      336.73$                 1,010.19$            382.00$                 1,146.00$              368.00$                 1,104.00$              NO BID NO BID 463.96$                 1,391.88$           NO BID NO BID 423.53$                 1,270.59$           981.00$                     

NO BID NO BID 103.60$                 103.60$               102.89$                 102.89$                 -$                       NO BID NO BID 105.96$                 105.96$              98.00$                   98.00$                 NO BID NO BID 85.50$                       
390.00$                 1,170.00$      335.00$                 1,005.00$            354.00$                 1,062.00$              355.00$                 1,065.00$              389.00$                 1,167.00$         460.72$                 1,382.16$           345.00$                 1,035.00$            378.82$                 1,136.46$           1,005.00$                 

NO BID NO BID 626.23$                 1,878.69$            623.00$                 1,869.00$              619.00$                 1,857.00$              740.00$                 2,220.00$         723.92$                 2,171.76$           NO BID NO BID 710.59$                 2,131.77$           1,787.04$                 
14,338.73$          17,031.76$         

  Total Low Bid 
5,291.94$   14,339.63$      14,425.05$        12,233.00$        6,464.00$      17,121.92$     6,916.00$        10,883.82$     14,339.00$               

Business Classification
FOB Point
Terms
Warranty
Delivery
Your Reference No.
Quotation Effective

DATE COMPLETED
10/12/2011

Q302410A
December 15, 2011

UAH DESTINATION
NET30

Manufacturers
7-10 Business Days

December 31, 2011

 ITEM 7- ALTERNATE QUOTED                      
Dynex DX40L26141                                                                         
Error on total of item 22  

UAH DESTINATION
NET30

14 Business Days
464707
30 Days

UAH DESTINATION
NET30

Full Mfg Warranty
30 DAYS

90 DAYS

UAH DESTINATION
NET30

14 DAYS
CL-092011A

December 15, 2011

UAH DESTINATION
NET30

Standard MFG
7-30 DAYS

B002093
October 1, 2012

 Bid total (14,339.63) does not equal total 
of items at 14,338.73      

UAH DESTINATION
NET30

1 Year Warranty
10-15 Days

120 DAYS

 ITEM 12 - ALTERNATE QUOTED  
Valiant TX-7 Tripod 

WB
UAH DESTINATION

NET30
MFG Standard

Stock to 30 Days ARO

UAH DESTINATION
NET30

MFG Standard
12-14 DAY ARO

881033
December 31, 2011

Dinabox, Inc. Custom Media Services Howard Computers Audio Visual InnovationsFull Compass Pro Audio Troxell Communications VALIANT IMC AVES ADIO VISUAL SYSTEMS



Line Item Low Vendor

Multi-Media Masters #N/A #N/A
Perimutter Purch. Power #N/A #N/A
Troxell Communications
Full Compass Pro Audio

Global Gov Ed
Troxell Communications

NO AWARD
Valiant IMC
Valiant IMC

VSA INC
Troxell Communications

Valiant IMC
VSA INC

Perimutter Purch. Power
Global Gov Ed

VSA INC
VSA INC

Global Gov Ed
Global Gov Ed
Global Gov Ed

Troxell Communications
SDF Profesional Computers Inc.

Total Low Vendor
NO AWARD 0 Enter Data

 n

BUYER
KDH
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