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Item Description Qty UOM  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 PROJECTOR, SONY VPL #CX155 LCD 11 EA 1,641.60$         18,057.60$       2,050.00$         22,550.00$       1,725.00$         18,975.00$       NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18,057.60$                NO AWARD #N/A
2 PROJECTOR MOUNT,UNIVERSAL, PREMIER MOUNTS #PBL-UMS, CEILING MOUNT KIT 11 EA 101.68$            1,118.48$         152.95$            1,682.45$         105.00$            1,155.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,118.48$                  NO AWARD #N/A
3 INSTALLATION 1 EA 4,144.70$         4,144.70$         2,475.00$         2,475.00$         2,530.00$         2,530.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,000.00$                  NO AWARD

 Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
23,320.78$       26,707.45$       22,660.00$       23,659.90$       NO BID 22,660.00$                Howard Technology Solutions 0

Bid Bond Y/N
FOB Point
Terms
Warranty
Delivery
Your Reference No.
Quotation Effective

Notes

AVI-SPL, Inc Building Systems Technology Howard Technology Solutions

N/A N/A N/A
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION

Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
AS DEFINED IN BID SPECS AS DEFINED IN BID SPECS AS DEFINED IN BID SPECS
ON OR BEFORE 08/13/2010 ON OR BEFORE 08/13/2010 ON OR BEFORE 08/13/2010

406522
ON OR BEFORE 08/13/2010ON OR BEFORE 08/13/2010

MarkerTek Video Supply

N/A
UAH DESTINATION

AS DEFINED IN BID SPECS

Logical Choice

N/A
UAH DESTINATION

Net 30 Days
AS DEFINED IN BID SPECS

September 30, 2010September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010

AWARD NOTES
BIDDERS THAT DID NOT RESPOND TO ALL ITEMS WERE REMOVED FROM LINE ITEM LOW ANALYSIS

THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "TOTAL LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS  

DATE COMPLETED BUYER
7/30/2010 MAA



Sony VPL CX155 LCD Projectors Mounts and Install (B001994) page 2 of 2

Item Description Qty UOM  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 PROJECTOR, SONY VPL #CX155 LCD 11 EA NO BID NO BID 1,901.00$         20,911.00$       18,057.60$              NO AWARD #N/A
2 PROJECTOR MOUNT,UNIVERSAL, PREMIER MOUNTS #PBL-UMS, CEILING MOUNT KIT 11 EA NO BID NO BID 119.00$            1,309.00$         1,118.48$                NO AWARD #N/A
3 INSTALLATION 1 EA NO BID NO BID 1,000.00$         1,000.00$         1,000.00$                NO AWARD

 Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
NO BID 23,220.00$       22,660.00$              Howard Technology Solutions 0

Bid Bond Y/N
FOB Point
Terms
Warranty
Delivery
Your Reference No.
Quotation Effective

Notes

UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION
Net 30 Days

September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010

Multi-Media Solutions Xerox AV Solutions

N/A N/A

UAH-1994-0723

AS DEFINED IN BID SPECS AS DEFINED IN BID SPECS
ON OR BEFORE 08/13/2010 ON OR BEFORE 08/13/2010

AWARD NOTES
BIDDERS THAT DID NOT RESPOND TO ALL ITEMS WERE REMOVED FROM LINE ITEM LOW ANALYSIS

THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "TOTAL LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS  

DATE COMPLETED BUYER
7/30/2010 MAA
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