
Aprisa Tech GigaPartsBOLData Tech

 Vendor Note: Shipping - UPS 
Ground - $63.00 

Supermicro X8DTi-F Server (B001993) page 1 of 3
Ace Computer Advanced HPC, Inc

Item Description Qty UOM  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor

1 Supermicro 2U Rackmount Chassis 1 EA 73$            2.00 $     732.00       $            616.39 $ 616.           39 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 552.00$            552.00$            669.00$            669.00$            NO AWARD NO AWARD 732 Duplicates
2 Supermicro X8DTi-F Server Board 1 EA 41$            8.00 $     418.00       $            410.84 $ 410.           84 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 370.00$            370.00$            404.00$            404.00$            NO AWARD NO AWARD 418 Duplicates
3 Intel Xeon 2.66 GHz X5650 Six Core Nehalem CPUs 2 EA 2$         ,136.20 $     4,272.40    1,$         038.62 $ 2,077.        24 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 986.00$            1,972.00$         1,073.00$         2,146.00$         NO AWARD NO AWARD
4 48 GB DDR3-1333 ECCR Memory (4GBx12) 1 EA 1$         ,821.60 $     1,821.60    1,$         498.62 $ 1,498.        62 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 1,500.00$         1,500.00$         1,679.00$         1,679.00$         NO AWARD NO AWARD
5 Seagate 2TB 7200rpm SAS 600 Enterprise Drive 8 EA 34$            1.00 $     2,728.00    $            349.73 $ 2,797.        84 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 300.00$            2,400.00$         395.00$            3,160.00$         NO AWARD NO AWARD
6 250GB Seagate Enterprise Boot Drive 1 EA $              59.00 $     59.00         $            105.28 $ 105.           28 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 79.00$              79.00$              132.00$            132.00$            NO AWARD NO AWARD
7 LSI 9260-8i PCIe x8 SAS 600 RAID card 1 EA 77$            8.00 778.00$            $            744.17 $ 744.           17 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 504.00$            504.00$            568.00$            568.00$            NO AWARD NO AWARD
8 ATI 1 GB Radeon HD 5570 Graphics 1 EA $              92.40 92.40$              $           97.51   $ 97.             51 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 74.00$              74.00$              99.00$              99.00$              NO AWARD NO AWARD
9 Internal Slim DVD R/W 1 EA $              39.00 39.00$              $           56.40   $ 56.             40 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 44.00$              44.00$              59.00$              59.00$              NO AWARD NO AWARD

10 CentOS Latest Version Installed 1 EA Included Included No Cost No Cost No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Cost No Cost 1,280.00$         1,280.00$         NO AWARD NO AWARD
11 Media, CD or DVD Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included NO AWARD NO AWARD
12 3 year Parts and Labor Advanced Replacement Warranty 1 EA Included Included $            294.17 $ 294.           17 No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid 150.00$            150.00$            1,620.00$         1,620.00$         NO AWARD NO AWARD
13 System Disk Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included NO AWARD NO AWARD

w/o Shipping 7,645.00$          Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
$     10,940.40  $ 8,698.        46 $       8      ,888.00 w/Shipping 7,708.00$         11,816.00$       7,708.00$                  BOLData Tech 0 Enter Data

7,810.00$                  Stewart Staffing
7,999.00$                  Vision Computers

N/A N/A Bid Bond Y/NN/A N/AN/A
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB PointUAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATIONUAH DESTINATION

45 Days Net 30 Days TermsNet 30 DaysNet 30 Days
Refer to Bid Specs Refer to Bid Specs WarrantyRefer to Bid Specs Refer to Bid SpecsRefer to Bid Specs

2 Weeks ARO 14 - 21 Days Delivery20 Days10 Business Days ARO
NANA UAUAHuntsvilleB001993HuntsvilleB001993 Your Reference No8102010 Your Reference No.8102010

September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010 Quotation EffectiveSeptember 30, 2010September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010

Notes  Item 1 - Vendor note a
Syncs - 2 

dds Heat 

AWARD NOTES
DATE COMPLETED BUYER

THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "TOTAL LOW" TO LDATA E LOGY, S H , O BLE ING FI BO  T CHNO  INC. A  T E APPARENT  L WEST RESPONSI  BIDDER, MEET  SPECI CATIONS  9/2/2010 MAA



MA Laboratories Quick-800 Seneca Data
Supermicro X8DTi-F Server (B001993) page 2 of 3

Global GovEd HPC Systems
Item Description Qty UOM  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor

1 Supermicro 2U Rackmount Chassis 1 EA No Bid No Bid $         619.00   61$            9.00 595.00$            $       59     5.00 740.00$            740.00$            No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD 619 Duplicates
2 Supermicro X8DTi-F Server Board 1 EA No Bid No Bid $         415.00   41$            5.00 370.00$            $       37     0.00 384.00$            384.00$            No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD 415 Duplicates
3 Intel Xeon 2.66 GHz X5650 Six Core Nehalem CPUs 2 EA No Bid No Bid 1$         ,160.00 2,32$         0.00 935.00$            1,870.00$         1,068.00$         2,136.00$         No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
4 48 GB DDR3-1333 ECCR Memory (4GBx12) 1 EA No Bid No Bid 1$         ,878.00 1,87$         8.00 $         1,380.00 1,380.00$         1,500.00$         1,500.00$         No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
5 Seagate 2TB 7200rpm SAS 600 Enterprise Drive 8 EA No Bid No Bid $         357.75   2,86$         2.00 335.00$            2,680.00$         355.00$            2,840.00$         No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
6 250GB Seagate Enterprise Boot Drive 1 EA No Bid No Bid $         110.00   11$            0.00 69.00$              69.00$              73.00$              73.00$              No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
7 LSI 9260-8i PCIe x8 SAS 600 RAID card 1 EA No Bid No Bid $         559.00   55$            9.00 670.00$            670.00$            657.00$            657.00$            No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
8 ATI 1 GB Radeon HD 5570 Graphics 1 EA No Bid No Bid $         100.00   10$            0.00 83.00$              83.00$              97.00$              97.00$              No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
9 Internal Slim DVD R/W 1 EA No Bid No Bid $         36.00     3$              6.00 40.00$              40.00$              35.00$              35.00$              No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD

10 CentOS Latest Version Installed 1 EA No Bid No Bid $         36.00     3$              6.00 90.00$              90.00$              No Cost No Cost No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
11 Media, CD or DVD Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included NO AWARD NO AWARD
12 3 year Parts and Labor Advanced Replacement Warranty 1 EA No Bid No Bid $         200.00   20$            0.00 706.25$            706.25$           1,016.00$         1,016.00$        No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
13 System Disk Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included NO AWARD NO AWARD

 Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
No Bid 9,13$         5.00 $       8,55  3.25 9,478.00$         8,224.97$         7,708.00$                BOLData Tech 0 Enter Data

7,810.00$                Stewart Staffing
7,999.00$                Vision Computers

N/A N/A Bid Bond Y/NN/A N/A N/A
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB PointUAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION

Net 30 Days TermsNet 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
Refer to Bid Specs Refer to Bid Specs WarrantyRefer to Bid Specs Refer to Bid Specs Refer to Bid Specs

10 Business Days ARO Delivery1 - 2 Weeks 7 - 14 Days ARO 10 - 12 Days ARO
Your Reference No.UAH8100A UAH081110

September 30September 30 2010, 2010 September 30 2010September 30, 2010 Quotation EffectiveSeptember 30 2010 September 30 2010 September 30 2010 Quotation EffectiveSeptember 30, 2010 September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010

Notes

AWARD NOTES
DATE COMPLETED BUYER

THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "TOTAL LOW" TO LDATA E LOGY, S H , O BLE ING FI BO  T CHNO  INC. A  T E APPARENT  L WEST RESPONSI  BIDDER, MEET  SPECI CATIONS  9/2/2010 MAA



ThinkCP Tech Vision Computers
Supermicro X8DTi-F Server (B001993) page3 of 3

Stewart Staffing
Item Description Qty UOM  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Unit Cost  Extended Cost  Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor

1 Supermicro 2U Rackmount Chassis 1 EA 52$            0.00 No id N520.00$             Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD 520 Duplicates
2 Supermicro X8DTi-F Server Board 1 EA 38$            0.00 No id N380.00$             Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD 380 Duplicates
3 Intel Xeon 2.66 GHz X5650 Six Core Nehalem CPUs 2 EA 94$            5.00 No id N1,890.00$          Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
4 48 GB DDR3-1333 ECCR Memory (4GBx12) 1 EA 1,80$         0.00 No id N1,800.00$          Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
5 Seagate 2TB 7200rpm SAS 600 Enterprise Drive 8 EA 27$            5.00 No id N2,200.00$          Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
6 250GB Seagate Enterprise Boot Drive 1 EA 3$              0.00 No id N30.00$               Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
7 LSI 9260-8i PCIe x8 SAS 600 RAID card 1 EA 48$            0.00 No id N480.00$             Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
8 ATI 1 GB Radeon HD 5570 Graphics 1 EA 8$              5.00 No id N85.00$               Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
9 Internal Slim DVD R/W 1 EA 2$              5.00 No id N25.00$               Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD

10 CentOS Latest Version Installed 1 EA No Cost No o No id N C st  Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
11 Media, CD or DVD Included Included Included Included Included Included NO AWARD NO AWARD
12 3 year Parts and Labor Advanced Replacement Warranty 1 EA 40$           0.00 No id N400.00$            Line Item B o Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid No Line Item Bid NO AWARD NO AWARD
13 System Disk Included Included Included Included Included Included NO AWARD NO AWARD

 Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
7,810.00$         8,20$             7.00 $       7      ,999.00 7,708.00$                BOLData Tech 0 Enter Data

7,810.00$                Stewart Staffing
7,999.00$                Vision Computers

N/A Bid Bond Y/NN/A N/A
UAH DESTINATI FOB PointON UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION

Net 30 Days TermsNet 30 Days
Refer to Bid Spe Warrantycs Refer to Bid Specs Refer to Bid Specs

21 Days Aro Delivery30 Days ARO
UAHB001993 Your Reference No.SQ-293524

September 30 2010September 30, 2010 Quotation EffectiveSeptember 30 2010 September 30 2010 Quotation EffectiveSeptember 30, 2010 September 30, 2010

Notes

AWARD NOTES
DATE COMPLETED BUYER

THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "TOTAL LOW" TO LDATA E LOGY, S H , O BLE ING FI TI BO  T CHNO  INC. A  T E APPARENT  L WEST RESPONSI  BIDDER, MEET  SPECI CA ONS  9/2/2010 MAA
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