2010 Hockey Equipment Bid (B001989) page 1 of 4

Great Skate SkateWorld
Item Description Qty| UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 BLADE JACKET, BAUER 1 EA $ 500($ 500 $ 525($ 5.25
2 DEBURRING STONES, BLADEMASTER, TSM5004 RECTANGULAR, 4 PK 1 EA |$ 21.25(|$ 2125 $ 20.00 | $ 20.00
3 DIAMOND DRESSER, BLADEMASTER, TSM687 STANDARD 1 EA $ 2250 |$ 2250 $ 2200 % 22.00
4 DIAMOND DRESSER, BLADEMASTER, TSM698 .14 CARAT 1 EA $ 2750 | $ 2750 [ $ 2550 | $ 25.50
5 GOALIE SKATE, BAUER, SUPREME ONE100 PRO, SENIOR 1 EA $ 22555 [ $ 22555 | $ 267.90 [ $ 267.90
6 HOCKEY SKATE, BAUER, SUPREME ONE100, SENIOR 1 PR $ 253.46 | $ 253.46 [ $ 298.00 | $ 298.00
7 HOCKEY SKATE, BAUER, SUPREME TOTALONE, SENIOR 1 PR $ 31146 [ $ 31146 | $ 366.72 | $ 366.72
8 HOCKEY SKATE, BAUER, VAPOR X:60, SENIOR 1 PR $ 253.46 | $ 253.46 | $ 298.00 | $ 298.00
9 HOCKEY SKATE, CCM, U+ PRO, SENIOR 1 PR $ 380.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 382.00 | $ 382.00
10 [HOCKEY SKATE, REEBOK, 11 K PUMP, SENIOR 1 PR $ 346.80 | $ 346.80 [ $ 399.00 | $ 399.00
11 [HOCKEY SKATES, EASTON, S17 STEALTH COMPOSITE SENIOR 1 PR NO BID NO BID $ 499.00 [ $ 499.00
12 |[HOCKEY SKATES, GRAF, SUPRA 709 - CUSTOM SPECS FOR JAMIE EASTON 1 PR |$ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 399.00 | $ 399.00
13 |HOLDER/STAINLESS STEEL RUNNER, BAUER, TUUK LIGHTSPEED PRO SENIOR 1 EA $ 18.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 1800 |$ 18.00
14 |RUNNER/HOLDER, BAUER, TUUK LIGHTSPEED 2, SENIOR 1 EA $ 26.00 [ $ 26.00 [ $ 27.00 | $ 27.00
15 [SHARPENING WHEEL, BLADEMASTER, 8MX RUBY SKATE, 6 PK 1 EA $ 180.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 149.00 | $ 149.00
16 [STAINLESS STEEL RUNNER, BAUER, TUUK LIGHTSPEED 2, SENIOR 1 EA $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 18.00
17 [STAINLESS STEEL RUNNER, BAUER, TUUK LIGHTSPEED 2.1 POWER, SENIOR 1 EA $ 3500 % 35.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 18.00
18 |TOE LACE BRIDGE, BAUER, VAPOR GOAL 1 EA $ 1500 | $ 15.00 | $ 1500 | $ 15.00
19 |WAXLACES WITH DOUBLE TRACER, BAUER 36/CASE 1 EA $ 110.00 | $ 11000 | $ 102.60 | $ 102.60
20 |WHITE LACES WITH MOLDED TIP, BAUER 24/CASE 1 EA $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 [ $ 60.00
21 |[END PLUGS, BAUER, SUPREME SENIOR, WOOD 6" 1 EA $ 4.00 | $ 400 $ 500(%$ 5.00
22 |END PLUGS, BAUER, VAPOR X:60 SENIOR, WOOD 6" 1 EA $ 4.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 5.00 [ $ 5.00
23 |GOALIE STICK, BAUER, VAPOR X:50 COMPOSITE, SENIOR 1 EA $ 4337 [ $ 4337 | $ 5170 | $ 51.70
24 |GOALIE STICK, SUPREME ONE75 COMPOSITE, SENIOR 1 EA $ 4337 [ $ 4337 | $ 51.70 [ $ 51.70
25 [HOCKEY STICK, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95 SENIOR COMPOSITE 1 EA $ 8227 |3 8227 $ 99.00 | $ 99.00

N/A N/A
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION
Net 30 Days Net 15 Days
Factory
AS NEEDED AS NEEDED
720372 UAH2010
September 30, 2011 September 30, 2011
Notes

AWARD NOTES
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "“LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
RESPONSES OF EQUAL VALUE ARE INDICATED BY BOLD FONT IN THE TABLE ABOVE AND WILL BE AWARDED BASED UPON THE MOST ADVANTAGEOUS PAYMENT TERMS

Bid Bond Y/N
FOB Point
Terms
Warranty
Delivery

Your Reference No.

Quotation Effective

Line Item Low Bid

Line ltem Low Vendor

$ 5.00 Great Skate
$ 20.00 SkateWorld
$ 22.00 SkateWorld
$ 25.50 SkateWorld
$ 225.55 Great Skate
$ 253.46 Great Skate
$ 311.46 Great Skate
$ 253.46 Great Skate
$ 380.00 Great Skate
$ 346.80 Great Skate
$ 499.00 SkateWorld
$ 399.00 SkateWorld
$ 18.00 Great Skate
$ 26.00 Great Skate
$ 149.00 SkateWorld
$ 18.00 SkateWorld
$ 18.00 SkateWorld
$ 15.00 Great Skate
$ 102.60 SkateWorld
$ 60.00 Great Skate
$ 4.00 Great Skate
$ 4.00 Great Skate
$ 43.37 Great Skate
$ 43.37 Great Skate
$ 82.27 Great Skate

| Total Low Bid | Total Low Vendor |
[ NO AWARD [ NOAWARD |
[ DATE COMPLETED | BUYER |
[ 8/13/2010 | MAA |
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Great Skate

SkateWorld

Item Description Qty | UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
26 [HOCKEY STICK, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95 STICK'UM SENIOR COMPOSITE 1 EA $ 82.27 [ $ 8227 | $ 99.00 [ $ 99.00
27 |HOCKEY STICK, BAUER, VAPOR X:60 STICK'UM SENIOR COMPOSITE 1 EA $ 82.27 [ $ 8227 $ 99.00 | $ 99.00
28 [HOCKEY STICK, BAUER, VAPOR X:60 SENIOR COMPOSITE 1 EA $ 82.27 [ $ 8227 [ $ 99.00 | $ 99.00
29 [REPLACEMENT BLADE, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95 SENIOR COMPOSITE 1 EA $ 2270 [ $ 2270 [ $ 2750 [ $ 27.50
30 [REPLACEMENT BLADE, BAUER, VAPOR X:60 COMPOSITE, 0.520" TAPERED 1 EA $ 2270 [ $ 2270 [ $ 2750 [ $ 27.50
31 [REPLACEMENT SHAFT, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95 COMPOSITE SENIOR 1 EA $ 46.54 [ $ 46.54 | $ 56.50 [ $ 56.50
32 |REPLACEMENT SHAFT, BAUER, VAPOR X:60 SENIOR COMPOSITE, 0.520" TAPERED 1 EA $ 46.54 [ $ 46.54 | $ 56.50 [ $ 56.50
33 |FACE MASK, BAUER 7500 1 EA $ 1330 ([ $ 1330 | $ 1580 [ $ 15.80
34 |FULL SHIELD, BAUER, CONCEPT Il, SENIOR 1 EA $ 19.60 | $ 19.60 | $ 2340 [ $ 23.40
35 |GOALIE MASK, BAUER, PROFILE PRO 960, SENIOR-CERTIFIED 1 EA $ 340.60 | $ 340.60 | $ 399.00 | $ 399.00
36 [HOCKEY HELMET COMBO, BAUER 7500 1 EA $ 3845 ($ 3845 | $ 4550 | $ 45.50
37 |HOCKEY HELMET, BAUER 7500 1 EA $ 3845 ($ 3845 | $ 36.50 | $ 36.50
38 |REPLACEMENT GOALIE COWLING, BAUER, SUPREME ONE100, SENIOR 1 EA $ 110.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 110.00
39 |CATCH GLOVE, REEBOK REVOKE 'PRO ZONE CUSTOM' PRO - CJ GROH SPECS 1 EA [$ 320.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 380.00
40 |CATCH GLOVE, VAUGHN T8880, EPIC - CLARKE SAUNDERS SPECS 1 EA $ 326.00 | $ 326.00 | $ 355.00 | $ 355.00
41 |CHEST PROTECTOR, BAUER PRO, SENIOR 1 EA $ 159.04 | $ 159.04 | $ 189.50 | $ 189.50
42 |CUP AND SUPPORTER, BAUER, MENS 1 EA $ 8.00|% 8.00 | $ 8.00|% 8.00
43 |ELBOW PADS, BAUER, SUPREME ONES55, SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 3180 [ $ 3180 [ $ 33.00 | $ 33.00
44 |ELBOW PADS, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95, SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 3180 [ $ 3180 $ 3750 [ $ 37.50
45 |ELBOW PADS, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95,SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 3180 [ $ 3180 $ 3750 [ $ 37.50
46 |ELBOW PADS, BAUER, VAPOR X:60, SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 3180 [ $ 3180 $ 3750 [ $ 37.50
47 |GARTER BELT, BAUER, SENIOR 1 EA $ 350 ($ 3508 5.00|% 5.00
48 |GOALIE BIB, BAUER NECTECH, SENIOR 1 EA |$ 26.00 [ $ 26.00 [ $ 26.00 [ $ 26.00
49 |GOALIE BLOCKER, REEBOK REVOKE 'PRO ZONE CUSTOM' PRO - CJ GROH SPECS 1 EA $ 210.00 | $ 210.00 [ $ 260.00 | $ 260.00
50 [GOALIE BLOCKER, VAUGHN B7600, VELOCITY 4 - CLARKE SAUNDERS SPECS 1 EA $ 248.00 | $ 248.00 [ $ 245.00 | $ 245.00
N/A N/A
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION
Net 30 Days Net 15 Days
Factory
AS NEEDED AS NEEDED
720372 UAH2010
September 30, 2011 September 30, 2011
Notes

AWARD NOTES
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
RESPONSES OF EQUAL VALUE ARE INDICATED BY BOLD FONT IN THE TABLE ABOVE AND WILL BE AWARDED BASED UPON THE MOST ADVANTAGEOUS PAYMENT TERMS

Bid Bond Y/N
FOB Point
Terms
Warranty
Delivery

Your Reference No.

Quotation Effective

Line Item Low Bid

Line Item Low Vendor

$ 82.27 Great Skate

$ 82.27 Great Skate

$ 82.27 Great Skate

$ 22.70 Great Skate

$ 22.70 Great Skate

$ 46.54 Great Skate

$ 46.54 Great Skate

$ 13.30 Great Skate

$ 19.60 Great Skate

$ 340.60 Great Skate

$ 38.45 Great Skate

$ 36.50 SkateWorld

$ 110.00 Great Skate

$ 320.00 Great Skate

$ 326.00 Great Skate

$ 159.04 Great Skate

$ 8.00 Great Skate

$ 31.80 Great Skate

$ 31.80 Great Skate

$ 31.80 Great Skate

$ 31.80 Great Skate

$ 3.50 Great Skate

$ 26.00 Great Skate

$ 210.00 Great Skate

$ 245.00 SkateWorld
[ Total Low Bid [ Total Low Vendor |
| NO AWARD [ NO AWARD |
[ DATE COMPLETED | BUYER |
| 8/13/2010 | MAA |
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Great Skate SkateWorld
Item Description Qty | UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
51 |GOALIE LEG PADS, REEBOK REVOKE 'PRO ZONE CUSTOM' PRO - CJ GROH SPECS 1 EA $ 1,042.00 | $ 1,042.00 | $ 1,225.00 | $ 1,225.00
52 |GOALIE PADS, VAUGHN, VPG 7600 VELOCITY 4 - CLARKE SAUNDERS SPECS 1 EA $ 1,200.00 1,200.00 1,095.00 1,095.00
53 |[HOCKEY GLOVE, VAPOR X:60 PRO, SENIOR 1 PR | $ 46.26 46.26 56.00 56.00
54 |HOCKEY PANTS, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95, SENIOR CUSTOM 1 PR $ 71.30 71.30 86.00 86.00
55 |SHIN GUARDS, BAUER, SUPREME 850, REFEREE 1 PR $ 30.00 [ $ 30.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 30.00
56 |SHIN PADS, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95, SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 3760 [ $ 37.60 | $ 4479 | $ 44.79
57 |SHIN PADS, BAUER, VAPOR X:60, SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 3760 [ $ 3760 | $ 4479 | $ 44.79
58 |SHOULDER PADS, BAUER, SUPREME CLASSIC, SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 20.00 [ $ 20.00 | $ 25.00 [ $ 25.00
59 |SHOULDER PADS, BAUER, SUPREME ONE95, SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 4337 | $ 4337 | $ 51.69 | $ 51.69
60 |SHOULDER PADS, BAUER, VAPOR X:60, SENIOR, UNDER PROTECTIVE 1 PR $ 4337 | $ 4337 | $ 51.69 | $ 51.69
61 |THROAT PROTECTOR, BAUER, NECTECH LEXAN GOALIE, N17 1 EA $ 18.00 | $ 18.00 [ $ 18.00 | $ 18.00
62 |THROAT PROTECTOR, BAUER, NECTECH LEXAN GOALIE, N17 1 EA |$ 18.00 | $ 18.00 [ $ 18.00 | $ 18.00
63 |GOALIE JOCK PRO, BAUER, SENIOR 1 EA $ 45.00 [ $ 45.00 | $ 4495 | $ 44.95
64 |GOALIE PANT, BAUER PRO, SENIOR 1 EA $ 101.20 | $ 101.20 [ $ 120.70 | $ 120.70
65 |HOCKEY FIT PANT, BAUER, VAPOR CORE SENIOR, MENS 1 EA $ 1156 | $ 1156 | $ 1870 | $ 18.70
66 |[HOCKEY PANTS, BAUER, VAPOR CORE SENIOR COMPRESSION 1 EA $ 1156 | $ 1156 | $ 2500 ($ 25.00
67 |HOCKEY SHORTS, BAUER, VAPOR CORE SENIOR COMPRESSION 1 PR $ 1011 | $ 1011 | $ 2000 [ $ 20.00
68 [HOCKEY SHORTS, BAUER, VAPOR CORE SENIOR COMPRESSION 1 EA $ 1011 | $ 1011 | $ 12.08 | $ 12.08
69 [JACKET, BAUER 3 IN 1, SENIOR 1 EA $ 3760 [ $ 37.60 | $ 44.80 | $ 44.80
70 [JACKET, BAUER INSULATED SENIOR, MENS 1 EA $ 2023 [ $ 20.23 | $ 2410 (% 24.10
71 |JACKET, BAUER SOFT SHELL, MENS 1 EA $ 2313 (% 2313 | $ 2750 ($ 27.50
72 |JOCK SHORTS, BAUER, CLASSIC MESH, SENIOR 1 EA $ 6.65 (% 6.65 | $ 792($% 7.92
73 [LOCK JOCK SHORTS, BAUER, VAPOR ELITE SENIOR COMPRESSION 1 PR $ 14.46 | $ 14.46 | $ 2750 ($ 27.50
74 |[LONG SLEEVE CREW, BAUER, VAPOR CORE COMPRESSION SENIOR, MENS 1 EA $ 14.46 | $ 14.46 | $ 2000 [ $ 20.00
75 |[LONG SLEEVE GRIP CREW, BAUER, VAPOR PREMIUM, SENIOR, MENS 1 EA $ 14.46 | $ 14.46 | $ 2750 $ 27.50

N/A N/A
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION
Net 30 Days Net 15 Days
Factory
AS NEEDED AS NEEDED
720372 UAH2010
September 30, 2011 September 30, 2011
Notes

AWARD NOTES

THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

RESPONSES OF EQUAL VALUE ARE INDICATED BY BOLD FONT IN THE TABLE ABOVE AND WILL BE AWARDED BASED UPON THE MOST ADVANTAGEOUS PAYMENT TERMS

Bid Bond Y/N
FOB Point
Terms
Warranty
Delivery

Your Reference No.

Quotation Effective

Line Item Low Bid

Line Item Low Vendor

$ 1,042.00 Great Skate
1,095.00 SkateWorld
46.26 Great Skate
71.30 Great Skate
$ 30.00 Great Skate
$ 37.60 Great Skate
$ 37.60 Great Skate
$ 20.00 Great Skate
$ 43.37 Great Skate
$ 43.37 Great Skate
$ 18.00 Great Skate
$ 18.00 Great Skate
$ 44.95 SkateWorld
$ 101.20 Great Skate
$ 11.56 Great Skate
$ 11.56 Great Skate
$ 10.11 Great Skate
$ 10.11 Great Skate
$ 37.60 Great Skate
$ 20.23 Great Skate
$ 23.13 Great Skate
$ 6.65 Great Skate
$ 14.46 Great Skate
$ 14.46 Great Skate
$ 14.46 Great Skate
[ Total Low Bid | Total Low Vendor |
[ NO AWARD | NO AWARD |
[ DATE COMPLETED | BUYER |
| 8/13/2010 | MAA |
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Great Skate SkateWorld
Item Description Qty | UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
76 |SHORT SLEEVE CREW, BAUER, VAPOR CORE COMPRESSION SENIOR, MENS 1 EA $ 1446 | $ 14.46 | $ 1750 | $ 17.50
77 |SHORT SLEEVE GRIP CREW, BAUER, VAPOR PREMIUM, SENIOR, MENS 1 EA $ 1446 | $ 1446 [ $ 2250 (% 22.50
78 |SLIDE SANDAL, BAUER HOCKEY PLAYER, MENS 1 EA $ 7.00|$ 7.00($ 828 |$ 8.28
79 |WARM UP JACKET, BAUER, MENS 1 EA $ 1750 | $ 1750 [ $ 2030 [ $ 20.30
80 |WARM UP PANT, BAUER, MENS 1 EA $ 14.16 | $ 1416 [ $ 1691 | $ 16.91
81 |DUFFLE BAG, BAUER, #1033148 1 EA $ 11.60 | $ 1160 | $ 13.80 | $ 13.80
82 |GOAL HARDWARE BOX, BAUER, #1034125 1 EA $ 105.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 105.00
83 |GOALIE BAG, BAUER, DELUXE SENIOR CARRY 1 EA $ 40.00 [ $ 40.00 | $ 25.00 [ $ 25.00
84 |GOALIE MASK BAG, BAUER, PADDED 1 EA $ 30.00 [ $ 30.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 30.00
85 [HELMET PARTS KIT, BAUER, #1036450 CONSISTS OF: 1 EA $ 55.00 [ $ 55.00 NO BID NO BID
86 |HOCKEY PUCK BAG, BAUER 1 EA $ 12.00 | $ 12.00 [ $ 1250 | $ 12.50
87 |HOCKEY TAPE, COMP-O-STIK, CLEAR PLASTIC 72/CASE 1 EA $ 86.40 [ $ 86.40 NO BID NO BID
88 |STICK TAPE, COMP-O-STIK, BLACK 81/CASE 1 EA $ 149.85 | $ 149.85 NO BID NO BID
89 [STICK TAPE, COMP-O-STIK, WHITE 81/CASE 1 EA $ 109.35 | $ 109.35 NO BID NO BID

N/A N/A
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION
Net 30 Days Net 15 Days
Factory
AS NEEDED AS NEEDED
720372 UAH2010
September 30, 2011 September 30, 2011
Notes

AWARD NOTES
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
RESPONSES OF EQUAL VALUE ARE INDICATED BY BOLD FONT IN THE TABLE ABOVE AND WILL BE AWARDED BASED UPON THE MOST ADVANTAGEOUS PAYMENT TERMS

Bid Bond Y/N
FOB Point
Terms
Warranty
Delivery

Your Reference No.

Quotation Effective

Line Item Low Bid

Line Item Low Vendor

$ 14.46 Great Skate

$ 14.46 Great Skate

$ 7.00 Great Skate

$ 17.50 Great Skate

$ 14.16 Great Skate

$ 11.60 Great Skate

$ 105.00 SkateWorld

$ 25.00 SkateWorld

$ 30.00 Great Skate

$ 55.00 Great Skate

$ 12.00 Great Skate

$ 86.40 Great Skate

$ 149.85 Great Skate

$ 109.35 Great Skate
| Total Low Bid | Total Low Vendor |
[ NO AWARD | NO AWARD |
[ DATE COMPLETED | BUYER |
| 8/13/2010 | MAA
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