Flexible Storage System and Workstation (B001988) page 1 of 1

Ace Computers Adv Clustering Tech Aprisa Tech CDW-G Global GovEd
Item Description Qty [ uOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 |Flexible Storage System — Expansion 1 EA |$ 5,399.00 | $ 5,399.00 | $ 6,663.75 | $ 6,663.75 | $ 5,888.00 | $ 5,888.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 5,399.00 NO AWARD
2 |Workstation/Server, Horizon 8X5502 1 EA |$ 10,699.00 | $ 10,699.00 | $ 12,247.12 | $ 12,247.12 | $ 11,888.88 | $ 11,888.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 10,699.00 NO AWARD
3 |10FT Power Cable (C13/ C14) — Black, #15-01-14117 1 EA |$ 7.00 | $ 7.00($ 451 $ 4.51 Included Included NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4.51 NO AWARD
4 |2V LCD Sliding Rackmount Stand — Supports 15IN — 19IN LCD Monitors and Standard Keyboard, #35-10-14701 1 EA | $ 955.00 | $ 955.00 | $ 40523 | $ 405.23 [ $ 728.00 | $ 728.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 405.23 NO AWARD
5 |17-inch LCD Monitor, 1280x1024 w/VGA, #35-20-15528 1 EA Included Included $ 155.25 | $ 155.25 Included Included NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 155.25 NO AWARD
6 |16IN Keyboard with 104 Keys and Touchpad for 2U RM System, #50-00-16319 1 EA Included Included $ 13591 | $ 135.91 Included Included NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 135.91 NO AWARD
7 |10FT 3-IN-1 SXGA and PS/2 Desktop Extension Cable, #50-30-14995 1 EA |$ 6.00 | $ 6.00 [ $ 12.08 | $ 12.08 | $ 24.00 [ $ 24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 6.00 NO AWARD
8 |6FT USB 2.0 A TO A Male/Female Extension Cable (BLACK), #50-30-16338 1 EA |$ 150 $ 150 | $ 193|$ 1.93|$ 6.00 | $ 6.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.50 NO AWARD
9 |6FT SUPER VGA M/F Monitor Cable, #50-30-16360 1 EA |$ 275 $ 275($ 388 |$ 388 (% 16.88 | $ 16.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2.75 NO AWARD
10 |2U 2200VA Rackmount UPS W/20A 120V (5-20R) Input, Interface Port DB-9 RS-232, Smartslot, USB, #15-12-13481 1 EA |$ 960.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 1,024.65 | $ 1,024.65 | $ 848.00 | $ 848.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 848.00 NO AWARD
[ Total Low Bid [ Total Low Vendor |
[ noep s 1603025 | _Ace Computers ]
N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Bid Bond Y/N
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB Point
Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Terms
See Bid Specifications See Bid Specifications See Bid Specifications See Bid Specifications See Bid Specifications Warranty
15-20 business days ARO 20 Days ARO Delivery
2742760.1 08160-1 Your Reference No.
November 13, 2010 November 13, 2010 November 13, 2010 November 13, 2010 November 13, 2010 Quotation Effective
Notes

AWARD NOTES
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "TOTAL LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
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