Sun Fire x4270 Servers (B001982)

CDW-G Consonus LH Computer Svcs Pomeroy IT Solutions*

Item Description Qty | UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost [ Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 |SUN FIRE X4270 SERVER WITH 6 HARD DRIVES AND SUN INTEL XEON QC X5570 2.93GHz 2 EA | $10,510.50 | $ 21,021.00 | $11,504.04 [ $ 23,008.08 NO BID NO BID $ 8,139.75 | $ 16,279.50 | $ 16,279.50 | Pomeroy IT Solutions*
2 |SUN FIRE X4270 SERVER WITH 12 DRIVES AND SUN INTEL XEON QC E5570 2.26GHz 2| EA[$ 8007.25[$% 16,01450| $12,698.73|$  25,397.46 NO BID NO BID $10,75791 [$ 2151582 |$% 16,014.50 CDW-G

Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
$ 37,035.50 $ 48,405.54 NO BID | $ 37,795.32 | $ 37,035.50 NO AWARD
N/A N/A N/A N/A Bid Bond Y/N
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB Point
Net 30 Sub]e_(j to Online Terms and Net 30 Terms
Conditions
Per Bid Specifications Per Bid Specifications Per Bid Specifications Per Bid Specifications Warranty
2-10 Business Days 10-15 Days 2 Weeks Delivery
TWX2034 Your Reference No.
September 18, 2010 September 18, 2010 September 18, 2010 September 18, 2010 Quotation Effective
Notes Item 1 - Bidder references
"Premier System and OS
Support" in lieu of Sun Silver
Support
Item 2 - Bidder references
"Premier System and OS
Support" in lieu of Sun Silver
Support
Item 2 - Bidder has reduced the
Qty of Sun Arm for Sun Cable
Management from 3 ea to 2 ea
AWARD NOTES
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM LOW TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
VENDOR NAMES WITH ASTERIKS (*) REFER TO "NOTES" AREA OF TABULATION
| DATE COMPLETED] BUYER
| 6/28/2010 [ MAA
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