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17th Street Photo Supply* Business Services* Focus Camera* Long's Electronics Markertek
Item Description Qty | UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 [Lens Hood For 24-70 f/2.8KL SX 42U, Canon MFG # 8021A001 1 EA [ $ 50.00 | $ 50.00 [ $ 59.98 | $ 59.98 | $ 49.94 [ $ 49.94 53.00 | $ 53.00 NO BID NO BID $ 49.50 WB Hunt Company*
2 |Lens, Zoom Wide-Angle Telephoto, EF 24-70mm f/2.8L USM Autofocus, Canon MFG # 8014A002 1 EA | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,429.98 | $ 1,429.98 | $ 1,297.94 | $ 1,297.94 1,445.00 | $ 1,445.00 NO BID NO BID $ 1,240.25 WB Hunt Company*
3 _|Large-Format Printer, Stylus Pro 7900 Epson MFG # SP7900HDR 1 EA | $ 4,000.00 [ $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,389.98 | $ 4,389.98 [ $ 3,583.00 | $ 3,583.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $ 3,470.00 Valley Litho Supply
4 |Mono Stand Jr, With Counter Weight — 6FT, Arkay AR6JRCW 1 EA | $ 540.00 [ $ 540.00 | $ 629.98 | $ 629.98 | $ 559.94 [ $ 559.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 493.05 WB Hunt Company*
5 |Adapter For Majestic 1900 Series Head to a Mono Stand Jr, 1-7/8" Diameter 1| EA S 25.00 [ $ 25.00 [ $ 39.98 [ $ 39.98 [ $ 2794 [ $ 27.94 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID $ 22.15 WB Hunt Company*
6 |Tripod Gearhead, Arkay MJ-1901 1 EA | $ 288.00 [ $ 288.00 [ $ 309.98 [ $ 309.98 [ $ 258.94 [ $ 258.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 258.94 Focus Camera*
7 |Tripod w/ 2-Way Fluid-Effect Head, P500 Pinnacle Digital Economy Supports 5 LB (2.3 KG), Smith-Victor 2| EA S 280.00 | $ 560.00 [ $ 39.98 | $ 79.96 [ $ 21.94 [ $ 43.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $ 43.50 WB Hunt Company*
8 [Light Meter, Digital Incident, Reflected and Flash L-308S Flashmate, Sekonic 1| EA S 194.00 | $ 19400 | $ 22998 [ $ 22998 [ $ 178.94 | $ 178.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 169.00 WB Hunt Company*
9 [Condenser Enlarger With Baseboard, 23CIII-XL Beseler 2 EA [$ 880.00 [ $ 1,760.00 | $ 1,249.98 | $ 2,499.96 | $ 948.00 [ $ 1,896.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,675.90 WB Hunt Company*
10 |Digital Enlarging Timer, ET-500, Omega 2 EA | $ 210.00 [ $ 420.00 | $ 22998 [ $ 459.96 | $ 21494 [ $ 429.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 420.00 | 17th Street Photo Supply*
| Total Low Bid | Total Low Vendor
$ 9,137.00 $ 10,129.74 $ 8,326.40 $ 1,498.00 | $ - | $ 7,975.80 | NO AWARD
N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Bid Bond Y/N
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB Point
NET 30 NET 10 NET 30 NET 30 Terms
US WARRANTY 1 YEAR STD MFG STD MFG Warranty
10 DAYS ARO 7 - 45 DAYS ARO Delivery
AL20100628-967 Your Reference No.
September 29, 2010 September 29, 2010 September 29, 2010 September 29, 2010 September 29, 2010 Quotation Effective
Notes | Item 1 - Bidder references Item 5 - Bidder references Model | Item 5 - Bidder note "(per
H#EWB83F #1200, MFG# 000345 addendum)"
Item 6 - Bidder references Model | Item 6 - Bidder note "(per
#1201, MFG# 81201 addendum)"
Item 7 - Bidder references MFG#
700155
AWARD NOTES
BIDDERS THAT DID NOT RESPOND TO ALL ITEMS WERE REMOVED FROM TOTAL LOW ANALYSIS
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
BID RESPONSES AND BIDDERS HIGHLIGHTED IN YELLOW INDICATE AWARD RESULTS
VENDOR NAMES WITH ASTERIKS (*) REFER TO "NOTES" AREA OF TABULATION
[ DATE COMPLETED | BUYER
[ 7/13/2010 [ MAA
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Valley Litho Supply

WB Hunt Company*

Item Description Qty [ UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost | Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 |Lens Hood For 24-70 f/2.8KL SX 42U, Canon MFG # 8021A001 1| EA NO BID NO BID $ 49.50 | $ 49.50 | $ 49.50 WB Hunt Company*
2 |Lens, Zoom Wide-Angle Telephoto, EF 24-70mm f/2.8L USM Autofocus, Canon MFG # 8014A002 1| EA NO BID NO BID $ 1,240.25 | $ 1,240.25 | $ 1,240.25 WB Hunt Company*
3 |Large-Format Printer, Stylus Pro 7900 Epson MFG # SP7900HDR 1| EA 3,470.00 | $ 3,470.00 | $ 3,565.85 | $ 3,5665.85 | $ 3,470.00 Valley Litho Supply
4 |Mono Stand Jr, With Counter Weight — 6FT, Arkay AR6JRCW 1| EA NO BID NO BID $ 493.05 | $ 493.05 | $ 493.05 WB Hunt Company*
5 |Adapter For Majestic 1900 Series Head to a Mono Stand Jr, 1-7/8" Diameter 1| EA NO BID NO BID $ 22.15 [ $ 22.15 [ $ 22.15 WB Hunt Company*
6 |Tripod Gearhead, Arkay MJ-1901 1| EA NO BID NO BID $ 294.40 | $ 294.40 | $ 258.94 Focus Camera*

7 |Tripod w/ 2-Way Fluid-Effect Head, P500 Pinnacle Digital Economy Supports 5 LB (2.3 KG), Smith-Victor 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 21.75 [ $ 4350 | $ 43.50 WB Hunt Company*
8 [Light Meter, Digital Incident, Reflected and Flash L-308S Flashmate, Sekonic 1 EA NO BID NO BID $ 169.00 | $ 169.00 | $ 169.00 WB Hunt Company*
9 [Condenser Enlarger With Baseboard, 23ClII-XL Beseler 2 EA 844.00 | $ 1,688.00 | $ 837.95 | $ 1,675.90 | $ 1,675.90 WB Hunt Company*
10 |Digital Enlarging Timer, ET-500, Omega 2 | EA 222.00 | $ 444.00 | $ 21110 [ $ 42220 $ 420.00 | 17th Street Photo Supply*
Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
$ 5,602.00 | $ 7,975.80 | $ 7,975.80 NO AWARD
N/A N/A Bid Bond Y/N
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB Point
NET 30 N 30 DOI Terms
MFG 1 YEAR PARTS AND LABOR |Warranty
5 DAYS 10 - 21 DAYS ARO Delivery
JSB061810 24756 Your Reference No.
September 29, 2010 September 29, 2010 Quotation Effective
Notes Item 5 - Bidder note "1 7/8" Dia
#605757"
Item 6 - Bidder note "#1901 1 7/8"
Dia #603672"
AWARD NOTES
BIDDERS THAT DID NOT RESPOND TO ALL ITEMS WERE REMOVED FROM TOTAL LOW ANALYSIS
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
BID RESPONSES AND BIDDERS HIGHLIGHTED IN YELLOW INDICATE AWARD RESULTS
VENDOR NAMES WITH ASTERIKS (*) REFER TO "NOTES" AREA OF TABULATION
DATE COMPLETED BUYER
7/13/2010 MAA
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