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AVI-SPL* Building Systems Tech Business Services* MarkerTek Video Supply Multi-Media Solutions
Item Description Qty | UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Line Item Low Bid [ Line Item Low Vendor
1 |TV, PHILIPS 32" COMMERCIAL FLAT LCD HD MODEL #32HFL5860D 28| EA | $ 685.00 [$  19,180.00 | $ 756.00 [$  21,168.00 | $ 449.98 | $  12,599.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 12,599.44 NO AWARD
2 |SMARTMOUNT TILT WALL-MOUNT, PEERLESS MODEL #ST640 23| EA [$ 65.00 [ $ 1,495.00 | $ 80.65 [ $ 1,854.95 | $ 7398 [ $ 1,701.54 8995 [ $ 2,068.85 NO BID NO BID $ 1,495.00 NO AWARD
3 |TV, PHILIPS 32" PROFESSIONAL FLAT LCD HD #32HFL5460D 40| EA | $ 660.00 [$  26,400.00 | $ 698.90 [$  27,956.00 | $ 469.98 | $  18,799.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 18,799.20 NO AWARD
4 |TV, SAMSUNG 32" HOSPITALITY LCD HDTV PRO:IDIOM MODEL #LN32C459E1GXZA 9 EA | $ 660.00 | $ 5,940.00 | $ 635.00 | $ 5,715.00 | $ 489.98 | $ 4,409.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4,945.50 Valiant Products
5 |WALL MOUNT, UNIVERSAL TILT, FOR 23" TO 46" LCD SCREENS, PEERLESS MODEL #ST64| 9 | EA | $ 65.00 [ $ 585.00 | $ 8175 [ $ 735.75 | $ 7398 [ $ 665.82 89.95 [ $ 809.55 NO BID NO BID $ 585.00 AVI-SPL*
6 |ELECTRONICS TOWER, PEERLESS MODEL #PM610G 1 EA | $ 125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 305.00 [ $ 305.00 | $ 139.98 [ $ 139.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 125.00 AVI-SPL*
[ Total Low Bid [ Total Low Vendor |
[ noBD [s 6917.16 | NOAWARD |
N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Bid Bond Y/N
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB Point
NET 30 Days NET 30 Days NET 10 NET 30 Days Terms
MFG or AS SPECIFIED IN MFG or AS SPECIFIED IN MFG or AS SPECIFIED IN MFG or AS SPECIFIED IN MFG or AS SPECIFIED IN Warranty
7 - 14 Days 30 Days ARO 15 - 20 Days ARO 7 10 Days ARO Delivery
255752-A B001980 Your Reference No.
September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010 Quotation Effective
Notes | ITEM 1 - ALTERNATE QUOTED, | ITEM 1 - ALTERNATE QUOTED, | ITEM 1 - ALTERNATE QUOTED,
MODEL #32HFL5561V MODEL #32HFL5561V/27 MODEL #32PFL3504D
ITEM 3 - ALTERNATE QUOTED, | ITEM 3 - ALTERNATE QUOTED, | ITEM 3 - ALTERNATE QUOTED,
MODEL #32HFL4461F MODEL #32HFL4461F/27 MODEL #32MF339B
ITEM 4 - ALTERNATE QUOTED,
MODEL #LN32C450
AWARD NOTES
BIDDERS THAT DID NOT RESPOND TO ALL ITEMS WERE REMOVED FROM TOTAL LOW ANALYSIS
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
VENDOR NAMES WITH ASTERIKS (*) REFER TO "NOTES" AREA OF TABULATION
ITEM 1 - BID SPECIFIED NO ALTERNATES TO BE CONSIDERED. ALL RESPONDENTS PROVIDED ALTERNATES DUE TO MANUFACTURER DISCONTINUING ITEM. NO AWARD
ITEM 2 - NO AWARD
ITEM 3 - BID SPECIFIED NO ALTERNATES TO BE CONSIDERED. ALL RESPONDENTS PROVIDED ALTERNATES DUE TO MANUFACTURER DISCONTINUING ITEM. NO AWARD
ITEM 4 - BUSINESS SERVICES PROVIDED AN ALTERNATE WHICH DID NOT MEET THE WARRANTY SPECIFICATION AND WAS THEREFORE REMOVED FROM CONSIDERATION
| DATE COMPLETED | BUYER |
[ 9/15/2010 [ MAA |
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TeleHealth Services*

Valiant Products

Item Description Qty | UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 [TV, PHILIPS 32" COMMERCIAL FLAT LCD HD MODEL #32HFL5860D 28| EA | $ 74780 |$ 20,938.40 | $ 549.50 | $  15,386.00
2 |SMARTMOUNT TILT WALL-MOUNT, PEERLESS MODEL #ST640 23| EA |$ 82.00 | $ 1,886.00 | $ 7175 | $ 1,650.25
3 [TV, PHILIPS 32" PROFESSIONAL FLAT LCD HD #32HFL5460D 40| EA [$ 74780 |$  29,912.00 | $ 549.50 | $  21,980.00
4 |TV, SAMSUNG 32" HOSPITALITY LCD HDTV PRO:IDIOM MODEL #LN32C459E1GXZA 9 EA [$ 654.00 | $ 5,886.00 | $ 549.50 | $ 4,945.50
5 |WALL MOUNT, UNIVERSAL TILT, FOR 23" TO 46" LCD SCREENS, PEERLESS MODEL #ST64 9 | EA |$ 82.00 | $ 738.00 | $ 7175 | $ 645.75
6 |ELECTRONICS TOWER, PEERLESS MODEL #PM610G 1 EA [$ 150.00 | $ 150.00 [ $ 151.10 | $ 151.10

$ 8,660.00 $ 7,392.60
N/A N/A
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION
Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
2 Years Parts and Labor MFG or AS SPECIFIED IN
Philips LCDs - 2 - 3 Weeks
Samsung LCDs - 6 - 8 Weeks 45 Days ARO
UAHUNTO072810
September 30, 2010 September 30, 2010
Notes | ITEM 1 - ALTERNATE QUOTED, | ITEM 1 - ALTERNATE QUOTED,

AWARD NOTES
BIDDERS THAT DID NOT RESPOND TO ALL ITEMS WERE REMOVED FROM TOTAL LOW ANALYSIS
THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY "LINE ITEM LOW" TO THE APPARENT, LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

VENDOR NAMES WITH ASTERIKS (*) REFER TO "NOTES" AREA OF TABULATION

MODEL #32HFL5561V

Samsung MODEL
#LN32C459E1GXZA

ITEM 3 - ALTERNATE QUOTED,
MODEL #32HFL5561V

ITEM 3 - ALTERNATE QUOTED,
Samsung MODEL

Bid Bond Y/N
FOB Point
Terms
Warranty

Delivery

Your Reference No.

Quotation Effective

#LN32C459E1GXZA

ITEM 4 - ALTERNATE QUOTED,
MODEL #LN32C459G1HXZA

ITEM 1 - BID SPECIFIED NO ALTERNATES TO BE CONSIDERED. ALL RESPONDENTS PROVIDED ALTERNATES DUE TO MANUFACTURER DISCONTINUING ITEM. NO AWARD

ITEM 2 - NO AWARD

ITEM 3 - BID SPECIFIED NO ALTERNATES TO BE CONSIDERED. ALL RESPONDENTS PROVIDED ALTERNATES DUE TO MANUFACTURER DISCONTINUING ITEM. NO AWARD
ITEM 4 - BUSINESS SERVICES PROVIDED AN ALTERNATE WHICH DID NOT MEET THE WARRANTY SPECIFICATION AND WAS THEREFORE REMOVED FROM CONSIDERATION

Line Item Low Bid

Line Item Low Vendor

$ 12,599.44 NO AWARD

$ 1,495.00 NO AWARD

$ 18,799.20 NO AWARD

$ 4,945.50 Valiant Products

$ 585.00 AVI-SPL*

$ 125.00 AVI-SPL*

Total LowBid [  Total Low Vendor |

$ 6,917.16 | NO AWARD |
[ DATE COMPLETED | BUYER |
| 9/15/2010 [ MAA |
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