Electronix
Hensley Newark in Holzberg Express RSR
Technologies, Huntsville Allied Newark TestEquity | Communications, Business |Electronics,
Oscilloscope (B001979) Inc. Angie Sullivan |Electronics Inc.| Chris Binion LLC Inc. Tevet LLC Services |Inc.
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Item Qty Description
Agilent Technologies Modular
Oscilloscope Mfr. Part #
U2701A, USB, 2 channels,
1) 10|100MHz, 500 Msa/S/CH $999.00 $1,015.00 $1,011.98 $1,176.93 $1,060.00 $1,389.00 $1,358.00 $1,499.98 No bid
Total Price for 10 pcs $9,990.00 $10,150.00 $10,119.80 $11,769.30 $10,600.00 $13,890.00 $13,580.00 | 14,999.80
Picoscope Mfr part #PP479
4424 Bundle includes Scope, 4
2) 1|Probes and a carrying case $1,279.00 $1,020.95 $1,199.00 $1,089.01 No bid 1,539.00 No bid 1,549.98 No bid
Total Price $11,269.00 $11,170.95 $11,318.80 $12,858.31 $10,600.00 $15,429.00 $13,580.00 $16,549.78
FOB UAHuntsville | UAHuntsville | UAHuntsville | UAHuntsville |UAHuntsvill UAHuntsville UAHuntsvill | UAHuntsville
Terms Net30 Net30 Net30 Net30 Net30 Net 30 Net 10 Net 10
U2701A 1year | #1,3years
& PP4795 factory, #2,5 pass-thru
Warranty years manuf. years factory |1 years factory | manufacturers' 1years 1vyears 1vyears 1vyears
#1 6 in stock 5
weeks, #2 in stock -3 4 weeks
Estimated Delivery 2 week ARO stock 3 days | 5 weeks ARO weeks ARO, 30days ARO, 15-20, ARO,
Your Reference No. 16732490-01 |201004220073 162097 2063
Quotation Effective Until 90 days 7/2/2010 6/22/2010 30 days 7/20/2010 6/25/2010 30 days
Business Classification LB LB LB DV/uz
Bid awarded per line item to Hensley Technologies, Inc. for item 1 and Newark for item 2 as the lowest responsible bidders meeting specifications.
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