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14 3 450.00

Helicopters (B001978) Chopper Shots R/C Hobbies

Item Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 3 Maxi Joker 3 – with tlvbar 1,399.95 4,199.85 1,750.00 5,250.00
2 4 Tail servo - Futaba BLS251 149.00 596.00 149.99 599.96
3 12 Servos - Futaba BLS451 109.95 1,319.40 99.99 1,199.88
4 3 Spartan ds760 Qvro 179.95 539.85 200.00 600.00
5 3 Xera 4035/3Y -400 Main Motor 220.00 660.00 275.00 825.00
6 3 Kontronic Power Jive – ESC 539.95 1,619.85 675.00 2,025.00
7 1 ProQram Card I& II 59.90 59.90 100.00 100.00
8 3 Tail Blades -110mm 29.00 87.00 40.00 120.00

9 3
Main Blades - 800mm (semi-
symmetrical) 159.95 479.85 300.00 900.00

10 3 Fromeco regulator and switch 76.00 228.00 150.00 450.00
11 12 Hvperion G3 6500mAH 22.2V * 499.00 5,988.00 251.84 3,022.08
12 12 Hvperion L1FEP04 Receiver Pac 28.95 347.40 60.00 720.00
13

11
Power Pole Connectors 45A (4 blk
red)

. 4 
15.95 175.45 10.00 110.00

14 3 Futaba 8FGH 449.95449.95 1,349.851,349.85 450.00 1,350.001,350.00
15 3 Build, calibrate and test fly 1,045.00 3,135.00 2,500.00 7,500.00
16 3 Crating 200.00 600.00 no bid no bid
17 1 Shipping 525.00 525.00 no bid no bid

* Alternate:  Thun
8uOmAH

der Power 6 S 
 22.2V 21,910.40 24,771.92 

FOB UAHuntsville UAHuntsville
TERMS delivery  30 days
WARRANTY Manufacture state warranty per manufacturer
ESTIMATED DELIVERY 3 weeks from receiving deposit 30-60 days
YOUR REFERENCE NO. 1224
QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 6/27/2010 6/26/2010
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB SB
BID AWARDED TO CHOPPER SHOTS AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEET SPECS.
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