Medical Equipment Midwest Medical Supply BUY Indian
(B001965) Product Unlimited, Inc. Henry Schein, Inc. Co. LLC QuadMed, Inc Medco Supply Medical Moore Medical
Item |Qty Description
POCKETNURSE Original # SUB # SUB # SUB # SUB # SUB #
Ophthalmoscope/ Welch Allyn Welch Allyn W/A 76791
1 2 Ototscopes for Exam 01-70-9520| 76791-22MPX 3,028.64 76792-M 1,779.42 | 22MPX 2,990.94 1,468.82 79520 1,289.46 3,404.00 0.00
EConoline fiiuminator, 2 WoIT X-Ray
2 | 2 |Bank 11-91-102D #29602 464.70 Wolf WF29602 436.56 |AMS502D 923.92 667.80 267538 1,217.12 799.60 63348 652.00
3 | 2 Tanita Infant Scale 04-33-1584 Tanita # 1584 347.62 #1584 354,52 | TAN1584 523.64 375.00 no bid 0.00 641.60 77564 275.00
4 BCI Hana-Helda Puise
3 |Oximeter 591883 1,286.34 #3301 1,323.51 |BCI3301 1,272.15 1,095.00 267872 489.93 1,464.60 48191 1,200.00
McKesson #
600234
5 | 8 |Military-time Wall Clock | 09-50-7010, UNV-11431 243.12 no bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 213.04 no bid 0.00 533.60 0.00
Nicolet Elite 3 &
marketLab Summit Doppler 5 MHz
retal vionitor IVIKKIVILE / Z
6 1 (marketLab) ML6723 # FGPKG1 6,215.32 # ED35R 760.88 |3 8,392.38 9,855.71 no bid 0.00 6,352.00 0.00
Moore Medical
Pediatric Blood Pressure G/F 100-
7 15 |cuffs 66298 207.90 HSI#1516984 134.25 001NCHI 79.20 94.35 41379 123.30 200.70 142.50
Adult Large Blood G/F 100-
8 | 20 Pressure cuffs 66307 351.60 HSi#1513398 192.40 001NLA 114.00 149.80 41382 187.00 349.60 245.80
FILAC Electronic Kendall #
9 | 8 Thermometers 68435 202000 1,935.76 #20200 1,844.88 | KEN202000 1,844.80 1,844.88 263910 1,866.64 2,147.20 1,742.40
10 | 40 |Dual Head Stethoscopes 66243 181.20 HSi#1017535 156.80 G/F400BL 72.40 147.20 268376 261.20 194.40 115.60
11 One Touch Ultra Lifescan #
4 | Glucose Meters 65091 020247 297.52 #020-247 255.80 |LIFO20-247 261.88 68.12 560041 257.52 296.80 244.44
ARJO Inc.
Maximove Patient Lift, ARJKMCLU
12 | 1 |ARJO Inc. KMCLUN-D 9,387.99 no bid 0.00 N-D 10,359.15 0.00 no bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
23,947.71 7,239.02 26,834.46 15,979.72 5,692.17 16,384.10 4,617.74
Shipping Free GND
UAHuntsvill UAHuntsvill UAHuntsvill
FOB e UAHuntsville UAHuntsville | UAHuntsville UAHuntsville e e
TERMS Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Varies thru
WARRANTY mfg. mfg. 1year 1year mfg.
35 ARO on
ESTIMATED DELIVERY 3 weeks stocdk items 30 days 7 days 6 days ARO 7 days
YOUR REFERENCE HIS Bid
NO. 32982 100276676 042410AK 314004
QUOTATION
EFFECTIVE UNTIL 60 days 12/31/2010 9/1/2010 5/24/2010 180 days
BUSINESS
CLASSIFICATION SB LB WB LB
BID IS AWARDED TO THE LOWEST PRICE FROM THE RESPONSIBLE BIDDER
MEETING SPECS.
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