Adobe CS4 Web Premium & Var ACAD Software Pkgs (B001930)

Business Services CDW-G Computer Intelligence Assoc Dell Marketing En Pointe Technologies
Item Description Qty [ UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 ADOBE CREATIVE SUITE 4 WEB PREMIUM 29 EA |[$ 483.98 | $ 14,035.42 | $ 386.69 | $ 11,214.00 | $ 270.15 | $ 7,834.35 | $ 353.80 | $ 10,260.09 | $ 374.99 | $§ 10,874.71 | $ 11,214.00 CDW-G
2 MICROSOFT OFFICE PROFESSIONAL PLUS 2007 110 | EA |$ 73.98 S 8,137.80 | $ 65.00 [ $ 7,150.00 NO BID NO BID S 63.07 [ $ 6,937.70 [ $ 62.58 [ S 6,883.80 | $ 7,007.00 Global GovEd (TLP)
3 MICROSOFT OFFICE STANDARD 2007 20 | EA [$ 59.98 [ $ 1,199.60 | $ 49.92 | $ 998.40 NO BID NO BID S 4847 (S 969.40 | $ 48.09 | $ 961.80 | $ 979.20 Global GovEd (TLP)
4 MICROSOFT OFFICE VISIO PROFESSIONAL 2007 15 | EA [$ 69.98 [ S 1,049.70 | $ 61.55 [ S 923.25 NO BID NO BID S 59.75 [ S 896.25 | $ 59.29 [ $ 889.35 | $ 905.40 Global GovEd (TLP)
5 MICROSOFT WINDOWS 7 PROFESSIONAL - UPGRADE | 65 | EA |$ 66.98 | S 4,353.70 [ § 58.65 | $ 3,812.25 NO BID NO BID S 56.81 [ S 3,692.65 | $ 56.37 [ $ 3,664.05 | $ 3,727.75 Global GovEd (TLP)
[ TotalLowBid |  TotalLowVendor |
[s 2327371 [$ 20,808.75 | Logisoft Computer (TLP) |
N Y N N N Bid Bond Y/N
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB Point
Net 10 Net 30 30 Days Net Net 30 days Net 30 days @ 0% Terms
1vyr STD Software Waranty Manufacturer MFG Standard \Warranty
15-20 ARO 2-10 days 5 days ARO 7 - 14 days ARO 7 days Delivery
SVF6455 B001930 1413732 NA Your Reference No.
May 28, 2010 May 28, 2010 May 28, 2010 May 28, 2010 May 28, 2010 Quotation Effective
Notes | Item 1 noted as #65018020 by bidder. Extended total cost for item 1 includes $20 Extended cost reflects $352.46 unit cost and | Item 1 noted as Part #65017406AE02A00
additional cost for 1 media disc to $25.99 additional cost for 1 media disc. by bidder.
accompany the licenses.
Delivery - In stock item - Most shipped same
day order is placed. Out of stock item - 2-10
days ARO, subject to availability.
Adobe CS4 Web Premium & Var ACAD Software Pkgs (B001930)
Global GovEd (TLP) Global GovEd (CLP) Logisoft Computer (TLP) Logisoft Computer (CLP)
Item Description Qty [ UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 ADOBE CREATIVE SUITE 4 WEB PREMIUM 29 | EA [$ 1,547.59 | $ 44,880.11 | $ 1,407.34 | $ 40,812.86 | $ 395.00 [ $ 11,455.00 | $ 365.69 | $ 10,605.01 $ 11,214.00 CDW-G
2 MICROSOFT OFFICE PROFESSIONAL PLUS 2007 110 | EA [$ 63.70 [ $ 7,007.00 NO BID NO BID S 67.00 [ $ 7,370.00 | $ 67.00 [ $ 7,370.00 $ 7,007.00 Global GovEd (TLP)
3 MICROSOFT OFFICE STANDARD 2007 20 EA |$ 48.96 | $ 979.20 NO BID NO BID S 51.54 [ $ 1,030.80 | $ 51.54 [ $ 1,030.80 $ 979.20 Global GovEd (TLP)
4 MICROSOFT OFFICE VISIO PROFESSIONAL 2007 15| EA |$ 60.36 | $ 905.40 NO BID NO BID $ 6353 |$ 952.95 | $ 6353 |$ 952.95 $ 979.20 Global GovEd (TLP)
5 MICROSOFT WINDOWS 7 PROFESSIONAL - UPGRADE 65 EA |$ 57.35[$ 3,727.75 NO BID NO BID S 60.40 | $ 3,926.00 | $ 60.40 [ $ 3,926.00 $ 3,727.75 Global GovEd (TLP)
[ TotalLowBid |  TotalLowVendor |
[s 20,808.75 |_Logisoft Computer (TLP) |
Y Y Y Y Bid Bond Y/N
UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB Point
0% Disc/Net 30 Days 0% Disc/Net 30 Days Net 30 Net 30 Terms
MFG Standard MFG Standard \Warranty
1-5 business days ARO 1-5 business days ARO 5-7 business days 5-7 business days Delivery
Ticket #13575 Ticket #13575 Your Reference No.
May 28, 2010 May 28,2010 Exceptions quoted Exceptions quoted Quotation Effective
Item 1 noted as Part #65017406AD02A00 + | Item 1 noted as Part #65017406AD02A00 + | Item 1 - 2 Year Optional Adobe Ugrade Plan | Item 1 - 2 Year Optional Adobe Ugrade Plan
Notes |65017366ADO0A00 by bidder. 65017366AD0O0A00 by bidder. quoted for additional $139.43 each quoted for additional $127.50 each

For CLP pricing you will be required to fill out
an online application and place the first order
within 30 days. After which there is no further
obligation.

Pricing for CS4 Version only guaranteed as
long as Adobe offers version. New version
release scheduled before 05/28/2010

Pricing for CS4 Version only guaranteed as
long as Adobe offers version. New version
release scheduled before 05/28/2010

BID AWARDED BY LINE ITEM LOW TO THE LOWEST, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEEETING SPECIFICATIONS
ALL RESPONSES THAT WERE SPECIFIED AS CLP LICENSES ARE REMOVED FROM CONSIDERATION, SINCE MAJORITY OF RESPONSES WERE BID AS TLP LICENSES
COMPUTER INTELLIGENCE ASSOCIATION, DELL MARKETING, AND EN POINTE TECHNOLOGIES WERE REMOVED FROM CONSIDERATION DUE TO NONCOMPLIANCE WITH REQUIRED BID BOND SPECIFICATION



	Tabulation

