Bid #B001925 Lead Prototype Production Unit
Time Comments
(Days)
Vendor Exhaust Exhaust
Structure Thermal Total
Assembly Assembly Cost 1 Unit 600 Units
ROUSH* 28-35 $12,166.89 $2,778.28 |S14,945.17 | $3,837.83 | $2,302,698.00 | Awarded
LetterKenny
Army Depot* 60 $7,693.63 $811.38 $8,505.01 | S5,056.73 | $3,034,038.00 | Awarded
No Bid for
Thermal
ATK Microcraft** 60 $12,807.00 No Bid - No Bid —_ Assembly
No Bid for
SES** 70 $19,764.00 $8,467.00 |S528,231.00 | $3,340.58 | $2,004,348.00 | Plenum
Assembly
SteelMasters, Pipe thickness
Inc.** 90 $7,009.00 $2,885.00 $9,894.00 No Bid — changed from

.104” to .134";
OD is same

*  Prototype effort for which UAH selects 1 to 2 suppliers to build and deliver a prototype unit.

** Vendors provided incomplete or “No” Bids.

Bid awarded to ROUSH and LetterKenny Army Depot due to cost and lead time considerations.




