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CLARITY LONG'S UANTUM XEROX AV
item Product Description MFG Product Number | Qty | UOM AVES AV BUSINESS SVCS SOLUTIONS CDW-G FOCUS CAMERA FULL COMPASS ELECTRONICS TECQHNOLOGIES VSA, INC SOLUTIONS Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 [STUDIO MONITOR IKAN #RM-8000 1| EA NO BID $ 979.99 NO BID $ 759.00 | $ 863.00 NO BID $ 1,095.88 | § 78534 | $ 1,135.00 | $ 785.34 VSA, INC
2 |VIDEO SWITCHER DATAVIDEO __|#SE-500 1] EA S 920.00 [ $ 1,029.99 NO BID $ 860.00 | $ 868.00 | $ 959.00 | $ 1,062.33 | $ 876.11 [ $ 1,135.00 | $ 876.11 VSA, INC
3 |INTERACTIVE PEN DISPLAY SMART #D370 1] EA NO BID $ 2,529.99 NO BID $ 2,448.00 NO BID NO BID $ 2,432.30 NO BID $ 2,319.00 | $ 2,319.00 | XEROX AV SOLUTIONS
4 |DVD RECORDER LG #RH399D 2 | EA NO BID $ 239.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,227.90 NO BID NO BID $ 1,227.90 | QUANTUM TECHNOLOGIES
5 |LCD MONITOR LG #M3202C-BA 3| EA S 1,935.00 | $ 629.99 $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,818.00 NO BID NO BID $ 1,887.60 | $ 2,22360 | $ 2,085.00 | $ 1,500.00 CDW-G
6 |SPEAKERS JBL #CONTROL26CT | 4 | EA [$ 460.00 | $ 159.99 NO BID $ 476.00 | $ 468.00 | $ 559.60 | $ 501.88 | $ 477.36 | $ 520.00 [ $ 477.36 VSA, INC
7 |INSTRUCTOR CAMERA SONY #BRC-300 1] EA s 3,497.00 | $ 3,889.99 $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,517.00 | $ 3,461.00 | $ 3,487.00 | $ 3,576.32 | $ 3,377.62 | $ 3,425.00 | $ 3,377.62 VSA, INC
8 |CAMERA MOUNT Il #WM-BRC-W 1] EA NO BID $ 199.99 NO BID $ 160.00 NO BID NO BID $ 13755 | $ 13512 | $ 255.00 | $ 135.12 VSA, INC
9 |[MICROPHONE AUDIX #M1245AW 4 | EA |8 964.00 | $ 355.99 NO BID $ 964.00 | $ 1,056.00 | $ 1,196.00 | $ 1,070.88 NO BID $ 1,040.00 | $ 1,040.00 | XEROX AV SOLUTIONS
10 |CAMERA CONTROLLER SONY #RM-BR300 1] EAls 1,213.00 | $ 1,459.99 | pioni | ornONE” | 1,300.00 | $ 1,296.00 | $ 1,251.00 | $ 1,319.00 | $ 1,387.04 | $ 1,164.13 | $ 1,228.00 | $ 1,164.13 VSA, INC
11 |HEADPHONES SENHELSER __|#HD280 1] EA s 86.00 | $ 99.99 $ 78.00 | $ 78.00 | $ 77.00 | 84.15 | $ 83.83 | $ 7415 |$ 103.00 [ $ 74.15 VSA, INC
12 |AUDIO MONITOR FOSTEX #RM-1 1] EA NO BID $ 419.99 NO BID $ 350.00 | $ 336.00 NO BID $ 334.37 NO BID NO BID $ 334.37 | QUANTUM TECHNOLOGIES
13 |VGA SPLITTER EXTRON #P2DAXI 3 | EA NO BID $ 169.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 92259 NO BID $ 390.00 | $ 390.00 | XEROX AV SOLUTIONS
14 |SCAN CONVERTER EXTRON #VSC500 2 | EA NO BID $ 979.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,733.36 NO BID $ 1,760.00 | $ 1,733.36 | QUANTUM TECHNOLOGIES
15 |RACK MOUNT PWR JUICE GOOSE__[#JG11.0-20A 4 | EA |s 24000 | $ 129.99 NO BID $ 360.00 | $ 376.00 NO BID $ 42048 | $ 42760 | $ 428.00 | $ 420.48 | QUANTUM TECHNOLOGIES
16 |DOCUMENT CAMERA ELMO [#EV4400AF 1] EA s 1,560.00 | $ 1,739.99 $ 1,720.74 | $ 1,728.00 | $ 1,796.00 | $ 1,759.00 | $ 1,799.34 | $ 1,562.22 | $ 1,699.00 | $ 1,562.22 VSA, INC
17 |BLACK BURST GENERATOR HORITA #BG50RM 1] EA NO BID $ 379.99 NO BID $ 255.00 | $ 241.00 NO BID $ 380.17 NO BID $ 260.00 | $ 260.00 | XEROX AV SOLUTIONS
18 |CEILING PLATE, 8x24 IN CHIEF #CMA440 2 [ EA s 160.00 | $ 89.99 $ 140.00 | $ 142.00 [ $ 158.00 | $ 186.80 | $ 154.32 | $ 134.94 | $ 250.00 | $ 134.94 VSA, INC
19 |AMPLIFIER STEWART AUDIO [#CVA 50 1] EA NO BID $ 269.99 NO BID $ 208.00 | $ 212.00 NO BID $ 200.18 NO BID $ 205.00 | $ 200.18 | QUANTUM TECHNOLOGIES
20 |AUDIO MIXER SHURE #SCMB10 2 [ EA s 2,160.00 [ $ 1,289.99 $ 3,240.00 [ $ 2,284.00 [ $ 2,356.00 | $ 2,506.00 | $ 2,634.58 [ $ 211928 [$ 2,652.00 | $ 2,119.28 VSA, INC
$ 20,131.56 Line Item Low Total
Total Low Bid [ Total Low Vendor |
13,395.00 [ $ 17,045.80 | $ 27,987.70 [ $ 11,487.74 [ $ 17,703.00 [ $ 13,519.00 [ $ 12,056.55 | $ 23,042.90 [ $ 13,357.47 [ $ 20,889.00 [ $ 23,042.90 | QUANTUM TECHNOLOGIES |
"NO BID" ITEMS “NO BID" ITEMS “NO BID" ITEMS “NO BID" ITEMS “NO BID" ITEMS “NO BID" ITEMS “NO BID" ITEMS
N N Y Y N N N Y Y Y Bid Bond Y/N
UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination FOB Point
NET 30 NET 10 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 Terms
1 YR OR BETTER 1YR PER MFG NONE STD MFG 1YR STD MFG 1 YFLQAPB?FI S& PER MFG Warranty
7-14 DAYS 15- 20 ARO 15- 30 ARO 6- 105:3 DAYS 12-14BUSDAYS | 7-31DAYSARO 5- 105:8 DAYS | 5. 30 DAYS ARO 30 DAYSARO  [Delivery
UAH-B001921 SLD2258 B001921 AL20091118-135 BID PRICE UAH-1921-1109__ | Your Reference No.
60 DAYS 30 DAYS 1/2/2010 30 D’(\;/PSE/,\\‘T,I ER BID 12/31/2009 2/2/2010 1/15/2010 90 D‘gpsaﬁm ER BID 3/1/2010 2/1/2010 Quotation Effective
ITEM 9 - ALTERNATE| ITEM 4 - ALTERNATE| VENDOR REQUIRES | TEV1C " ITEM 9 - ALTERNATE
NOTES:|QUOTED - AUDIX  |QUOTED - LG BID AWARD AS QUOTED - ELMO QUOTED - AUDIX
M1250W RC897T NOTED ABOVE il M1250W
ITEM 11 -
ALTERNATE ITEM 9 - ALTERNATE|
QUOTED - QUOTED - AUDIX
SENNHEISER HD280 [M1245A
PRO

BID AWARDED BY "TOTAL LOW" TO QUANTUM TECHNOLOGIES AS THE LOWEST, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.
BID RESPONSE FROM BUSINESS SERVICES NOT CONSIDERED, DUE TO UNFULFILLED BID BOND REQUIREMENT .
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