Sun Fire X4150 Server (B001910) Tabulation

Item Product Description [oty]uom CDW-G Qty[uoM Global GovEd Line Item Low Bid [ Line Item Low Vendor
SERVER UNIT COST EXTENDED COST UNIT COST EXTENDED COST
1 [SUN FIRE X4250 X64 2X QC RCK MNT MFG# SUN-X425-24M300-42EE 1] EA [S$ 5,125.00 | $ 5,125.00 1 [ EA NO BID NO BID $ 5,125.00 CDW-G
SUN SAS 300GB 10K 2.5IN HDD W/BRKT MFG# SUN-XRA-SS2CF-300G10K 8 [ EA [3 475.00 [ $ 3,800.00 8 | EA NO BID NO BID $ 3,800.00 CDW-G
SUN XOPT N AMERICA/ASIAN PWR CORD MFG# SUN-X311L 2 | EA [$ e - 2 [ EA NO BID NO BID NO BID CDW-G
) [ SERVER INSTALLATION GUIDE
[SUN FIRE X4250 SRV INST GUIDE TLS/DR MFG# SUN-X6369A [1] ea s 28.00]$ 28.00 1] EA [ NOBID NO BID [s 28.00 | CDW-G
3 SUPPORT SERVICE
[SUN-SVC SUP 2366783-1 MFG# SWA-SUP-2366783-1 [ 1] ea s 720.00 [ $ 720.00 1] eA [ NOBID NO BID [s 720.00 | CDW-G
SOFTWARE
4 [RED HAT ENT LNX ES STD 3Y MFG # RED-MCTO346F3 [1] ea s 2,000.00 [ $ 2,000.00 1 [ eA [ NOBID NO BID [$ 2,000.00 | CDW-G
RED ENT LNX 5,2 MEDUA F.X86/AMD64 MFG # RED-RHF0373US-R3 [ 1] ea]s 2250 | $ 22.50 1| A | nNOBID NO BID ['s 22.50 | CDW-G
[ TotalLowBid | Total Low Vendor
$ 11,695.50 NO BID ['s 11,695.50 | CDW-G
Y Bid Bond Y/N NO BID Bid Bond Y/N
UAH Destination |FOB Point UAH Destination |FOB Point
NET 30 Terms Terms
SEE NOTES Warranty Warranty
2-10*DAYS Delivery Delivery
PVS2115 Your Reference No. Your Reference No.
30 DAYS ARO Quotation Effective Quotation Effective

NOTES

WARRANTIES AS FOLLOWS:

SUN XOPT N AMERICA/ASIAN PWR

CORD - 1YR WARRANTY

SUN FIRE X4250 - 3YR WARRANTY EFFECTIVE UNTIL 10/31/2012

SUN SAS 300GB 10K 2.5IN HDD W/BRKT - 1 YR STANDARD WARRANTY
SUN FIRE X4250 SRV INST GUIDE - MEDIA KIT NO WARRANTY
SUN-SVC SUP 2366783-1 - 3YR WARRANTY FOR SUN FIRE X4250

RED HAT ENT LNX ES - 1 YR OF SERVICE
RED ENT LNX 5,2 MEDUA F.X86/AMDG64 - MEDIA KIT NO WARRANTY

AVAILABILITY.

** IN STOCK ITEM - MOST SHIPPED SAME DAY ORDER IS PLACED.
** OUT OF STOCK ITEM - 2-10 DAYS AFTER RECEIVING ORDER, SUBJECT TO

AWARDED BY TOTAL LOW TO THE LOWEST, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
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