
Hockey Equipment Bid  - 2009 (B001893)

Item MFG Product Description  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company  Skateworld, Inc  Vaughn Custom Sports  Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
1 BAUER SKATES-VAPOR X:60-1031434 278.60$                                                  289.00$                                                  NO BID 278.60$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
2 BAUER SKATES-SUPREME ONE95-1028883 278.60$                                                  289.00$                                                  NO BID 278.60$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
3 BAUER TUUK LIGHTSPEED 2-HOLDER-1025116 35.00$                                                    17.50$                                                    NO BID 17.50$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
4 BAUER TUUK LIGHTSPEED 2-COMBO-1025125 54.00$                                                    27.00$                                                    NO BID 27.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
5 BAUER TUUL LIGHTSPEED 2-STAINLESS RUNNER-1025549 34.00$                                                    17.00$                                                    NO BID 17.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
6 BAUER TUUK LIGHTSPEED 2.1 POWER RUNNER-1030568 34.00$                                                    17.00$                                                    NO BID 17.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
7 BAUER TUUK CUSTOM+-HOLDER-1000780 25.00$                                                    12.50$                                                    NO BID 12.50$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
8 BAUER TUUK CUSTOM+-COMBO-1000786 43.00$                                                    21.00$                                                    NO BID 21.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
9 BAUER TUUK CUSTOM+-STAINLESS RUNNER-1000800 34.00$                                                    12.50$                                                    NO BID 12.50$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A

10 BAUER TUUK LIGHTSPEED PRO-COMBO-1032848 40.00$                                                    18.00$                                                    NO BID 18.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
2.85$                                                      # #N/A

$102.60/case, 36 pairs/case
2.85$                                                      # #N/A

$102.60/case, 36 pairs/case
2.85$                                                      # #N/A

$102.60/case, 36 pairs/case
14 BAUER 120" LACES-THICK-WHITE 3.00$                                                      1.85$                                                      NO BID 1.85$                                                      Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
15 BAUER 108" LACES-THICK-WHITE 3.00$                                                      1.85$                                                      NO BID 1.85$                                                      Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
16 BAUER 96" LACES-THICK-WHITE 3.00$                                                      1.85$                                                      NO BID 1.85$                                                      Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
17 BAUER SUPREME ONE95-PRO GOAL SKATE-1029233 216.50$                                                  227.00$                                                  NO BID 216.50$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
18 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 GOAL TOE BUCKLE KIT-1030176 7.00$                                                      7.00$                                                      NO BID 7.00$                                                       Skateworld, Inc 7 Duplicates
19 BAUER TUUK LS T-LOCK GOAL COWLING-SR.-1030171 95.00$                                                    45.00$                                                    NO BID 45.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
20 RBK 9K PUMP SKATES 390.00$                                                  385.00$                                                  NO BID 385.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
21 RBK 9K PUMP SKATES - BOOT ONLY - NO HOLDER OR RUNNER No Price 385.00$                                                  NO BID 385.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
22 CCM U+ SKATES W/ FELT TOUNGUE 425.00$                                                  385.00$                                                  NO BID 385.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
23 CCM U+ SKATES 390.00$                                                 385.00$                                                 NO BID 385.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A

11 BAUER 120" WAX LACES-WHITE 3.00$                                                      NO BID 2.85$                                                      Skateworld, Inc

12 BAUER 108" WAX LACES-WHITE 3.00$                                                      NO BID 2.85$                                                      Skateworld, Inc

Skateworld, IncNO BID 2.85$                                                      13 BAUER 96" WAX LACES-WHITE 3.00$                                                      

23 CCM U  SKATES 390.00$                                                 385.00$                                                 NO BID 385.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
24 EASTON S17 SKATES - BOOT ONLY - NO HOLDER OR RUNNER No Price 399.00$                                                  NO BID 399.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
25 EASTON S17 SKATES 525.00$                                                  399.00$                                                  NO BID 399.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
26 GRAF JAMIE EASTON CUSTOM SKATES No Price NB NO BID -$                                                        NONE # #N/A
27 RBK 9K GOALIE SKATES 390.00$                                                  385.00$                                                  NO BID 385.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
28 CCM E BLADE PRO HOLDER 40.00$                                                    8.00$                                                      NO BID 8.00$                                                      Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
29 CCM PROFORMANCE SR. STAINLESS STEEL RUNNER 28.00$                                                    16.00$                                                    NO BID 16.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
30 GRAF COBRA ULTRALITE 5000 STEEL HOLDER AND RUNNER COMBO No Price 52.00$                                                    NO BID 52.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
31 BLADEMASTER 6/88 DIAMOND No Price NB NO BID -$                                                        NONE # #N/A
32 BLADEMASTER BLUE TAPERED STONE No Price NB NO BID -$                                                        NONE # #N/A
33 RUBY RED MX 8 SKATE SHARPENING WHEELS No Price NB NO BID -$                                                        NONE # #N/A

34 BAUER GLOVES-VAPOR XXXX PRO GLOVE-BLACK-1030154 196.65$                                                  51.75$                                                    NO BID 51.75$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
35 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 PRO CATCH GLOVE-1028361 196.65$                                                  207.00$                                                  NO BID 196.65$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
36 RBK PREMIER III PRO GOALIE CATCH GLOVE SR. - GRIGGS SPECS 325.00$                                                  NB NO BID 325.00$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A

37 BAUER HELMET-8500-BLACK-1027255 65.55$                                                    34.50$                                                    NO BID 34.50$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
38 BAUER FACEMASK-8500 OVAL-1026457 27.00$                                                    INCLUDED IN SET NO BID 27.00$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
39 BAUER HELMET PARTS KIT-1028568 55.00$                                                    52.00$                                                    NO BID 52.00$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
40 BAUER HELMET/FACEMASK COMBO 8500 94.00$                                                    34.50$                                                    NO BID 34.50$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A

395.00$                                                  # #N/A
Item not painted

42 BAUER GTP THROAT PROTECTOR-1028156 20.00$                                                    20.00$                                                    NO BID 20.00$                                                     Skateworld, Inc # Duplicates
43 BAUER 7 CONCEPT II DELUXE CLEAR FACE SHIELD-SR 23.00$                                                    23.45$                                                    NO BID 23.00$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A

44 BAUER SHOULDER PADS-SUPREME ONE 95-1031428 46.50$                                                    48.00$                                                    NO BID 46.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
45 BAUER SHOULDER PADS-SUPREME CLASSIC SP-1027703 20.00$                                                    48.00$                                                    NO BID 20.00$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
46 BAUER SHOULDER PADS-SUPREME PRO LIGHTSPEED-1028042 46.50$                                                    48.00$                                                    NO BID 46.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
47 BAUER SHOULDER PADS-VAPOR XXXX-1028930 46.50$                                                    48.00$                                                    NO BID 46.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
48 BAUER ELBOW PADS-VAPOR XXXX-1028943 32 75$ 34 50$ NO BID 32 75$ Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A

BAUER GOAL HELMET-9600 PRO 399.00$                                                  NO BID 395.00$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company41

48 BAUER ELBOW PADS-VAPOR XXXX-1028943 32.75$                                                   34.50$                                                   NO BID 32.75$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
49 BAUER ELBOW PADS-SUPREME ONE95-1031432 32.75$                                                    34.50$                                                    NO BID 32.75$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
50 BAUER ELBOW PADS-SUPREME CLASSIC EP-1027704 13.00$                                                    34.50$                                                    NO BID 13.00$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
51 BAUER ELBOW PADS-SUPREME PRO LIGHTSPEED-1027999 32.75$                                                    34.50$                                                    NO BID 32.75$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
52 BAUER SHIN PADS-SUPREME ONE95-1031524 39.50$                                                    41.40$                                                    NO BID 39.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
53 BAUER SHIN PADS-SUPREME ONE35-1031702 26.00$                                                    41.40$                                                    NO BID 26.00$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
54 BAUER SHIN PADS-SUPREME PRO LIGHTSPEED-1028003 39.50$                                                    41.40$                                                    NO BID 39.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
55 BAUER SHIN PADS-VAPOR XXXX-1028949 39.50$                                                    41.40$                                                    NO BID 39.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
56 BAUER PRO GOAL CUP-1027920 35.00$                                                    35.00$                                                    NO BID 35.00$                                                     Skateworld, Inc # Duplicates



Item MFG Product Description  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company  Skateworld, Inc  Vaughn Custom Sports  Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
57 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 GOAL PAD-1028359 660.00$                                                  690.00$                                                  NO BID 660.00$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
58 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 PRO BLOCKER-1028373 130.00$                                                  138.00$                                                  NO BID 130.00$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
59 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 PRO CHEST AND ARM-1029452 175.50$                                                  186.00$                                                  NO BID 175.50$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
60 VAUGHN  VP 7500 VELOCITY 3 ARM AND CHEST PROTECTOR 380.00$                                                  329.00$                                                   No CHG w/purch of Items 63 & 64 329.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
61 RBK PRO SPEC PRO GOALIE CHEST AND ARM PROTECTOR 300.00$                                                  NB NO BID 300.00$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
62 RBK PREMIER II SR. PRO ARM AND BODY PROTECTOR 300.00$                                                  NB NO BID 300.00$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
63 VAUGHN LIM. ED. GOAL PADS-VPG 7700 VELOCITY 3-MACNICOL SPECS 1,250.00$                                               995.00$                                                  1,395.00$                                                           995.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
64 VAUGHN LIM. ED. CATCH GLOVE T-7700 VELOCITY-MACNICOL SPECS 375.00$                                                  295.00$                                                  400.00$                                                              295.00$                                                  Skateworld, Inc # #N/A

280.00$                                                              # #N/A

66 RBK PREMIER III PRO GOALIE BLOCKER SR. - GRIGGS SPECS 220.00$                                                  NB NO BID 220.00$                                                  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
67 RBK PREMIER III PRO GOLAIE LEG PADS SR. - GRIGGS SPECS 1,050.00$                                               NB NO BID 1,050.00$                                               Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A

68 BAUER VAPOR 60 COMPOSITE STICK-SR 91.75$                                                    95.00$                                                    NO BID 91.75$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
69 BAUER VAPOR 60 STICK’UM COMPOSITE STICK-SR 91.75$                                                    95.00$                                                    NO BID 91.75$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
70 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 COMPOSITE STICK-SR. 91.75$                                                    95.00$                                                    NO BID 91.75$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
71 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 STICK'UM COMPOSITE STICK-SR. 91.75$                                                    95.00$                                                    NO BID 91.75$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
72 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 COMPOSITE BLADE-SR. 52.45$                                                    27.60$                                                    NO BID 27.60$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
73 BAUER 7500 GOAL STICK II - CUSTOM-SR. 42.60$                                                    44.85$                                                    NO BID 42.60$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
74 BAUER 7500 GOAL STICK II - SR. 42.60$                                                    44.85$                                                    NO BID 42.60$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
75 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 PRO ERGO COMPOSITE GOAL STICK-SR. 88.75$                                                    93.15$                                                    NO BID 88.75$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
76 BAUER SUPREME ONE95 COMPOSITE SHAFT-SR. 52.45$                                                    55.20$                                                    NO BID 52.45$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
77 BAUER SUPREME ONEPRO STICK'UM COMPOSITE SHAFT-SR 52.45$                                                    55.20$                                                    NO BID 52.45$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
78 BAUER SUPREME COMPOSITE END PLUG-1028305 8.00$                                                      8.00$                                                      NO BID 8.00$                                                       Skateworld, Inc 8 Duplicates
79 BAUER SUPREME WOOD END PLUG-1028304 4.00$                                                      4.00$                                                      NO BID 4.00$                                                       Skateworld, Inc 4 Duplicates

O CO OS G $ $ O $ S

LIM. ED. BLOCKER B-7700 VELOCITY-MACNICOL SPECS Skateworld, Inc65 VAUGHN  Buy Items 63, 64 & 65 and reciever Item60 at 
No Charge. $40.00 Shipping fee is added to 
Items 63,64, and 65 for a total of $2115.00. 

196.00$                                                  270.00$                                                  196.00$                                                  

80 BAUER VAPOR XXXX COMPOSITE END PLUG-1028306 8.00$                                                      8.00$                                                      NO BID 8.00$                                                       Skateworld, Inc 8 Duplicates
81 BAUER VAPOR XXXX WOOD END PLUG-1028303 4.00$                                                      4.00$                                                      NO BID 4.00$                                                       Skateworld, Inc 4 Duplicates

82 BAUER PANTS-SUPREME ONE95-BLACK-SENIOR-CUSTOM 81.95$                                                    86.25$                                                    NO BID 81.95$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
83 BAUER GOALIE PANTS-SUPREME ONE95-BLACK-CUSTOM 175.00$                                                  62.10$                                                    NO BID 62.10$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
84 BAUER SUPREME ATHLETIC SUPPORTER-1028209 9.00$                                                      9.00$                                                      NO BID 9.00$                                                       Skateworld, Inc 9 Duplicates
85 BAUER GARTER BELT-1028192 3.50$                                                      3.50$                                                      NO BID 3.50$                                                       Skateworld, Inc 4 Duplicates
86 BAUER VAPOR X:60 JOCK SHORT-1031275 27.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.53$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
87 BAUER VAPOR X:40 JOCK SHORT-1031280 15.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
88 BAUER VAPOR ELITE SEAMLESS LS TOP-1032498 15.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
89 BAUER VAPOR PREMIUM LS GRIP CREW-1032500 15.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
90 BAUER VAPOR PREMIUM SS CREW-1032502 15.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
91 BAUER VAPOR CORE LS CREW-1032506 15.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
92 BAUER VAPOR CORE SS CREW-1032514 X 15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.53$                                                    Skateworld, Inc # #N/A
93 BAUER VAPOR CORE LS COMPRESSION CREW-1032504 15.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
94 BAUER VAPOR CORE COMPRESSION PANT-1032527 15.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
95 BAUER VAPOR CORE COMPRESSION SHORT-1032529 15.50$                                                    15.53$                                                    NO BID 15.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
96 BAUER VAPOR 3 IN 1 JACKET-BLACK-1032394 37.00$                                                    37.95$                                                    NO BID 37.00$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
97 BAUER VAPOR WARM UP JACKET-1030253 19.00$                                                    19.84$                                                    NO BID 19.00$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
98 BAUER VAPOR WARM UP PANT-1030254 16.20$                                                    16.39$                                                    NO BID 16.20$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
99 BAUER TEAM SHORT-BLACK-1028428 9.10$                                                      9.32$                                                      NO BID 9.10$                                                      Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A

100 BAUER PLAYERS SLIDE-BLACK-1020254 8.00$                                                      8.28$                                                      NO BID 8.00$                                                      Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A

101 BAUER TEAM CANVAS CARRY BAG SR.-1032726 23.00$                                                    24.15$                                                    NO BID 23.00$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
102 BAUER DUFFLE BAG-ROYAL-1033148 13.50$                                                    13.80$                                                    NO BID 13.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A
103 BAUER TEAM STICK BAG-BLACK-1032769 26.50$                                                    27.60$                                                    NO BID 26.50$                                                    Great Skate Hockey Supply Company # #N/A

1.20$                                                      # #N/A
72 Rolls per case

1.75$                                                      # #N/A

Great Skate Hockey Supply Company104 RENFREW CLEAR PLASTIC HOCKEY TAPE NB NO BID 1.20$                                                      

BLACK STICK TAPE NB NO BID 1 75$RENFREW Great Skate Hockey Supply Company105
81 Rolls per case

1.35$                                                      # #N/A
81 Rolls per case

NA NA NA Performance Bond Y/N/NA
NA NA NA Bid Bond Y/N/NA

` UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION UAH DESTINATION FOB Point
NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 Terms

1.35$                                                      

BLACK STICK TAPE NB NO BID 1.75$                                                      RENFREW Great Skate Hockey Supply Company

106 RENFREW WHITE STICK TAPE NB NO BID Great Skate Hockey Supply Company

105



Item MFG Product Description  Great Skate Hockey Supply Company  Skateworld, Inc  Vaughn Custom Sports  Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor
MFG WARRANTY FACTORY WARRANTY 90 DAY WARRANTY Warranty
4 - 6 WEEK ARO* 1 -3 WEEKS 08/01/2009 Delivery

710372 09UAHBID 50292 Your Reference No.
12/31/2009 12/31/2009 12/30/2009 Quotation Effective

Notes * ARO - After- Receiving-Order

BID AWARDED BY LINE ITEM LOW AND WILL BE PURCHASED "AS NEEDED".
"DUPLICATES" INDICATE BIDS OF THE SAME VALUE, AWARDED BASED ON DELIVERY.


	Tabulation 1

