Global

B001872 EDC System CDW-G Eastern Data Inc ACE Computers CPU Optics Gov
REPLACEMENT PARTS FOR A TURNKEY BEOWULF-CLASS SUPERCOMPUTER
item| ea
1 | 30 |Memory $108.00 $100.08 $98.00 $108.00 $110.00 NO BID
Kingston KVR667D2D4F5/4G, 4 GB 667MHz DDR2 $3,240.00 $3,002.40 $2,940.00 $3,240.00 $3,300.00
ECC Fully Buffered CL5 DIMM Dual Rank memory
2 1 |Infiniband HCA $317.00 $362.50 $310.00 $326.00 $450.00f NO BID
Single Port Infiniband mezzanine card AOC-IBH-002
3 5 |Cable $109.00 $98.00 $110.00 $104.00 $220.00 NO BID
4X Copper Infiniband cable, 2 meter $545.00 $490.00 $550.00 $520.00 $1,100.00
4 2 | Blade Module $2,240.00 NO BID $3,689.00 $3,856.00 $3,615.00 NO BID
SuperMicro Xeon Blade Module to include the following parts: $4,480.00 $7,378.00 $7,712.00 $7,230.00
* 1pc Supermicro Superblade Blade Module
SBI-7125B-T1 5000 2*3.5” SATA HS
2 pc Intel Quad-Core Xeon Processor X5450 3.00GHz
2U Passive1333MHz 12M BX80574X5450P
* 2pc Supermicro Superblade SNK-PO030P Processor Heat sink
* 8pc Kingston 4GB 667MHz DDR2 ECC Fully CL5 DIMM Dual Rank,
x4, #KVR667D2D4F5/4G
* 1pc Seagate Barracuda 7200.10 ST3160815AS 160GB 7200
RPM 8MB Cache SATA 3.0Gb/s Hard Drive, OEM
* 1pc Single Port Infiniband mezzanine card AOC-IBH-002
See Note Freight  $200.00
Total $8,582.00 $3,854.90 $11,178.00 $11,798.00 $12,280.00 $0.00
Business classification
FOB
Estimated delivery 10 days 2-10 days 10-14 days 7-10 days 2 weeks
Terms N30 N30 N30 N30 N30
Reference number NKK1063 031709
Warranty Mfg Mfg 1 year Mfg 1 year
Quotation effective until 4/20/2009 30 days 4/16/2009 5/30/2009 4/17/2009

BID AWARDED TO EASTERN DATA AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.

NOTE: EDC System withdrew their bid due to incorrect unit pricing.
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