Optical Telescopes Supplies (B001714)

B001714 Optics Planet, Inc. | W.B. Hunt Co., Inc.
item gty
1 | 2 [ 40mm-400mm Coronado Personal Solar Telescope, with Carrying Case $623.50 $583.00
Coronado model # PSTCP $1,247.00 $1,166.00
2 | 1 [Coronado CaK Personal Solar Telescopes PST Calcium K Discontinued $533.50
Coronado model # PSTCaK
3 | 1 |Coronado 60mm-400mm Solar Max 60 Solar Telescope $3,625.00 $3,481.50
Coronado model # SM60T
4 | 1 |Coronado Tmax Doppler Tuner for Solar Max 60 Telescope $234.11 $218.90
Coronado model # TMAX60
5 | 3 |Coronado 4-piece Eyepiece Set: $323.53 $302.50
Includes Coronado 12mm Cemax $970.59 $907.50
eyepiece (# CE12), Coronado 18mm Cemax eyepiece (# CE18),
Coronado 25mm Cemax eyepiece (# CE 25), Coronado 2x Barlow
6 | 4 |Bogen 3021 PRO Tripod w/o Head (Black) $120.59 $141.17
Bogen model # 3021PRO $482.36 $564.68
7 | 4 |Bogen 3130 QR Micro Fluid Head w/Quick Release Plate (3157N) $78.59 $70.59
Bogen model # 3130 $314.36 $282.36
8 | 1 Meade 8" LX200R UHTC Advanced Ritchey-Chretien Astronomical Telescopes $2,499.95 $2,558.60
w/ GPS, Meade Autostar Il, Meade AutoAlign, Tripod
Meade model # 0810-60-02
9 | 1 Meade Sky Assurance Program - 5-year Meade Telescopes $69.99 $490.60
Hassle-Free Warranty service
10 | 1 |Meade DSI Il PRO w/ CCD Color Filters - Deep Sky Imager Pro Il Kit w/ Meade $616.99 $576.40
Autostar Suite & Meade RGB Color Filter Set
Meade model # 04527
11| 2 |Meade 9x63 Astro Roof Prism Binoculars B120031 $101.99 $83.60
Meade model: B120031 $203.98 $167.20
12| 2 |Celestron SkyScout Personal Planetarium $363.50 $339.90
Celestron model # 93970 $727.00 $679.80
13 | 2 Beamshot Greenbeam 100 Laser Pointer $120.00 No Bid
$240.00
14 | 1 Televue Radian 10mm eyepiece $218.00 No Bid
Televue model # ERD-10.0
15 | 1 Televue Panoptic 41mm eyepiece $444.00 No Bid
Televue model # EPO-41.0
TOTAL $11,893.33 $11,627.04

Business classification

Non Specified

Non Specified

FOB

DP

DP

Estimated delivery

90 days

10-14 days ARO

Terms Non Specified N30 D01

Reference number MNO010408 22780
Warranty Non Specified 1 year

Quotation effective until 2/8/2008 3/31/2008

Edmund Optics and Nikon submitted a NO BID.

BID AWARDED PER LINE ITEM TO THE LOWEST BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.
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‘ ‘ ESTIMATED DELIVERY WAS A DETERMINING FACTOR WHEN MAKING THE AWARD.




Focus Camera, Inc.

Item 6 is alternate

$539.00
$1,078.00
$559.00
$3,595.00
$229.00

$329.00
$987.00

$159.59
$638.36

#055XPROB (alt)

$75.95

$303.80

$2,595.00

$299.00

$599.00

$99.00

$198.00

$349.00

$698.00

$146.88
$287.18

$229.00

$479.00

$12,774.34

SB

DP

7-10 days ARO

except item#8 drop-

shipped from Meade

N30

Non Specified

Standard Manuf

1/31/2008
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