2017 FALL CHARTER BUS (B002505)

CAMELOT BUS | sp|RIT COACH CAPITAL  |COAST TO COAST|  ESTES BUS GRAYLINE OF
CHARTERS TRAILWAYS TOURS SERVICE CLINE TOURS |TN *
LINE ITEM 1 HAS BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID
VOLLEYBALL *LATE BID
1 8/19/2017 NO BID $ 925.00 | $ 644.00 | $ 2,190.00 | $ 975.00 NO BID
2 9/7/17 - 9/9/17 $ 252500 % 397500 $  2,350.00 | $ 4,620.00 | $ 3,025.00 NO BID
3 9/14/17 - 9/16/17 $  329950|$% 472500|$  2,860.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 3,518.00 NO BID
4 9/26/2017 $ 995.00 | $ 925.00 | $ 925.00 | $ 2,925.00 | $ 1,117.00 | $  1,823.00
5 9/29/2017 $ 825.00 | $ 875.00 | $ 644.00 | $ 2,260.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $  1,431.00
6 10/6/2017 $  1,23500|$ 202500|$  1,260.00 ]| $ 3,385.00 | $ 1,571.00 NO BID
7 10/17/2017 $  1,163.00|$%  1,13000] $ 950.00 | $ 3,082.00 | $ 1,288.00 | $  1,956.00
8 | 10/27/17-10/28/17 NO BID $  3,580.00|% 2,285.00](% 5,147.00 | $ 2,943.00 NO BID
9 11/3/17 - 11/4/17 $ 1,74000|$% 260000 $  1,580.00 | $ 4,264.00 | $ 2,500.00 NO BID
SUB TOTAL $ 11,78250 | $ 19,835.00 [ $ 12,854.00 [$  28,983.00 | $  17,102.00 [ $  5,210.00
LINE ITEM 2 HAS BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID
CROSS COUNTRY
1 9/1/2017 $  1,02500|% 1,125.00]$ 730.00 | $ 2,684.00 | $ 975.00 [ $  1,789.00
2 9/22/17 - 9/23/17 $ 156500 $  2,20000|S$  1,424.00]| $ 3,144.00 | $ 1,950.00 NO BID
3 9/28/17 - 9/30/17 $ 319100 % 395000 $  2,950.00 | $ 6,147.00 | $ 3,413.00 NO BID
4 | 10/13/17-10/14/17 |$  2,423.60| S  3,065.00| $  2,170.00 | $ 5,055.00 | $ 2,837.00 NO BID
5 10/21/2017 $ 775.00 | $  1,275.00 | $ 644.00 | $ 2,019.00 | $ 975.00 NO BID
SUB TOTAL $ 7,41400($ 941500|$ 649400 % 1590500 | $ 8,200.00 [ $  1,789.00
LINE ITEMS 1 & 2 HAVE BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID
WOMEN'S SOCCER
1 8/16/2017 $ 775.00 | $ 775.00 | $ 644.00 | $ 2,040.00 | $ 975.00 [ $  1,144.00
2 9/5/2017 S 775.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 619.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 975.00 | $ 960.00
3 9/7/17 - 9/10/17 $ 356000|% 3980.00]|$  292000]$ 6,022.00 | $ 3,950.00 NO BID
4 10/5/17 - 10/6/17 $ 257600|$ 3,267.00$ 2534500 $ 5,230.00 | $ 3,007.00 NO BID
SUB TOTAL $ 613600|$% 7,247.00|$ 526500|$  11,252.00 | $ 6,957.00 | NO BID
MEN'S SOCCER LINE ITEMS 1,2, 4 & 5 HAVE BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID
1 8/15/2017 S 775.00 | $  1,925.00| $  1,225.00 | $ 4,042.00 | $ 1,774.00 | S  2,886.00
2 8/19/2017 NO BID $  1,365.00 | $ 925.00 | $ 2,958.00 | $ 1,109.00 | $  2,077.00
3 8/31/17 - 9/4/17 $ 602100[$ 742500(S$  605000|$  10,455.00 | $ 6,880.00 NO BID
4 9/8/2017 $ 1,23500|$% 247500 $  1,260.00 | $ 3,385.00 | $ 1,571.00 NO BID
5 9/10/2017 $ 1,23500|$% 1,575.00| $  1,260.00 | $ 3,385.00 | $ 1,571.00 | $  2,576.00
6 9/29/17-10/01/17 |$  2,540.00 | $  3,300.00 | $  2,350.00 | $ 4,214.00 | $ 1,775.00 NO BID
7 | 10/06/17-10/08/17 |$  2,585.00| %  3,300.00 | $  2,265.00 | $ 5,155.00 | $ 3,150.00 NO BID
8 10/20/2017 $ 995.00 | $  1,475.00 | $ 880.00 | $ 2,891.00 | $ 1,169.00 NO BID
9 10/22/2017 $  1,02500|%  1,150.00 | $ 739.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 975.00 [ $  1,844.00
SUB TOTAL $ 13,166.00 | $ 16,650.00 | $ 12,284.00 | $  25465.00 | $  13,949.00 | $  1,844.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 38499.10 | $ 53,147.00| $ 36,897.00 | $  81,605.00 | $  46,208.00 | $  8,843.00




CAMELOT SPIRIT COACH [CAPITAL TWAYS |COAST TO COAST [ESTES BUS SVS  CLINE TOURS

FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH
TERMS N/A Net 30 N/A Net 30 N/A Net 30
WARRANTY N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
EST DELIVERY Dates listed N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
YOUR REF NO. N/A N/A N/A CTCT2004 N/A N/A
QUOTE EFF UNTIL 30 Days N/A N/A 12/31/2017 N/A N/A
BUS. CLARIFICATION BW SB SB BD SB SB

This Bid has been Awarded by the Lowest Total Group Low, to Capital Trailways, as the bidder who met the

Bid Specifications.

*Grayline of TN was received as a Late Bid.

EMP: 8/7/17




