2016 WINTER TRACK & FIELD CHARTER BUSES (B002401)

FIRST CLASS |(CAPITAL CAMELOT BUS
CHARTER TRAILWAYS |CLINE TOURS |[SPIRIT COACH (CHARTERS
TRACK & FIELD DESTINATION
1 1/24/2016 Birmingham, AL S 1,200.00 | $ 671.00| S 1,518.00| S 649.00 | S 850.00
2 1/31/2016 Birmingham, AL S 1,200.00 | $ 671.00| S 1,518.00]| S 649.00 | S 850.00
3 2/13/2016 Birmingham, AL S 1,200.00 | $ 671.00| S 1,518.00| $ 949.00 | S 850.00
4 |3/18/16-3/19/16 Tuscaloosa, AL S 1,550.00| $ 1,397.00 No Bid S 2,350.00 | $ 1,725.00
5 3/26/2016 Montevallo, AL No Bid S 825.00| S 1,845.00 (S 1,249.00 | $ 1,143.50
6 4/1/2016 Birmingham, AL No Bid S 671.00| S 1,51800 (S 1,049.00 | $ 850.00
7 4/8/16 - 4/9/16 Knoxville, TN S 2,775.00| $ 1,397.00| S 2,465.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 1,900.00
8 |4/20/16 - 4/23/16 Pembroke, NC No Bid S 3,238.00 No Bid S 4,980.00 | S 4,650.00
TOTAL $ 7,925.00|$ 9,541.00|$ 10,382.00|$ 13,825.00($ 12,818.50
FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH
TERMS N/A N/A Net 30 Net 30 Net 5
WARRANTY N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
ESTIMATE DELIVERY N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
YOUR REF NO. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
QUOTATION EFF UNTIL N/A N/A N/A 1/21/2016 30 Days
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB SB SB SB SB

The Bid has been Awarded by Line Item Low to Capital Trailways and Spirit Coach as the lowest responsible
bidders who met the Bid Specifications.

Capital Trailways Line Items 3, 4, 5, 6, 7 and 8.

Spirit Coach Line Items 1 and 2.
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