
Printing Osher Lifelong Learning 

Institute editions B002330

bpi  media 

group

First 

Impressions 

HSV

Allied Digital 

Printing Craftsman

Colonial 

Printing

Signature 

Offset

Interstate 

Printing & 

Graphics BFC EBSCO

Item Description Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

 1)   

Base price, catalog printing

Digital Printing - 16 interior pages 

w/4 page 4-color cover

Quantity 4,000      / $2,550.00 $3,120.00

N/A digital more 

expensive

$3,675.00 No Bid $1,668.00 No Bid $2,314.00

 2)   

Offset Printing - 16 interior pages 

w/4 page 4-color cover

Quantity 4,000  $1,435.00 $1,787.00 $1,675.00 $1,180.20 $1,668.00 $1,977.00 $1,766.00

  3)    

Base price, catalog printing

Digital Printing - 16 interior pages 

w/4 page 2-color cover

Quantity 4,000       

/ $2,550.00 $3,120.00

N/A digital more 

expensive

$3,425.00 No Bid $1,623.00 No Bid $2,314.00

4)

Offset Printing - 16 interior pages 

w/4 page 2-color cover

Quantity 4,000 $1,346.00 $1,695.00 $1,500.00 $1,152.48 $1,623.00 $1,977.00 $1,505.00

5)

Base price per 500, mail handling 

Print and/or affix labels, sort, and 

sack 3rd class,

carrier route labels generated by 

vendor. $12.00

No extra 

charge

500-$152.00   

1000- $158.00    

2000- $208.00   

3000 - $268.00    

3600 - $298.00 $250.00 $38.50 $38.50

-1900.00    

'+2090.00

$395.00   first 

2000 $195.00 

/ each 

addition 500 

$50.00

9)

Additional charge for half tones? N/C $0.00

No extra 

charge none N/C
$20.00 per 

Scanned Image N/A $0.00 N/A

*1

Totals includes 16 pgs 4 page 4-

color cover, 4,000 mail handling 

item 5, $0.00 $2,550.00 $3,120.00 $0.00 $3,925.00 $0.00 $1,976.00 $0.00 $2,914.00

*2

Totals includes Offset 16 pgs 4 

page 4-color cover,  4,000 mail 

handling item 5 $1,531.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,114.98 $1,925.00 $1,568.20 $0.00 $4,067.00 $2,366.00

*3

Totals includes 16 pgs  4 page 2-

color cover, 4,000 mail handling 

item 5, $0.00 $2,550.00 $3,120.00 $0.00 $3,675.00 $0.00 $1,931.00 $0.00 $2,914.00

*4
Totals includes Offset 16 pgs 4 

page  2-color cover , 4,000  mail 

handling item 5 $1,442.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,022.98 $1,750.00 $1,540.48 $0.00 $4,067.00 $2,105.00
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7)

Additional charge for bleeds (Cover 

only)? N/C $0.00

No extra 

charge

4000 quantity    

16 body pages +2 

color cover 

$1754.00               

24 body pages +2 

color cover 

$2130.00            $170.00 N/C N/A N/A

8)
Addition/Subtraction of 500 copy 

increments

+93.00                 

-93.00 $340.00 $390.00

16 total pages 3500 

with 2 color cover 

$1,580.00 4500 with 

2 color cover 

$1754.00    $196.00

$75.52 (4-C)               

$73.01 (2-C) $172.00 $104.00

10)
Shipping/freight charges for delivery 

to Huntsville, AL (If applicable)
N/C

$0.00

No extra 

charge

16 totals pages 

$29.98 N/C Included Included $205.00

11)
Additional Costs

Hard Proofs 

$4.50 per page

Will be able to 

mail local

Digital "Soft 

Proofs" NC

Addt/Sb OH500 

copy increments 

Digital $264.00

Addt/Sb OH500 

copy increments 2-

color $264.00

FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH

TERMS
 Net 30 net 30  Net 30  2% 10 Net 30  Net 30 Days  Net 30  Net 30 

WARRANTY
No warranty 

coverage

Industry 

Standard
N/A N/A N/A

ESTIMATED DELIVERY

10 Business 

Days

8 business 

days
As Required

Per 

Specifications
10 days

2/17/15-8/3/15 -

12/14/15 -

2/18/16

YOUR REFERENCE NO. 44745 UAH01-29-15 BJ112514 420311140 LOO5030

QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 2/1/2016 4/30/2015 1 year 3/1/2016 90 days 2/28/2016

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB SB SB/VS SB SB LB LB

2/10/2015 

PKH

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           

The bid is awarded by line item low to Interstate Printing & Graphics for item 1 and 3, and BPI for item 2 

and item 4 as the apparent lowest responsible bidder, meeting specifications.



Colorxpress

Total Price

$6,125.00

$1,824.00

$6,125.00

$1,824.00

$19.20

N/A

$6,278.60

$1,977.60

$6,278.60

$1,977.60



Colorxpress

$0.00

$68.00

N/A

UAH

 Net 30 Days

Yes

One week

1/29/2016

SB


