HOCKEY EQUIPMENT (B002295)

Edge

GROUP A (WARRIOR ITEMS) WARRIOR SPORTS GREAT SKATE SKATE WORLD INC. REEBOK/CCM Performance*

UNIT cOsT|EXTENDED UNIT cosT |EXTENDED UNIT cosT|EXTENDED UNITcosT  |EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom Qrty cosT cosT cosT cosT
1 MEN'S SENIOR DT1 PRO, VARIOUS STOCK PATTERN

DT1 PRO, GRIP AND FLEX, DT PRO EA 450  [INcLUDED | INCLUDED |$ ~ 78.00|$ 35,100.00| NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1a MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS DIMENSIONS WARRIOR

SWAGER GOAL STICKS EA 60 " " $  6445|$  3,867.00| NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID
1b VARIOUS SIZE, UAH WARRIOR DYNASTY AX1

(CUSTOMUAH) PR 50 " " $ 8450($  4,22500| NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1 MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, CUSTOM PRO

¢ WARRIOR FRANCHISE CUSTOM HOCKEY PANTS EA 15 " " $ 78.00($  1,170.00( NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID
1d MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK WARRIOR

SWAGGER CUSTOM GOAL PANTS (GHPSWAS-BLACK EA 3 " " $  154.00($ 462.00 [ NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, CUSTOM PRO
le WARRIOR FRANCHISE CUSTOM HOCKEY PANTS

SHELL EA 10 i " $ 3675 (% 367.50 | NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID

WARRIOR HP PULL OVER 2.5 VARIOUS SIZES,
1f AVIATIOR, WPTM456 EA 40 " " $ 21008 840.00| NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID

WARRIOR HP PANT, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK,
1g WPPM452 EA 40 " " $ 18.90 [ $ 756.00| NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1h WARIOR COVERT SS OR LS TOP, VARIOUS SIZES AND

STYLES WPTMA451, WPTMA450 EA 80 " " $ 1470($  1,176.00| NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID

WARRIOR TEAM COMPRESSION SHORTS OR PANTS
1i OR TECH TIGHT PANT, VARIOUS SIZES WPPM401,

WPSM301, WPP0017 EA 80 " " $ 1260($  1,008.00( NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1i WARRIOR SHOES, PREQUEL VARIOUS SIZES,

] WHITE/BLACK (PREQL) PR 40 " " s 54.00|$  2,160.00| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1k BLACK/WHITE WARRIOR WARM-UPS SET 15 " " $ 6195 (% 929.25| NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID
1 MEN'S SENIOR, DYNASTY AX1 PERFORMANCE CUT

PROOF OR COMPRESSION SOCKS PR 80 " " $ 1417|$ 113360 NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1 MEN'S SS TECH TEE, VARIOUS SIZES TEAM ROYAL,

m WPT079 EA 300 " " $ 840|$ 252000 NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1n MEN'S NEXT TECH SHORT, VARIOUS SIZES, BLUE,

WHITE, GREY, WPSM450 EA 80 " " $ 1470($  1,176.00| NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID

MEN'S GAME DAY POLO, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK,

1o WPTM309 EA 120 " " $ 21.00|$  2,520.00| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 WARRIOR NEW LOGO FLEX CAP, VARIOUS SIZES,

P BLACK EA 120 " " $ 840|$ 100800 NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
19 'WARRIOR SHOWER SANDALS, VARIOUS SIZES,

BLACK PR 40 " " $ 1470 | $ 588.00| NOBID [ NOBID NO BID NO BID
ir WARRIOR SHAVING KIS CUSTOM, BLUE EA 40 " " s 11003 44000 NoBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1s WARRIOR PRO BAG, HB0950 BLACK & WHITE EA 10 " " s 3675 36750 | NoBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1t WARRIOR CABLE BEANIE, WLHMA455 BLACK EA 40 " " $ 1050 [ $ 420.00| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ITEM 1 AND (1a - 1t)

BID RECEIVED

INCLUSIVE PACKAGE PRICE $ 50,000.00 $  62,233.85 |NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |LATE




CCM ITEMS - (B002295) - GROUP B

UNIT EXTENDED

ITEM |DESCRIPTION UOM | QTY |PRICE PRICE
2 PRO CCM V08 HELMET (NO SIDE LOGO) EA 15 |$ S
3 |CCM FM580 FACE MASK BLACK EA 15 |S S
4 |REEBOK SHOULDER PAD 20K NHL SPECS EA 15 |$ S
5  |REEBOK ELBOW PAD 19K NHL SPECS EA 15 |S$ S
6 REEBOK SHIN PAD 19K NHL SPECS EA 15 |$ S
7 |CCM EXTREME FLEX CUSTOM GOAL PADS SET 3 S S
8  |CCM EXTREME FLEX CUSTOM GOAL BLOCKER EA 3 S S
9  |CCM EXTREME FLEX CUSTOM GOAL GLOVE EA 3 S S
10  |CCM CUSTOM ARM & BODY PROTECTIVE EA 1 S S
11  [CCM PRO JOCK STRAP EA 15 |S S
12 [RBZ300JOCK SHORT EA 15 |S S

CCM RBZ (FULL CUSTOM PRO, VARIOUS
13 |SENIOR SIZES) PR 1 |$ S

CCM TACKS (FULL CUSOM PRO, VARIOUS
14  |SENIOR SIZES PR 1 |$ S

CCM SPEEDBLADE 4.0 HOLDER (VARIOUS
15  |SENIOR SIZES SET 1 |$ S

CCM SPEEDBLADE SAINLESS STEEL RUNNER
16  [(VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) SET 1 s S

CCM FULL STAINLESS STEEL RUNNER (VARIOUS
17  |SENIOR SIZES) SET 1 |S S

18  [cCM GOAL SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PR 1

LINE ITEMS 13 - 17 ARE SUBJECT TO INCREASE IN QUANTITY FROM 1 - 10.




BAUER ITEMS (B002295) - GROUP C

EXTENDED
ITEM |DESCRIPTION UOM | QTY [UNIT PRICE |PRICE
SUPREME TOTAL ONE MX3 SKATES (VARIOUS SENIOR
18 SIZES PR 14 |$ S
19 PRO GOAL SKATES (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PR 1 S S
20 REACTOR 6000 GOAL SKATE (VARIOUS SIZES) PR 1 S S
21 VAPOR APX2 SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PR 6 |[S S
22 NEXUS 1000 SKATES (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PR 3 S S
23 TUUK LS EDGE HOLDER (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) SET 10 |$ S
TUUK LS EDGE 2 STAINLESS STEEL RUNNER (VARIOUS
24 [SENIOR sIZES) SET 10 |S S
25 TUUK LS EDGE 3 RUNNER (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) SET 10 |$ S
TUUK LS EDGE FUSION RUNNER (VARIOUS SENIOR
26 SIZES) SET 10 S S
BAUER NME 10 GOALIE MASK WHITE NON CERTIFIED
27  |caTEYEFTTO EA 1 S S

SUBJECT TO INCREASE QUANTITY ON LINE ITEMS 18 - 26 BY 50%.




