
HOCKEY EQUIPMENT (B002231)

NEW 

ENGLAND 

SPORTS

SKATE 

WORLD INC

EDGE PER-

FORMANCE 

HOCKEY LLC

WARRIOR 

HOCKEY

GREAT SKATE 

HOCKEY

WARRIOR ITEMS - GROUP A   (1a - 1x)

ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM QTY

           (1a - 1x) NO BID NO BID NO BID 50,000.00$ 70,255.60$   

1a

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS STOCK 

PATTERN, GRIP AND FLEX, DT PRO EA 452    

1b

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS DIMENSIONS 

SWAGGER GOAL STICKS EA 54

1c

VARIOUS SIZE, UAH BONIFIDE GLOVES 

(CUSTOMUAH) PAIRS 36

1d

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, CUSTOM 

PRO FRANCHISE CUSTOM HOCKEY 

PANTS PAIRS 30

1e

MEN'S SENIOR VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK 

KROWN VN HOCKEY HELMES PRO LINER EA 30

1f

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK 

KROWN CAGE (HHCKR02) EA 30

1g

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK 

SWAGGER CUSTOM GOAL PANTS 

(GHPSWAS-BLACK) PAIRS 3

1h

ELITE TEAM HOODIE, VARIOUS SIZES, 

ASHPHALT, WPTM310 EA 40

1i

ELITE TEAM PANT, VARIOUS SIZES, 

ASHPHALT, (WPPM30) EA 40

1j

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZE, DYNASTY 

AX1 SHOULDER PADS (AX1SPSR3) PAIRS 15

1k

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, 

DYNASTY AX1, ELBOW PADS, AX1EPSR3 PAIRS 15

1l

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, 

DYNASTY AX1, SHIN GUARDS (AX1SGSR3) PAIRS 15

1m

COMPRESSION TOPS, VARIOUS SIZES 

AND STYLES (WPTM203) OR WPTM204) EA 60

1n

TECH TIGHT PANTS, VARIOUS SIZES AND 

STYLES (WPP0017) EA 60

1o

SHOES, PREQUEL VARIOUS SIZES, 

WHITE/BLACK (PREQL) PAIRS 35

1p BLACK/WHITE WARM-UPS SETS 30

1q

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, NUT 

HUTT (HNI1+ SIZE) EA 15

1r

MEN'S SENIOR, DYNASTY AX1 

PERFORMANCE CUT PROOF SOCKS PAIRS 60

1s

MEN'S SS TECH TEE, VARIOUS SIZES 

HEATHER GREY, WPTO79 PAIRS 40

1t

MEN'S TECH SHORT 9", VARIOUS SIZES, 

BLACK, WPSM047 PAIRS 40



1u

MEN'S GAME DAY POLO, VARIOUS SIZES, 

BLACK, SPTM309 PAIRS 40

1v PRO GOALIE BAG EA 3

1w

NEW LOGO FLEX CAP, VARIOUS SIZES, 

BLACK EA 40

1x

SHOWER SANDALS, VARIOUS SIZES 

BLACK EA 30

TOTAL

INC PKG 

PRICE NO BID  NO BID NO BID $50,000.00 $70,255.60

BAUER ITEMS - GROUP B

ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM QTY

2

SUPREME TOTAL ONE NXG SKATE 

(VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PAIR 10 NO BID 645.00$       452.00$        NO BID 655.00$            

3

PRO GOAL SKATES (VARIOUS SENIOR 

SIZES) PAIR 3 NO BID 450.00$       318.00$        NO BID 480.00$            

4

REACTOR 6000 GOAL SKATE (VARIOUS 

SIZES) PAIR 1 NO BID 419.00$       299.00$        NO BID 435.00$            

5

VAPOR APX2 SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR 

SIZES) PAIR 12 NO BID 645.00$       452.00$        NO BID 660.00$            

6

TUUK LS FUSION BLADES (VARIOUS 

SENIOR SIZES) SET 1 NO BID 81.00$         65.00$           NO BID 85.00$              

TOTAL NO BID 2,240.00$   1,586.00$     NO BID 2,315.00$        

EASTON ITEMS - GROUP C

ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM QTY

7 MAKO (PRO) PAIR 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 525.00$            

TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $525.00

BLADE MASTER/NE - GROUP D

ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM QTY

8

TSWM5004 PACKAGE OF 4 

RECTANGULAR DEBURRING STONES EA 1 19.00$         35.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID

9

TSM4004 PACKAGE OF 4 TEAR DROP 

HAND HONES EA 1 15.00$         29.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID



10

SH6000 PRECISION CALIBRATED SKATE 

HOLDER EA 1 725.00$       900.00$       NO BID NO BID NO BID

11 BR100 PRO SKATE SQUARE EA 1 155.00$       200.00$       NO BID NO BID NO BID

12 BCR2005 COMBO SHARPE EA 1 3,200.00$    4,000.00$   NO BID NO BID NO BID

13 SPB850 SHARPNER EA 1 995.00$       1,250.00$   NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL 5,109.00$   6,414.00$   NO BID NO BID NO BID

NEW 

ENGLAND 

SPORTS

SKATE 

WORLD INC

EDGE PER-

FORMANCE 

HOCKEY

WARRIOR 

HOCKEY

GREAT SKATE 

HOCKEY

UAHUNTSVILLE DESTINATION N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

TERMS NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 60 NET 30

WARRANTY ONE YEAR FACTORY

SEE 

ADDENDUM 

A N/A

Manuf. 

Warranty 

Applies

ESTIMATE DELIVERY 8/15/2013 1-2 Weeks 9/1/2013 9/1/2013

3 Weeks from 

P.O.

YOUR REFERENCE NO. N/A UAH 2013 UAH 2013 N/A 722372

QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 12/31/2013 5/1/2014 9/2/2013 N/A 4/1/2014

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB SB SB LB SB

This Bid has been Awarded by Line Item Low, to the lowest responsible bidder

that meets the Bid Specifications:

Group A: Line Item 1 (1a - 1x) awarded to Warrior Hockey.

Group B: Line Item 2, 3, 4, 5, and 6 awarded to Edge Performance Hockey LLC.

Group C: Line Item 7 awarded to Great Skate Hockey

Group D: Line Item 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 and 13 awarded to New England Sports & Sales.

EMP: 8/2/2013


