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SKATEWORLD WARRIOR SPORTS GREAT SKATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM QTY

UNIT 

COST

EXTENDED 

COST UNIT COST

EXTENDED 

COST UNIT COST EXTENDED COST

1 MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS STOCK PATTERN, 

GRIP AND FLEX, WARRIOR DYNASTY HOCKEY 

STICKS EA 375 NB NB INCLUDED INCLUDED 107.00$         40,125.00$              

1a

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS DIMENSION'S 

WARRIOR SWAGGER GOAL STICKS EA 36 NB NB " " 69.00$           2,484.00$                

1b

VARIOUS SIZE, UAH WARRIOR LUXE GLOVES 

(CUSTOMUAH) PR 27 NB NB " " 94.00$           2,538.00$                

1c

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK 

WARRIOR FRANCHISE PRO HOCKEY PANTS 

(FRANPAS) PR 27 NB NB " " 126.00$         3,402.00$                

1d

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK 

WARRIOR KROWN 360 HOCKEY HELMETS 

(HHKRO2) EA 30 NB NB " " 79.00$           2,370.00$                

1e

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK 

WARRIOR KROWN CAGE (HHCKR02) EA 30 NB NB " " 26.00$           780.00$                   

1f

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, BLACK 

WARRIOR SWAGGER  GOAL PANTS (GHPSWAS-

BLACK) PR 3 NB NB " " 77.00$           231.00$                   

1g

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS CUSTOM SPECS, 

RITUAL PRO CUSTOM GOALIE PADS (C-

RITL+SIZE), TRAPPER C-RITCAT), AND BLOCKER 

(C-RITBLK) SETS 3 NB NB " " 1,400.00$      4,200.00$                

1h

WARRIOR GOALIE RITUAL ACCESSORY KITS 

(GAKRT2+BK+OSZ) KITS 3 NB NB " " 13.00$           39.00$                      

1i

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZE, WARRIOR 

PROJEKT SHOULDER PADS (HSPPROS2) PR 10 NB NB " " 80.00$           800.00$                   

1j

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, WARRIOR 

PROJEKT ELBOW PADS (HEPPROS2) PR 10 NB NB " " 50.00$           500.00$                   

1k

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, WARRIOR 

PROJEKT SHIN PADS (HSGPOS2) PR 12 NB NB " " 59.00$           708.00$                   

1l

WARRIOR COMPRESSION TOPS, VARIOUS 

SIZES AND STYLES (WPTM203) OR WPTM204) EA 30 NB NB " " 15.00$           450.00$                   

1m

WARRIOR TECH TIGHT PANTS, VARIOUS SIZES 

AND STYLES (WPP0017) EA 30 NB NB " " 15.00$           450.00$                   

1n WARRIOR SHOES VAROUS SIZES (DOJOWB) PR 30 NB NB " " 45.00$           1,350.00$                

1o BLACK/WHITE WARRIOR WARM-UPS SETS 15 NB NB " " 67.00$           1,005.00$                

1p WARRIOR PRO BAGS CUSTOM UAH EA 30 NB NB " " 50.00$           1,500.00$                

1q

MEN'S SENIOR, VARIOUS SIZES, WARRIOR NUT 

HUTT (NHI1+SIZE) PR 12 NB NB " " 19.00$           228.00$                   

1r MEN'S SENIOR, BLACK CREW SOCKS PR 60 NB NB " " 7.30$              438.00$                   

INCLUSIVE PACKAGE COST NO BID NO BID $38,975.00 $63,598.00 
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SKATEWORLD WARRIOR SPORTS GREAT SKATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM QTY UNIT COST

EXTENDED 

COST

UNIT 

COST

EXTENDED 

COST UNIT COST

EXTENDED 

COST

2 BAUER SUPREME TOTAL ONE NXG 

SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES PR 14 585.00$        8,190.00$     NB NB 560.00$         7,840.00$      

3 BAUER SUPREME ONE GOAL SKATES 

(VARIOUS SENIOR SIZES) PR 3  $       460.00 1,380.00$     NB NB 415.00$         1,245.00$      

4 BAUER APX SKATE (VARIOUS SENIOR 

SIZES) PR 8 585.00$        4,680.00$     NB NB 560.00$         4,480.00$      

5 TUUK LS FUSION BLADES (VARIOUS 

SENIOR SIZES) SET 1 79.00$          79.00$          NB NB 80.00$           80.00$            

6 36 COUNT NIKE BAUER MOLDED TIP 

HOCKEY SKATE LACES BX 1 104.00$        104.00$        NB NB NO BID NO BID

TOTAL 1,813.00$    14,433.00$  NO BID 1,615.00$      13,645.00$    

7 11K SENIOR SKATES PR 1 599.00$        599.00$        NB NB 600.00$         600.00$          

TOTAL 599.00$        599.00$        NO BID 600.00$         600.00$         

8 ROLL OF CLEAR PLASTIC COMP-O-

STICK HOCKEY TAPE CASE 72 NB NB NB NB 1.40$             100.80$          

TOTAL NO BID NO BID 1.40$             $100.80

9 TSWM5004 PACKAGE OF 4 

RECTANGULAR DEBURRING STONES EA 1 30.00$           $          30.00 NB NB NB NB

10 TSM4004 PACKAGE OF 4 TEARDROP 

HAND HONES EA 1 25.00$          25.00$          NB NB NB NB

11 SH6000 PRECISION CALIBRATED 

SKATE HOLDER EA 1 875.00$        875.00$        NB NB NB NB

12 BR100 PRO SKATE SQUARE EA 1 195.00$        195.00$        NB NB NB NB

TOTAL 1,125.00$    1,125.00$     NO BID NO BID

The Bid has been awarded by Line 

Item Low, to the lowest responsible 

bidder that meets the bid 

specifications.
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SKATEWORLD WARRIOR SPORTS GREAT SKATE

Classification IN LB SB

Bid Bond Y/N N/A N/A N/A

FOB Point UAH DESTINATION N/A UAH DESTINATION

Terms Net 30 Days N/A Net 10 days

Warranty Factory N/A Manufacturing

Delivery 2-4 Weeks N/A 3 Weeks from Order

Your Reference No. UAH 2012K8 N/A 823372

Quotation Effective 12/31/2012 N/A 1/15/2013

Notes


