
Hazardous Waste Disposal 

(B002281.RV01)
SWS 

Heritage 

Environmental 

services

PSC 

Environmental 

Services

Rineco

Item
Qt

y
Desciption Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Lab Pack Services for Reactives

1) 1 5 gal Drum $270.00 $516.00 ###### No Bid N/A $116.00 159.75 $375.30

1 gallon = 8.34 pounds                        

5 gal = 41.7 lbs 

2) 1 14 gal Drum $490.00 $1,444.80 ###### No Bid N/A $224.00 $414.00 $1,050.84

14gal = 116.76 lbs   

3) 1 30 gal Drum $675.00 $6,267.50 ###### No Bid N/A $352.00

         $847.13                   

case by case                     

Pricing drum qty size 

and process code for 

case by case 

$2,251.80

30 gal = 250.20 lbs

$2,000.00

see per 

pound 

price 

minimum

4) 1 55 gal Drum $925.00 $11,467.50 ###### No Bid N/A $572.00

        $1243.13                   

case by case                 

Pricing drum qty size 

and process code for 

case by case 

$4,128.30

55 gal = 458.70 lbs 

$2,500.00

see per 

pound 

price 

minimum

5) 1
Transportation charges for both reactive 

and non reactive
$2,134.00 $500.00 ###### No Bid $300.00 Included above $1,725.00

6) 1 Price per pound N/A $25.00 $25.00 No Bid $5.21 Not Applicable to bid
$4.64 with above 

minimums
$9.00

7) 1 Price per analytical cost non-

reactives Field test
$75.00 $200.00 ###### No Bid $62.50 $25.00

$30.00 per each Haz-

Cat Scan

$500.00 per unknown 

analytical

Lab Pack Services Totals $4,569.00 $20,395.80  No bid $62.50 $1,589.00 $2,694.01 $9,531.24

EWS Alabama, Inc.
EQ Industrial Services, 

Inc.
CleanHarbors

See attached



Hazardous Waste Disposal 

(B002281.RV01)
SWS 

Heritage 

Environmental 

PSC 

Environmental 
Rineco

Desciption Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Non-reactive Materials

8) 1 5 gal Drum $165.00 $160.00 No Bid 5 gal $61.25 $116.00 $92.98 $240.00
9) 1 14 gal Drum $350.00 $200.00 No Bid 14 gal $101.25 $224.00 $167.79 $367.00
10) 1 30 gal Drum $465.00 $225.00 No Bid 30 gal $180.00 $352.00 $214.82 $410.00

11) 1 55 gal Drum $610.00 $250.00 No Bid 55 gal $298.75 $572.00 $310.78 $530.00

Mercury Debris 

(5gal)

$250.00

Aerosols (30gal)
$255.00

Cylinder
$86.00

12) 1
Transportation charges for both reactive 

and non reactive
$2,134.00 $500.00 No Bid $300.00 Included above $1,725.00

13) 1 Price per pound N/A no bid No Bid  Not Applicable to bid
$1.55 with above 

minimums
$5.26

14) 1
Price per analytical cost non-

reactives Field test $75.00 $200.00 No Bid $62.50 $25.00
$30.00 per each Haz-

Cat Scan

$500.00 per unknown 

analytical

Lab Pack Services Totals $3,799.00 $1,535.00  No Bid $703.75 $1,589.00 $816.37 $3,272.00

Extra Attachment Quotes 

Task 1 

lab pack 

mobiliza

tion

585.00 Supplies 512.00

Task 2 

lab pack 

manage

ment

7,211.18 Labor 1,780.00

Task 3 

High 

Hazman

agement

2,574.00
Mobe and 

transportation
1,565.47

Insurance 

Surcharge @ 

1.5%

57.86

Additional Fees
not priced  $0.00 10,370.18 3,915.33 $0.00 0.00 0.00

 Totals $8,368.00 $21,930.80 $10,370.18 $4,681.58 $3,178.00 $3,510.38 $12,803.24

EWS Alabama, Inc. CleanHarbors
EQ Industrial Services, 

Inc.

Flammable Solids (4.1)

See attached

$5.86 Oxidizers



Hazardous Waste Disposal 

(B002281.RV01)
SWS 

Heritage 

Environmental 

services

PSC 

Environmental 

Services

Rineco

FOB

UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH

TERMS Net30 Net30 Net30 Net30 Net30 Days

WARRANTY
N/A N/A

No warranty 

coverage

ESTIMATED DELIVERY
5/30/2014 w/o 5/19

5/30/2014

YOUR REFERENCE NO. N/A B002281 B002281

QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL

30 days from 

receipt of 

payment 30 days 6/30/2014 60 days
7/6/2014 9/1/2014

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION

LB LB LB LB LB

06/10/2014 PKH
The bid is awarded by total low to Heritage Environmental Services is the 

apparent lowest responsible bidder, meeting specifications.

EWS Alabama, Inc. CleanHarbors
EQ Industrial Services, 

Inc.

Bulk Chemical Waste Disposal not applicable per pre-bid meeting


