
Gas Purifier and Related Sensors 

(B002325)
VWR Medline Fisher Scientific

Item Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Labconco 

5121810     

Labconco            

5121810

Labconco                 

5121810                

catalog number 89175-402   89175-402 

1) 1 Gas Purifier, # 5121810 $8,413.04 $9,625.00 $9,120.07

2) 1
Elbows Adapter Fitting for 3/8 Kit                        

# 5441900
no bid 188.60 174.11

3) 1
Flex Tubing Neoprene hose Kit,                          

# 5441801
no bid 130.70 389.87

4) 1
Atmospure Plumbing Service Kit,                  

# 5441700
no bid 163.50 150.05

5) 1
Oxygen Monitor sensor 1-10,000ppm,                 

# 5244500
no bid 6,212.70 5,368.03

6) 1 Moisture Sensor, 0-6,000ppm, # 5244900 no bid 4,066.95 5,893.62

ppm 0-6,000ppm # 5442200 0-10,000ppm # 5244900

7) 1 Cable, # 5442000 no bid no bid 100.87

8) 1 Vacuum pump, # 1472100 no bid no bid 3,169.46

9) 1 Port covers # 5242200 no bid 125.80 No bid

 Total $8,413.04 20,387.45 24,366.08

FOB UAH UAH UAH 

TERMS Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30 

WARRANTY
1 year part and 

labor see attached 1 year from install

ESTIMATED DELIVERY 10 weeks ARO 3 weeks from P.O. 4 weeks 

YOUR REFERENCE NO. 8002678694 9578 5005-6860-23

QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 1/31/2015 1/31/2015 2/4/2015

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION LB LB LB

01/22/2015 PKH

The bid is awarded by line item low to VWR for item 1, Fisher Scientific items 2, 4-

5, 7-8, and Medline is awarded items 3, 6, and 9 as the apparent lowest 

responsible bidder, meeting specifications. 

VWR only quoted the purifier, did not include pricing for the connections, sensors, 

and supporting equipment. Medline did not include pricing for the cable or vacuum 

pump. Fisher Scientific did not price the port covers.


