
FITNESS EQUIPMENT (B002257)

PRO MAXIMA FITCO

SUMMER 

MEDICAL

MARPO 

KINETICS INC

BSN 

SPORTS
PURMO

TION*

REJECTED LINE 

ITEMS 

ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM QTY TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL NO BID

1 VMX ROPE TRAINER EA 1 7,199.00$        4,950.00$          NO BID 4,826.00$         NO BID

2
2-SIDED VERTICAL 6-PAIR 

DUMBBELL RACK EA 2 650.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROMAXIMA: No. 2 does 

not have required 

dumbbells.

3 SP-6500H CALF RAISE EA 1 1,799.00$        3,750.00$          NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROMAXIMA: No. 3  

Adjustment footpiece not 

required.

4

SUPER SQUAT (#624) PLATE 

LOADED SQUAT MACHINE EA 1 1,799.00$        3,295.00$          NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROMAXIMA: No. 4 does 

not have required storage 

horns; 2x4" bent;  can 

only be used facing 

inward.  

5 ACCESSORY RACK EA 1 325.00$            385.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROMAXIMA: No. 5 does 

not have three (3) shelves 

and 12 Pegs/Horns, no 

flattened round tube 

frame.

6 8-WAY NECK MACHINE (#P-

8000) EA 1 1,999.00$        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7

PERFORMANCE PLUS PL-123 

POWER BENCH (WITH 

FOOTREST) EA 2 1,050.00$        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8 WARHAMMER PLUS 

RENEGADE/LANDMINE 

HANDLE EA 2 909.90$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROMAXIMA: No. 8 does 

not have sufficient 

information on Specs.

9
ROGUE BAR OLYMPIC 

BARBELL BAR
EA 2 710.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID 343.96$     

PROMAXIMA: No. 9 does 

not have "NO" center 

knurling and no bronze 

bushings.    BSN SPORTS: 

No. 9 does not have 

Lifetime Warranty and 

bar length is too long.

10 WOMEN'S SILVER & BLACK 

ROGUE BAR (pw0007-15) 

OLYMPIC BARBELL BAR EA 3 675.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROMAXIMA: No. 10 does 

not have bar length.

11 SHUTTLE 2000-1 CLINICAL 

PLUS REHAB PLATFORM EA 1 9,299.00$        NO BID 6,399.00$          NO BID NO BID

TOTAL 26,414.90$      12,380.00$        6,399.00$          4,826.00$         343.96$     NO BID

This Bid is awarded by Line Item Low to the responsible bidder meeting Specifications

Line item 1 Awarded to: MARPO KINETICS INC.

Line Items 3, 4 and 5 Awarded to: FITCO

Line Items 6 and 7 Awarded to: PROMAXIMA

Line Item 11 Awarded to: SUMMER MEDICAL

*PURMOTION'S Bid was not received on the Opening Date and Time: October 31, 2013 at 1:30 p.m.



EMP: 11/4/2013


