FITNESS EQUIPMENT (B002244)

GROUP A
NEW EQUIPMENT (1A - 1AU)

TRADE-INS (1AV - 1EA)

PROSYSTEMS INC

STAR TRAC
FITNESS

PRO MAXIMA

MFAC LLC

LIFE FITNESS

FITCO

FREEMOTION FITNESS

ITEM |DESCRIPTION uom |QTY
1A Adjustable 10 - 80 Degrees Bench (#16000) |EA 2

Bravo All-in-One Functional Trainer (#8840
1B [Tall Heavy EA 1
1C Eagle Incline Pull EA 1
1D Utility Bench (#16030) EA 2
1E VR3 Rotary Torso (#12190) EA 1

CMJ-6000-1 4 STATION-SINGLE POD MULTI-
1F GYM EA 1
1G CMD-6180 CABLE CROSSOVER EA 1
1H CHIN-DIP ASSIST (#RS-1700) EA 1
11 LAT PULLDOWN (#RS-1201) EA 1
1) ROC-IT ABDOMINAL (#RS-1601) EA 1
1K ROC-IT BICEPS CURL (#RPL-5102) EA 1
1L ROC-IT UPRIGHT CHEST PRESS (#RPL-5301) EA 1
1M |ROC-IT CHESS PRESS (#RS-1301) EA 1
1N ROC-IT DECLINE CHEST PRESS (#RPL-5305) EA 1

ROC-IT GLUTEMASTER (#RS-1412) GLUTE
10 MACHINE EA 1
1P ROC-IT INCLINE CHEST PRESS (#RPL-5303) EA 1
1Q ROC-IT INNER THIGH (#RS-1406) EA 1
1R ROC-IT LAT PULLDOWN (#RPL-5201) EA 1
1S ROC-IT LATERAL RAISE (#RS-1502) EA 1
1T ROC-IT SEATED LEG EXTENSION (#RS-1401) |EA 1

ROC-IT DUAL ACTION SUPINE LEG PRESS (#rpl
1uU 5403) EA 1
1V ROC-IT SEATED LEG PRESS (#RS-1403) EA 1
1W |ROC-IT LOW BACK (#RS-1204) EA 1
1X ROC-IT OUTER THIGH (#RS-1407) EA 1
1Y ROC-IT PEC FLY (#RS-1302) EA 1
17 ROC-IT SEATED DIP (#RPL-5101) EA 1
1AA |ROC-IT SEATED MID ROW (#RPL-5203) EA 1
1AB |ROC-IT SEATED MID ROW (#RS-1203) EA 1
1AC |ROC-IT SHOULDER PRESS (#RPL-5501) EA 1
1AD |ROC-IT SHOULDER PRESS (#RS-1501) EA 1
1AE |SEATED BICEPS CURL (#RS1102) EA 1
1AF |SEATED CALF RAISE (#RPL-5363) EA 1
1AG |SEATED DIP (#RS-1101) EA 1
1AH |SEATED LEG CURL (#RS-1402) EA 1
1Al |MOTION CAGE JUNGLE GYM INCLUDES:

MC-7000 BASE UNIT (INCLUDES MONKEY

BARS, EA 1

ROCK WALL, FIXED PEG BOARD, DIP STATION,

JUMP

PLATFORM, 3-PAIRS STRAP/BAND STATIONS,

16 X

SHELVES AND 2 X CF-3950 UTILITY STOOLS)

MC-7022 REBOUNDER STATION (LOW

TARGET) EA 1

MC-7023 TARGET STATION (MEDIUM AND

HIGH TARGETS EA 1

MC-7021 HEAVY BAG MOUNTING STATION |EA 1

MC-7033 HEAVY BAG (6' TALL 14" DIAMETER

BAG WITH HEAVY DUTY NYLON STRAPS AND

SYNTHETIC LEATHER CONSTRUCTION) EA 1

MC-7027 CHIN-UP STATION (ANGLED,

NEUTRAL, ROCK CLIMGING AND EXTRA WIDE

STRAIGHT GRIPPING OPTIONS) EA 1

MC-7025 RENEGADE SATION (FUNCTIONAL

OLYMPIC BAR EXERCISER) EA 1

MC-7030 CAGE SHELF 8-5/8" DEEP X 27"

LONG X 3" TALL EA 18
1AJ |PRO SERIES HALF CAGE (#3226-9) EA 4

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

$ 73,041.20

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

156,330.00

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID




1AK |VIBEPLATE PLATFORM (#7007) EA 1| NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1AL |SINGLE LANDMINE (#3233) EA 2| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1AM |DUAL LAND MINE (#3235) EA 2| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PRO SERIES CAGE TECHNIQUE TRAYS (#3226-

1AN |T) PAIR 2| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1A0 |OBLIQUE FLEXOR (#3160) EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1AP |PERFORMANCE PLYO CUSHION SET (#3231) |SET 2| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1AQ |STANDING LEG CURL (#970) EA 1| NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1AR |HORIZONTAL BUMPER RACK (#3163) EA 2| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LANDMINE/GRAPPLER WIDE HANDLES

1AS |(#3220W) EA 1| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1AT [VIBEPLATE 2440 VIBRATION PLATFORM EA 1 2,195.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1AU |LIFTING AREA FLOOR NO BID NOBID [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRADE-INS

1AV [#01 PARAMOUND AP-2800 LEG PRESS EA 1

1AW [#02 PARAMOUNT AP-2000 LEG EXTENSION  |EA 1

1AX [#02 PARAMOUNT AP-2000 LEG EXTENSION  |EA 1

1AY |[#04 PARAMOUNT AP-2100 LEATED LEG CURL |EA 1

1AZ |#05 HAMMER STRENGTH SQUAT LUNGE EA 1

1BA |#06 BODY MASTERS S110A STANDING LEG CU|EA 1

1BB |#07 PARAMOUNT AP-4100 HORIZONTAL LEG {EA 1

1BC |#08 PARAMOUNT AP-4600 ROTARY INCLINE EA 1

1BD |#09 PARAMOUN AP-4400 ROTAR SHOULDER HEA 1

1BE |#10 PARAMOUN AP-4200 ROTARY CHEST PRE{EA 1

1BF |#11 BODY MASTER SEATED PEC DEC-VERTICA]EA 1

1BG |#12 PARAMOUN AP-3400 PEC/FLY REAR DELT|EA 1

1BH |#13 HAMMER STRENGTH MTS DECLINE PRESY EA 1

1Bl |#14 PARAMOUNT AP-2200 TRICEPS EXTENSIOEA 1

1BJ |#15 PARAMOUNT AP-2300 BICEPS CURL EA 1

1BK |#16 HAMMER STRENGTH MTS HIGH ROW  |EA 1

1BL |#17 PARAMOUNT AP-4300 ROTARY UPPER BAEA 1

1BM |#18 PARAMOUNT AP-4500 ROTARY LAT PULL]EA 1

1BN |#19 PARAMOUNT AP-3800 HIP ADDUCTOR  |EA 1

1BO |#20 PARAMOUNT AP-3900 HIP ABDUCTOR  |EA 1

1BP |#21 PARAMOUNT AP-3200 ABDOMINAL EA 1

1BQ |#22 FREE MOTION ABDOMINAL EA 1

1BR |#23 PARAMOUNT AP-2900 MULTI-HIP EA 1

1BS |#24 PARAMOUNT AP-3000 ROTARY TORSO  |EA 1

1BT |#25 PARAMOUNT AP-3300 LOWER BACK EA 1

1BU |#27 HAMMER STRENGTH 4-WAY NECK EA 1

1BV |#28 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED LEG HEA 1

1BW |#29 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED LEG (EA 1

1BX |#30 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED SHOUEA 1

1BY |#31 NEBULA PLATE LOADED LEVER ROW EA 1

1BZ |#32 HAMMER STRENGTH LAT PULLOVER EA 1

1CA |#33 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED BICEREA 1

1CB |#34 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED SEAT|EA 1

1CC |#35 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED CHES|EA 1

1CD |#36 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED INCLI|EA 1

1CE |#37 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED DECL|EA 1

1CF |#38 INTEGRA STRENGTH PLATE LOADED LAT AEA 1

1CG [#39 PARAMOUNT PFW-5500 T-BAR ROW EA 1

1CH |#40 HOIST ROC-IT LEG PRESS EA 1

1C1  |#41 PRECOR ICARIAN SUPER SQUAT 624 EA 1

1C) [#42 NABULA ISOLATERAL LEG PRESS EA 1

1CK |#43 NABULA ANGLED LEG PRESS EA 1

1CL |#44 NEBULA HACK SQUAT EA 1

1CM |#45 PARAMOUNT SEATED CALF EA 1

1CN [#48 HAMMER STRENGTH COMBO TWIST EA 1

1CO |#49 MAGNUM BIANGULAR JAMMER EA 1

1CP [#51 YORK SMITH MACHINE EA 1

1CQ |#53 NEBULA BARBELL PREACHER BENCH EA 1




1CR [#55 FREE MOTION CABLE CROSS EA 1
1CS |#56 PARAMOUNT PFW-8500 MULTI-STATION|EA 1
1CT |#57 FREE MOTION LIFT EA 1
1CU |#58 NEBULA PLATE LOADED VERTICAL LEG PR|EA 1
1CV |#59 FREEMOTION CALF EA 1
1CW [#60 PARAMOUNT AP-3500 CALF RAISE EA 1
1CX [#61 MUSCLE DYNAMICS MAXICAM GLUTE BLAEA 1
1CY |#62 PARAMOUNT AP-4000 CHIN/DIP EA 1
1Cz |#63 HAMMER STRENGTH PLATE LOADED TIBIAEA 1
1DA |#65 PARAMOUNT PFW-5600 BACK HYPEREXT|EA 1
1DB |#66 MUSCLE DYNAMICS MAXICAM OBLIQUE HEA 1
1DC |#67 PERFORMANCE SS GLUTE/HAM EA 1
1DD |HAMMER STRENGTH ADJUSTABLE BENCH EA 1
1DE |HAMMER STRENGTH FWADJ BOO ADJUSTABLHEA 1
1DF [HOIST ADJUSTABLE BENCH EA 2
1DG |KETTLE BELL RACK EA 1
1DH |MAGNUM WEIGHT PLATE TREE EA 1
1Dl |MAGNUM WEIGHT PLATE TREE EA 1
1DJ |MAGNUM WEIGHT PLATE TREE EA 1
1DK |MAGNUM WEIGHT PLATE TREE EA 1
1DL |MAGNUM WEIGHT PLATE TREE EA 1
1DM |MAGNUM WEIGHT PLATE TREE EA 1
MUSCLE DYNAMICS MAXICAM 3 TIER
1DN [DUMBBELL RACK EA 1
MUSCLE DNAMICS MAXICAM 4 PAIR
1DO [DUMBBELL RACK EA 1
MUSCLE DYNAMICS MAXICAM STANDING
1DP [INCLINE BENCH EA 1
1DQ |NEBULA ACCESSORY RACK EA 1
1DR [NEBULA DECLINE BENCH EA 1
NEBULA HALF-RACK WITH NARROW
1DS [PLATFORM & ADJUSTABLE BENCH EA 3
1DT |NEBULA HALF-RACK WITH WIDE PLATFORM |EA 1
NEBULA HALF-RACK WITH WIDE PLATFORM
1DU | (*BROKEN STORAGE RACK) EA 2
PROMAXIMA 5-BALL VERTICAL MEDICINE
1DV |BALL RACK EA 1
1DW |PROMAXIMA PLYO PLATFORM (SET OF 3) SET 2
1DX |PROMAXIMA WEIGHT PLATE TREE EA 2
1DY |YORK 20-PAIR TWO TIER DUMBBELL RACK EA 3
1Dz |YORK UTILIT BENCH EA 2
1EA |YORK WEIGHT PLATE TREE EA 2
PROSYSTEMS |STAR TRAC FREEMOTION
PRO MAXIMA |MFACLLC LIFE FITNESS |FITCO
INC FITNESS FITNESS
SUB TOTAL INCPKG
PRICE $ 219500 NOBID [s 73,041.20 NO BID NO BID $ 156,330.00 NO BID
Not a Not a
complete complete
package package
GROUP B (2A - 2F) NEW EQUIPMENT
DUAL CABLE CROSS FUNCTIONAL TRAINER
2A |(#F624) EA 2
2B PEC FLY/REAR DELTOID (#F806) EA 1
2C PRONE LEG CURL (#F814) EA 1
2D ROTARY TORSO (#F818) EA 1
2E SMITH MACHINE (#F211) EA 1
2F SEATED LEG EXTENSION (#F801) EA 1
PROSYSTEMS | STAR TRAC |PRO MAXIMA |MFAC LLC FREEMOTION
INC FITNESS LIFE FITNESS |FITCO FITNESS
SUB TOTAL PKG
PRICE NO BID NO BID $ 16,493.00 | $ 26,050.00 | $ 18,600.00 NO BID $ 24,472.37

PRO VIAXTVMIAdid not meet Specifications
under Group B for the following Line Items:
2A No Effective Resistance per arm noted.
Lower Dimensions submitted. 2D
Requested 175 Ib Weight Stack vendor
submitted 150 lbs. 2E Does not have 82.5"
Bar Height. 2F Does not have Leg Assembly

1 - 11 start positions and Weight Stack of
785 lhe




LIFE FITNESS did not meet Specifications
under Group B for the following Line Items:
2A Does not have Two independent dual
axis pivoting arms, 3:1 Cable Ratio and
Effective resistance per arm of 75 Ibs. 2C
Does not have Contoured arm supports. 2D
Does not have Upper Body Rotation. 2E
Does not have Height: 95". 2F Does not have
Leg assembly 1 - 11 start positions.

GROUP C (3A - 3J) NEW EQUIPMENT

3A  |KETTLEBALL - 20 LB, ROYAL BLUE (#60124)  |ga 2
38 |KETTLEBALL 25 LB, MAROON (#69-125) EA 2
3Cc  |KETTLEBALL 30 LB, GRAY (#69-126) EA 2
3D |KETTLEBALL 35 LB, BLACK (#69-127) EA 2
3 |TYROBALL 3 LB, RED (#68-839) EA 4
3F |TYROBALL 5LB, PURPLE (#68-841) EA 4
3G |TYROBALL 8 LB, GREEN (#68-844) EA 4
34 |TYROBALL 10 LB, BROWN (#6-857) EA 4
31 |TYROBALL 12 LB, GRAY (#68-858) EA 4
3]  |TYROBALL 15 LB, BLACK (#68-859) EA 4
PRO SYSTEMS| STAR TRAC MFACLLC FITCO FREEMOTION
INC FITNESS |PRO MAXIMA LIFE FITNESS FITNESS
SUB TOTAL e PKs
PRICE NO BID NOBID |$ 2,178.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PRO MAXIMA did not meet Specifications
under Group C
for the following Line Items: 3E - 3) Does
not have TYROBALLS. NO AWARD
GROUP D (4A - 41) NEW EQUIPMENT
4A |DUMBBELLS 10 LB PAIR 1
48 |DUMBBELLS 15LB PAIR 1
4C |DUMBBELLS 20 LB PAIR 1
4D |DUMBBELLS 25 LB PAIR 1
4E  |DUMBBELLS 30 LB PAIR 1
4F |DUMBBELLS 50 LB PAIR 1
4G |DUMBBELLS 55 LB PAIR 1
4H |DUMBBELLS 60 LB PAIR 1
41 |DUMBBELLS 70 LB PAIR 1
PRO SYSTEMS| STAR TRAC FREEMOTION
INC FITNESS |PRO MAXIMA |MFACLLC LIFE FITNESS FITCO FITNESS
INC PKG
SUB TOTAL PRICE NO BID NOBID |$ 1,937.00 NOBID |$ 3,053.97 NO BID NO BID
PRO MAXIMA did not meet Specification
under Group D for the following Line Items:
4A - 41 Does not have Twelve-sided Anti-roll
Steel Heads for the Dumbbells.
GROUPE (5A - 5C) NEW EQUIPMENT
MAXICAM TWO TIER, 10 PAIR REINFORCED
5A |DUMBBELL RACK (#3006AQ) EA 3
MAXICAM TWO TIER, 6 PAIR DUMBBELL
5B |RACK 3006R EA 2
sc  [MAXICAM STANDING INCLINE BENCH 3011A |, 1
PRO SYSTEMS| STAR TRAC FREEMOTION
INC FITNESS |PRO MAXIMA |MFACLLC LIFE FITNESS FITCO FITNESS
INC PKG
SUB TOTAL PRICE NO BID NOBID |$ 2,552.00| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PRO MAXIMA did not meet Specifications
under Group E for the following Line Items:
5A Does not have Two Tier, 10 Pair
reinforced Dumbbell Rack. 5B Does not have
Two Tier, 6 Pair Dumbbell Rack. 5C Does not
have Standing Incline Bench 3011A. NO
AWARD

GROUP F (6A - 6D) NEW EQUIPMENT




6A
6B
6C
6D

ADJUSTABLE BACK HYPEREXTENSION (#IP-
B7514)

WEIGHT PLATE TREE (#1P-R7513)
ADJUSTABLE DECLINE BENCH (#ip-B7508)
PREACHER CURL BENCH (#ip-B7509)

[ L B

PRO SYSTEMS
INC

STAR TRAC
FITNESS

PRO MAXIMA

MFACLLC

LIFE FITNESS

FITCO

FREEMOTION
FITNESS

SUB TOTAL

INC PKG
PRICE

NO BID

$ 6,624.60

«

2,579.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

PRO MAXIMA did not meet Specifications
under Group F for the following Line Items:
6A Does not have Five different positions
ranging from 35 to 55 Degrees. 6B Does not
have Two (2) storage sleeves to
accommodate 5-foot Olympic bars with four
(4) sides with three (3) horns per side. 6C
Does not have 0 - 30 Degrees decline in at
least Seven (7) increments. 6D Does not
have Gas assisted adjustable seat.

GROUP G (7A - 7D) NEW EQUIPMENT

7A

78

7C

7D

10-LB (BLACK) BUMPER PLATES METAL CORE
DIAMEER: 90MM (3.543") PLATE THICKNESS:
21.5MM (0.846")

25-LB (BLACK) BUMPER PLATES METAL CORE
DIAMETER: 150MM (5.906") PLATE

THICKNESS: 36MM (1.417")
35-1B (BLACK) BUMPER PLATES METAL CORE

DIAMETERa: 150MM (5.906") PLATE

THICKNESS: 43MM (1.693")
45-1B (BLACK) BUMPER PLATES METAL CORE

DIAMETER: 150MM (5.906") PLATE
THICKNESS: 52MM (2.047")

EA

EA

EA

EA

PRO SYSTEMS
INC

STAR TRAC
FITNESS

PRO MAXIMA

MFACLLC

LIFE FITNESS

FITCO

FREEMOTION
FITNESS

SUB TOTAL

INC PKG
PRICE

NO BID

NO BID

$ 1,598.00

23

724.00

$ 1,796.56

NO BID

NO BID

GROUP H (8A -8C) NEW EQUIPMENT

8A
8B
8C

VIBEPLATE 3048 VIBRATION PLATFORM
VIBEPLATE XL VIBRATION PLATFORM

VIBEPLATE DOUBLE HANDRAILS
8A -8C
SHIPPING

EA
PAIR

S 6,590.00
S 295.00

SUB TOTAL

INC PKG
PRICE

$ 6,885.00

NO BID

$ 10,396.00

$ 7,290.00

NO BID

$

7,185.00

NO BID

PRO SYSTEMS
INC

STAR TRAC
FITNESS

PRO MAXIMA

MFACLLC

LIFE FITNESS

FITCO

FREEMOTION
FITNESS

GROUP | (9 - 17) INDIVIDUAL PRICING -
NEW EQUIPMENT

10
11

12
13A

13B

14
15A

VMX ROPE TRAINER
2-SIDED VERTICAL 6-PAIR DUMBBELL RACK

SP-6500H CALF RAISE

SUPER SQUAT (#624) PLATE LOADED SQUAT
MACHINE

8-WAY NECK MACHINE (#p-8000)
PERFORMANCE PLUS PL-123 POWER BENCH

(WITH FOOTREST)
WARHAMMER PLUS RENEGADE/LANDMINE
HANDLE

ROGUE BAR OLYMPIC BARBELL BAR

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

$ 7,199.00

wn

650.00
$ 1,799.00

$  1,999.00
$ 1,999.00

$ 1,050.00

$ 736.00
$ 660.00

$ 4,495.00
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
$  395.54
$ 2,815.86

$ 2,632.13
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

4,950.00
NO BID
3,750.00

3,295.00
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

15B

16
17

WOMEN'S SILVER & BLACK ROGUE BAR

(PW0007-15) OLYMPIC BARBELL BAR
SHUTTLE 2000-1 CLINICAL PLUS REHAB

PLATFORM
ACCESSORY RACK

EA

EA
EA

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

$ 597.00

$  9,299.00
$ 325.00

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
$  666.62

$

NO BID

NO BID
385.00

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

SUB TOTAL

NO BID

NO BID

$ 26,313.00

S 4,495.00

$ 6,510.15

12,380.00

NO BID




PRO MAXIMA did not meet Specifications
under Group | for the following Line Items:
No. 11 No adjustments required on Seated
Design. No. 12 Does not have - 2x4-inch
bent Steel Tubing. No. 14 Does not have
dimensions or information to fit the end of
Olympic Bar. No. 15A No center knurling
requested. Does not have high quality
bronze bushings. No. 15B Does not have
Weight of 33 Ibs and Bar length 79-3/8. No.
16 Does not have Clinical Plus Rehab
Platform. No. 17 Does not have Three (3)
Shelves and 12 Pegs/Horns.

LIFE FITNESS did not meet Specifications
under Group | for the following Line Items.
No. 11 Requires NO adjustments. No. 12
Used both Face-in and Face-out, Length: 70
inches. NO AWARD

STAR TRAC

PRO SYSTEMS FITNESS PRO MAXIMA MFACLLC LIFE FITNESS FITCO FREEMOTION FITNESS
Did not quote on all Did not quote on all] Did not quote on all
items items items

This bid is awarded by Groups to Lowest responsible bidder meeting Specifications:
Group A - Awarded to FITCO

Group B - Awarded to Freemotion Fitness

Group C - No Award

Group D - Awarded to Life Fitness

Group E - No Award

Group F - Awarded to Star Trac Fitness

Group G - Awarded to MFAC LLC

Group H - Awarded to Pro Systems Inc.

Group | - No Award

EMP: 10/24/2013










