Specifications for Initial 15 Classrooms

CLASSROOM AUDIO/VISUAL INSTALLATION (B002280 )

Howard Technology Summit Integration Systems All Pro Sound Xerox Audio Visual Interactive Solutions Inc | M3 Technology Group | Technical Innovation
Iltem | Manufacturer Model Part # Description [QTY|Unit Price Exterlded Unit Price Extended Price UT‘" Exterlded UT‘" Exterlded Unit Price Extepded Unit Price Exterlded UT‘" Extepded
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
DM
1 Crestron DMPS-300-C DMPS-300-C Presentation] 15 | 4,120.00 | 61,800.00 4,706.00 70,590.00 4,560.00] 68,400.00| 4,152.56 | 62,288.40| 4,040.00 60,600.00 4,044.94 | 60,674.10 | 4,367.82| 65,517.30
System
2 Crestron | DM-RMC-Scaler-C | DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM Receiver| 15 | 721.00 | 10,815.00 82355 12,35325 | 798.00 [11,970.00| 726.70 |10,900.50| 705.00 | 10575.00 | 707.87 | 10,618.05 | 764.37 | 11,465.55
3 Crestron TPS-6L TPS-6L Touchpanel | 15 | 1,236.00 | 18,540.00 823.55 12,353.25 1,413.60]21,204.00] 1,245.77 | 18,686.55] 1,200.00 18,000.00 1,213.48 | 18,202.20 | 1,310.34 | 19,655.10
4 Crestron FT-PWR-D-B FT-PWR-D-B pov'\:llelFr)-::izter 15 | 464.00 6,960.00 529.43 7,941.45 513.00 | 7,695.00 | 467.16 | 7,007.40 450.00 6,750.00 455.06 6,825.90 491.38 7,370.70
DM 8G
5 Crestron DM-8G-CONN-100| DM-8G-CONN-100 Cable 5 258.00 1,290.00 294.15 1,470.75 285.00 | 1,425.00 | 259.54 | 1,297.70 56.00 280.00 252.81 1,264.05 272.99 1,364.95
Connector
Video
6 Extron MDA 3V 60-439-01 Distribution | 3 103.00 309.00 127.90 383.70 114.00 342.00 110.35 331.05 115.00 345.00 112.36 337.08 114.94 344.82
Amplifier
DVI
7 Extron DVIDA 2 60-886-02 Distribution | 15 | 242.00 3,630.00 300.50 4,507.50 267.90 | 4,018.50 | 259.32 | 3,889.80 260.00 3,900.00 264.04 3,960.60 270.11 4,051.65
Amplifier
Universal
8 Extron RSU 126 60-190-10 Rack Shelf | 15 67.00 1,005.00 83.15 1,247.25 74.10 | 1,111.50 7173 1,075.95 73.00 1,095.00 73.03 1,095.45 74.71 1,120.65
Kit
Single Link
9 Extron DVID SL Pro/6 26-649-06 DVI-D Cable| 30 31.00 930.00 38.40 1,152.00 34.20 | 1,026.00 33.11 993.30 33.00 990.00 33.71 1,011.30 34.48 1,034.40
&
HDMI to DVI
10 Extron HDMI DVI-D/3 26-614-01 D Cable 3' 15 21.00 315.00 25.60 384.00 22.80 342.00 22.07 331.05 22.50 337.50 22.47 337.05 22.99 344.85
HDMI Cable
11 Extron HDMI Pro/6 26-650-06 6 15 32.00 480.00 38.80 582.00 34.20 513.00 33.11 496.65 33.40 501.00 33.71 505.65 34.48 517.20
Flexible
12 Extron HDMI Ultra/6 26-663-06 HDMI Cable| 15 36.00 540.00 44.75 671.25 39.90 598.50 38.62 579.30 39.00 585.00 39.33 589.95 40.23 603.45
)
Micro VGA
13 Extron MVGA M-M/6 26-567-02 Cable 6 15 22.00 330.00 26.85 402.75 23.94 359.10 23.17 347.55 23.50 352.50 23.60 354.00 24.14 362.10
Captive
14 Extron CSM 6 26-620-01 Screwto F | 45 14.00 630.00 16.65 749.25 14.82 666.90 14.35 645.75 14.50 652.50 14.61 657.45 14.94 672.30
3.5 mm
3.5mm
15 Extron A Mini/é 26-571-03 Stereo Audio] 45 4.00 180.00 3.85 173.25 3.42 153.90 331 148.95 3.35 150.75 3.37 151.65 3.45 155.25
&
16 Juice Goose RM 115 RM 115 Coiz‘i/t\g;er 15 | 218.00 3,270.00 183.55 2,753.25 200.64 | 3,009.60 | 227.32 | 3,409.80 200.00 3,000.00 189.59 2,843.85 202.30 3,034.50
17 JBL Control 26CT Control 26CT ;r;_g::!g]ri 78 131.00 | 10,218.00 138.60 10,810.80 134.30 | 10,475.40| 123.50 | 9,633.00 137.00 10,686.00 124.72 9,728.16 67.71 5,281.38
18 Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36457 Scféce)]:ci%rg,, 11 | 201.00 2,211.00 229.45 2,523.95 211.19 | 2,323.09 | 215.18 | 2,366.98 185.00 2,035.00 195.39 2,149.29 224.14 2,465.54
19 Panasonic PT-FW430U PT-FW430U Projector 14 | 1,482.00 | 20,748.00 1,700.00 23,800.00 1,435.94]20,103.16] 1,521.05 | 21,294.70] 1,620.00 22,680.00 1,590.00 | 22,260.00 ] 1,605.56 | 22,477.84
20 SMART SP 524 SP524 Symf)idium 3 No Bid No Bid 2,222.34 6,667.02 2,519.00] 7,557.00 | 2,084.53 | 6,253.59 2,350.00 7,050.00 2,499.00 7,497.00 | 2,488.51| 7,465.53
12inch,
21 Audix M40W12HC M40W12HC hyper- 12 264.00 3,168.00 268.55 3,222.60 260.21 | 3,122.52 | 251.88 | 3,022.56 255.00 3,060.00 231.90 2,782.80 262.36 3,148.32
cardioid
22 Sony EVI-D100 EVID100 PTZ camera] 3 734.00 2,202.00 941.20 2,823.60 800.28 | 2,400.84 | 882.81 | 2,648.43 1,050.00 3,150.00 816.85 2,450.55 ] 1,020.69| 3,062.07
Camera wall
23 Sony CAMWMBKT CAMWMBKT mount 3 66.00 198.00 47.05 141.15 95.76 287.28 55.18 165.54 Included Included 68.54 205.62 67.24 201.72
bracket
24 Legrand OFR Series OFRBC-8 ';I?()O[reztog:j 6 232.00 1,392.00 239.25 1,435.50 28.98 173.88 278.08 | 1,668.48 224.00 1,344.00 249.00 1,494.00 29.22 175.32
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PC locking
25 Kensington Locking Kit K64617S kit, 15 36.00 540.00 32.45 486.75 34.99 524.85 34.99 524.85 32.00 480.00 29.21 438.15 24.18 362.70
supervisor
Rack
26 Raxxess PNTX-100 PNTX-100 security 5 16.00 80.00 17.65 88.25 15.39 76.95 15.23 76.15 23.00 115.00 16.85 84.25 17.24 86.20
screws
27 Chief CMS009 CMS009 Prgjsl(;tor 14 19.00 266.00 15.90 222.60 19.70 275.80 20.13 281.82 19.50 273.00 21.57 301.98 20.97 293.58
28 Chief CMS-440 CMS-440 %ﬁ;ll:nn? 14 53.00 742.00 54.15 758.10 76.95 | 1,077.30 78.63 1,100.82 64.00 896.00 66.29 928.06 81.90 1,146.60
29 Chief RPMAU RPMAU P’r\:)li)eucr::)r 14 139.00 1,946.00 122.35 1,712.90 162.11 | 2,269.54 | 141.23 | 1,977.22 140.00 1,960.00 149.95 2,099.30 155.28 2,173.92
30 Projector Screen mounting brackets 11 | 11.00* | 121.00 11.80 129.80 16.25 | 17875 | 1595 | 17545 | Included | Included 10.11 11121 | 1149 | 126.39
One-Year On-Site Warranty No Bid 7,600.00 Included 7,260.10 7,500.00 4,500.00 12,898.67
31 Additional cables and connectors No Bid 3,000.00 5,000.00 2,069.10 1,500.00 2,940.00 14,380.00
32 Installation & Programming 15,555.05 84,576.00] 16,878.74 48,517.76 35,550.00] 30,600.00 53,560.00
Total 170,411.05] **267,713.92 *%%195,560.10 221,466.25 206,393.25 199,998.70 246,920.55
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Mfg Warranties apply;
Warranty Stnd Mfg Warranty 1 Year 1 Year 1 Yr On-Site 12 Months 1 Year 90 Day Installation
Estimated Delivery| 7-10 Business Days 45 Days ARO 15-30 Days 2-Jun-14 1-Jun-14 60 Days
* #40932 **Crestron CEN-SW-POE-5 5 Port | ***If performance ****|nstallation Pricing *****performance
Switch required for system and payment bonds assumes lecturns and desks Bond, if awarded,
configuration: 15 @ $235.30; are required add are shipped from $4,000 would bring total
Brings total to $271,243.42 $3808.60 which manufacturer to be bid to $203,998.70
would bring total to assembled at Interactive
$199,368.70 Solutions, Inc location;
Programming Price assumes|
that all coding is functional
and works properly upon
receipt. Correction of
customer provided
nonfuctioning code will be
additional cost.




