Madison Hall Room 200

Manufacturer Model Part # Description QTY
Crestron DMPS-300-C DMPS-300-C DM Presentation System 1
Crestron DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM Receiver 1
Crestron TPS-6L TPS-6L Touchpanel 1
Crestron FT-PWR-D-B FT-PWR-D-B Flip-top power center 1
Crestron RoomView Express SW-ROOMVW-ENT Remote admin software
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 DM 8G Cable, non-plenum
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 DM 8G Cable, plenum
Crestron DM-8G-CONN-100 DM-8G-CONN-100 DM 8G Cable Connector

Extron MDA 4V SDI 60-448-01 SDI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron DVI DA 2 60-886-02 DVI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron RSU 126 60-190-10 Universal Rack Shelf Kit 1
Extron DVID SL Pro/6 26-649-06 Single Link DVI-D Cable 6' 2
Extron HDMI DVI-D/3 26-614-01 HDMI to DVI-D Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/3 26-650-03 HDMI Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/6 26-650-06 HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron HDMI Ultra/6 26-663-06 Flexible HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron MVGA M-M/6 26-567-02 Micro VGA Cable 6' 1
Extron CSM 6 26-620-01 Captive Screw to F 3.5 mm 3
Extron A Mini/6 26-571-03 3.5 mm Stereo Audio 6' 3
Juice Goose RM 115 RM 115 Power Conditioner 1
JBL Control 26CT Control 26CT In-ceiling speakers 8
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36457 Projector screen, 109" 1
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36453 Projector screen, 94"
Panasonic PT-FW430U PT-FW430U Projector 1
Epson Powerlite 485W Powerlite 485W Projector
SMART SP 524 SP524 24" Sympodium 1
Audix M40W12HC M40W12HC 12 inch, hyper-cardioid 4
Audix M40WG6HC M40W6 6 inch, cardioid
Sony EVI-D100 EVID100 PTZ camera 1
Sony CAMWMBKT CAMWMBKT Camera wall mount bracket 1
Blackmagic Des DeckLink Studio BDLKSTUDIO2 Video capture card 1
Wiremold Floor cord protector CDG15 Floor cord protector 1
Kensington Locking Kit K64617S PC locking kit, supervisor 1
Raxxess PNTX-100 PNTX-100 Rack security screws 1
Chief CMS009 CMS009 Projector Pole 1
Chief CMS-440 CMS-440 Ceiling Mount 1
Chief RPMAU RPMAU Projector Mount 1

UAH

Additional cables and connectors

Installation & Programming




Madison Hall Room 207

Manufacturer Model Part # Description QTY
Crestron DMPS-300-C DMPS-300-C DM Presentation System 1
Crestron DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM Receiver 1
Crestron TPS-6L TPS-6L Touchpanel 1
Crestron FT-PWR-D-B FT-PWR-D-B Flip-top power center 1
Crestron RoomView Express SW-ROOMVW-ENT Remote admin software
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 DM 8G Cable, non-plenum
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 DM 8G Cable, plenum
Crestron DM-8G-CONN-100 DM-8G-CONN-100 DM 8G Cable Connector

Extron MDA 4V SDI 60-448-01 SDI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron DVI DA 2 60-886-02 DVI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron RSU 126 60-190-10 Universal Rack Shelf Kit 1
Extron DVID SL Pro/6 26-649-06 Single Link DVI-D Cable 6' 2
Extron HDMI DVI-D/3 26-614-01 HDMI to DVI-D Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/3 26-650-03 HDMI Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/6 26-650-06 HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron HDMI Ultra/6 26-663-06 Flexible HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron MVGA M-M/6 26-567-02 Micro VGA Cable 6' 1
Extron CSM 6 26-620-01 Captive Screw to F 3.5 mm 3
Extron A Mini/6 26-571-03 3.5 mm Stereo Audio 6' 3
Juice Goose RM 115 RM 115 Power Conditioner 1
JBL Control 26CT Control 26CT In-ceiling speakers 4
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36457 Projector screen, 109" 1
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36453 Projector screen, 94"
Panasonic PT-FW430U PT-FW430U Projector 1
Epson Powerlite 485W Powerlite 485W Projector
SMART SP 524 SP524 24" Sympodium 1
Audix M40W12HC M40W12HC 12 inch, hyper-cardioid 4
Audix M40WG6HC M40W6 6 inch, cardioid
Sony EVI-D100 EVID100 PTZ camera 1
Sony CAMWMBKT CAMWMBKT Camera wall mount bracket 1
Blackmagic Des DeckLink Studio BDLKSTUDIO2 Video capture card 1
Wiremold Floor cord protector CDG15 Floor cord protector 1
Kensington Locking Kit K64617S PC locking kit, supervisor 1
Raxxess PNTX-100 PNTX-100 Rack security screws 1
Chief CMS009 CMS009 Projector Pole 1
Chief CMS-440 CMS-440 Ceiling Mount 1
Chief RPMAU RPMAU Projector Mount 1

UAH

Additional cables and connectors

Installation & Programming




Madison Hall Room 213

Manufacturer Model Part # Description QTY
Crestron DMPS-300-C DMPS-300-C DM Presentation System 1
Crestron DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM Receiver 1
Crestron TPS-6L TPS-6L Touchpanel 1
Crestron FT-PWR-D-B FT-PWR-D-B Flip-top power center 1
Crestron RoomView Express SW-ROOMVW-ENT Remote admin software
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 DM 8G Cable, non-plenum
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 DM 8G Cable, plenum
Crestron DM-8G-CONN-100 DM-8G-CONN-100 DM 8G Cable Connector

Extron MDA 4V SDI 60-448-01 SDI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron DVI DA 2 60-886-02 DVI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron RSU 126 60-190-10 Universal Rack Shelf Kit 1
Extron DVID SL Pro/6 26-649-06 Single Link DVI-D Cable 6' 2
Extron HDMI DVI-D/3 26-614-01 HDMI to DVI-D Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/3 26-650-03 HDMI Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/6 26-650-06 HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron HDMI Ultra/6 26-663-06 Flexible HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron MVGA M-M/6 26-567-02 Micro VGA Cable 6' 1
Extron CSM 6 26-620-01 Captive Screw to F 3.5 mm 3
Extron A Mini/6 26-571-03 3.5 mm Stereo Audio 6' 3
Juice Goose RM 115 RM 115 Power Conditioner 1
JBL Control 26CT Control 26CT In-ceiling speakers 6
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36457 Projector screen, 109"
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36453 Projector screen, 94"
Panasonic PT-FW430U PT-FW430U Projector
Epson Powerlite 485W Powerlite 485W Projector
SMART SP 524 SP524 24" Sympodium 1
Audix M40W12HC M40W12HC 12 inch, hyper-cardioid 4
Audix M40WG6HC M40W6 6 inch, cardioid
Sony EVI-D100 EVID100 PTZ camera 1
Sony CAMWMBKT CAMWMBKT Camera wall mount bracket 1
Blackmagic Des DeckLink Studio BDLKSTUDIO2 Video capture card 1
Wiremold Floor cord protector CDG15 Floor cord protector 1
Kensington Locking Kit K64617S PC locking kit, supervisor 1
Raxxess PNTX-100 PNTX-100 Rack security screws 1
Chief CMS009 CMS009 Projector Pole
Chief CMS-440 CMS-440 Ceiling Mount
Chief RPMAU RPMAU Projector Mount

UAH

Additional cables and connectors

Installation & Programming




Madison Hall Room 215

Manufacturer Model Part # Description QTY
Crestron DMPS-300-C DMPS-300-C DM Presentation System 1
Crestron DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM Receiver 1
Crestron TPS-6L TPS-6L Touchpanel 1
Crestron FT-PWR-D-B FT-PWR-D-B Flip-top power center 1
Crestron RoomView Express SW-ROOMVW-ENT Remote admin software
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 DM 8G Cable, non-plenum
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 DM 8G Cable, plenum
Crestron DM-8G-CONN-100 DM-8G-CONN-100 DM 8G Cable Connector

Extron MDA 4V SDI 60-448-01 SDI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron DVI DA 2 60-886-02 DVI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron RSU 126 60-190-10 Universal Rack Shelf Kit 1
Extron DVID SL Pro/6 26-649-06 Single Link DVI-D Cable 6' 2
Extron HDMI DVI-D/3 26-614-01 HDMI to DVI-D Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/3 26-650-03 HDMI Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/6 26-650-06 HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron HDMI Ultra/6 26-663-06 Flexible HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron MVGA M-M/6 26-567-02 Micro VGA Cable 6' 1
Extron CSM 6 26-620-01 Captive Screw to F 3.5 mm 3
Extron A Mini/6 26-571-03 3.5 mm Stereo Audio 6' 3
Juice Goose RM 115 RM 115 Power Conditioner 1
JBL Control 26CT Control 26CT In-ceiling speakers 6
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36457 Projector screen, 109"
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36453 Projector screen, 94"
Panasonic PT-FW430U PT-FW430U Projector
Epson Powerlite 485W Powerlite 485W Projector
SMART SP 524 SP524 24" Sympodium 1
Audix M40W12HC M40W12HC 12 inch, hyper-cardioid 4
Audix M40WG6HC M40W6 6 inch, cardioid
Sony EVI-D100 EVID100 PTZ camera 1
Sony CAMWMBKT CAMWMBKT Camera wall mount bracket 1
Blackmagic Des DeckLink Studio BDLKSTUDIO2 Video capture card 1
Wiremold Floor cord protector CDG15 Floor cord protector 1
Kensington Locking Kit K64617S PC locking kit, supervisor 1
Raxxess PNTX-100 PNTX-100 Rack security screws 1
Chief CMS009 CMS009 Projector Pole
Chief CMS-440 CMS-440 Ceiling Mount
Chief RPMAU RPMAU Projector Mount

UAH

Additional cables and connectors

Installation & Programming




Materials Science Room 215

Manufacturer Model Part # Description QTY
Crestron DMPS-300-C DMPS-300-C DM Presentation System 1
Crestron DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM Receiver 1
Crestron TPS-6L TPS-6L Touchpanel 1
Crestron FT-PWR-D-B FT-PWR-D-B Flip-top power center 1
Crestron RoomView Express SW-ROOMVW-ENT Remote admin software
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 DM 8G Cable, non-plenum
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 DM 8G Cable, plenum
Crestron DM-8G-CONN-100 DM-8G-CONN-100 DM 8G Cable Connector

Extron MDA 4V SDI 60-448-01 SDI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron DVI DA 2 60-886-02 DVI Distribution Amplifier 1
Extron RSU 126 60-190-10 Universal Rack Shelf Kit 1
Extron DVID SL Pro/6 26-649-06 Single Link DVI-D Cable 6' 2
Extron HDMI DVI-D/3 26-614-01 HDMI to DVI-D Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/3 26-650-03 HDMI Cable 3' 1
Extron HDMI Pro/6 26-650-06 HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron HDMI Ultra/6 26-663-06 Flexible HDMI Cable 6' 1
Extron MVGA M-M/6 26-567-02 Micro VGA Cable 6' 1
Extron CSM 6 26-620-01 Captive Screw to F 3.5 mm 3
Extron A Mini/6 26-571-03 3.5 mm Stereo Audio 6' 3
Juice Goose RM 115 RM 115 Power Conditioner 1
JBL Control 26CT Control 26CT In-ceiling speakers 4
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36457 Projector screen, 109"
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36453 Projector screen, 94" 1
Panasonic PT-FW430U PT-FW430U Projector
Epson Powerlite 485W Powerlite 485W Projector 1
SMART SP 524 SP524 24" Sympodium 1
Audix M40W12HC M40W12HC 12 inch, hyper-cardioid
Audix M40W6HC M40W6 6 inch, cardioid 4
Sony EVI-D100 EVID100 PTZ camera 1
Sony CAMWMBKT CAMWMBKT Camera wall mount bracket 1
Blackmagic Des DeckLink Studio BDLKSTUDIO2 Video capture card 1
Wiremold Floor cord protector CDG15 Floor cord protector 1
Kensington Locking Kit K64617S PC locking kit, supervisor 1
Raxxess PNTX-100 PNTX-100 Rack security screws 1
Chief CMS009 CMS009 Projector Pole
Chief CMS-440 CMS-440 Ceiling Mount
Chief RPMAU RPMAU Projector Mount

UAH

Additional cables and connectors

Installation & Programming




Other - not tied to one specific room

Manufacturer Model Part # Description QTY
Crestron DMPS-300-C DMPS-300-C DM Presentation System
Crestron DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM Receiver
Crestron TPS-6L TPS-6L Touchpanel
Crestron FT-PWR-D-B FT-PWR-D-B Flip-top power center
Crestron RoomView Express SW-ROOMVW-ENT Remote admin software 1
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 DM 8G Cable, non-plenum 1
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 DM 8G Cable, plenum 1
Crestron DM-8G-CONN-100 DM-8G-CONN-100 DM 8G Cable Connector 1
Extron MDA 4V SDI 60-448-01 SDI Distribution Amplifier
Extron DVI DA 2 60-886-02 DVI Distribution Amplifier
Extron RSU 126 60-190-10 Universal Rack Shelf Kit
Extron DVID SL Pro/6 26-649-06 Single Link DVI-D Cable 6'
Extron HDMI DVI-D/3 26-614-01 HDMI to DVI-D Cable 3'
Extron HDMI Pro/3 26-650-03 HDMI Cable 3'
Extron HDMI Pro/6 26-650-06 HDMI Cable 6'
Extron HDMI Ultra/6 26-663-06 Flexible HDMI Cable 6'
Extron MVGA M-M/6 26-567-02 Micro VGA Cable 6'
Extron CSM 6 26-620-01 Captive Screw to F 3.5 mm
Extron A Mini/6 26-571-03 3.5 mm Stereo Audio 6'
Juice Goose RM 115 RM 115 Power Conditioner
JBL Control 26CT Control 26CT In-ceiling speakers
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36457 Projector screen, 109"
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36453 Projector screen, 94"
Panasonic PT-FW430U PT-FW430U Projector
Epson Powerlite 485W Powerlite 485W Projector
SMART SP 524 SP524 24" Sympodium
Audix M40W12HC M40W12HC 12 inch, hyper-cardioid
Audix M40WG6HC M40W6 6 inch, cardioid
Sony EVI-D100 EVID100 PTZ camera
Sony CAMWMBKT CAMWMBKT Camera wall mount bracket
Blackmagic Des DeckLink Studio BDLKSTUDIO2 Video capture card
Wiremold Floor cord protector CDG15 Floor cord protector
Kensington Locking Kit K64617S PC locking kit, supervisor
Raxxess PNTX-100 PNTX-100 Rack security screws
Chief CMS009 CMS009 Projector Pole
Chief CMS-440 CMS-440 Ceiling Mount
Chief RPMAU RPMAU Projector Mount

UAH

Additional cables and connectors

Installation & Programming




Total for all rooms

Manufacturer Model Part # Description QTY
Crestron DMPS-300-C DMPS-300-C DM Presentation System 5
Crestron DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM-RMC-Scaler-C DM Receiver 5
Crestron TPS-6L TPS-6L Touchpanel 5
Crestron FT-PWR-D-B FT-PWR-D-B Flip-top power center 5
Crestron RoomView Express SW-ROOMVW-ENT Remote admin software 1
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 DM 8G Cable, non-plenum 1
Crestron DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 | DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 DM 8G Cable, plenum 1
Crestron DM-8G-CONN-100 DM-8G-CONN-100 DM 8G Cable Connector 1

Extron MDA 4V SDI 60-448-01 SDI Distribution Amplifier 5
Extron DVI DA 2 60-886-02 DVI Distribution Amplifier 5
Extron RSU 126 60-190-10 Universal Rack Shelf Kit 5
Extron DVID SL Pro/6 26-649-06 Single Link DVI-D Cable 6' 10
Extron HDMI DVI-D/3 26-614-01 HDMI to DVI-D Cable 3' 5
Extron HDMI Pro/3 26-650-03 HDMI Cable 3' 5
Extron HDMI Pro/6 26-650-06 HDMI Cable 6' 5
Extron HDMI Ultra/6 26-663-06 Flexible HDMI Cable 6' 5
Extron MVGA M-M/6 26-567-02 Micro VGA Cable 6' 5
Extron CSM 6 26-620-01 Captive Screw to F 3.5 mm 15
Extron A Mini/6 26-571-03 3.5 mm Stereo Audio 6' 15
Juice Goose RM 115 RM 115 Power Conditioner 5
JBL Control 26CT Control 26CT In-ceiling speakers 28
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36457 Projector screen, 109" 2
Da-Lite Model B with CSR 36453 Projector screen, 94" 1
Panasonic PT-FW430U PT-FW430U Projector 2
Epson Powerlite 485W Powerlite 485W Projector 1
SMART SP 524 SP524 24" Sympodium 5
Audix M40W12HC M40W12HC 12 inch, hyper-cardioid 16
Audix M40WG6HC M40W6 6 inch, cardioid 4
Sony EVI-D100 EVID100 PTZ camera 5
Sony CAMWMBKT CAMWMBKT Camera wall mount bracket 5
Blackmagic Des DeckLink Studio BDLKSTUDIO2 Video capture card 5
Wiremold Floor cord protector CDG15 Floor cord protector 5
Kensington Locking Kit K64617S PC locking kit, supervisor 5
Raxxess PNTX-100 PNTX-100 Rack security screws 5
Chief CMS009 CMS009 Projector Pole 2
Chief CMS-440 CMS-440 Ceiling Mount 2
Chief RPMAU RPMAU Projector Mount 2
Additional cables and connectors 1

Installation & Programming 1

UAH




Items Installed Per Classroom M3 Technology Group, Inc. |Xerox Audio Visual Solutions| AVI-SPL Audio Visual Systems, Inc.
MDH | MDH | MDH [MDH2| MSC
200 | 207 | 213 15 113 | Total Extended Extended
Item Description Qty. | Qty. | Qty. | Qty. | Qty.| Qty. Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price| Unit Price Price
DM Presentation System, Crestron
1 Mfg. Part #: DMPS-300-C 1 1 1 1 1 5 $4,044.94 $20,224.70 | $4,546.00 $22,730.00 $4,445.00 $22,225.00 $ 2,75431| $ 13,771.55
DM Receiver, Crestron
2 Mfg. Part #: DM-RMC-Scaler-C 1 1 1 1 1 5 $707.87 $3,539.35 $796.00 $3,980.00 $778.00 $3,890.00 $ 866.17 | $ 4,330.85
Touchpanel, Crestron
3 Mfg. Part #: TPS-6L 1 1 1 1 1 5 $1,213.48 $6,067.40 | $1,364.00 $6,820.00 $1,334.00 $6,670.00 $1,388.00 | $ 6,940.00
Flip-top Power Center, Crestron
4 Mfg. Part #: FT-PWR-D-B 1 1 1 1 1 5 $455.06 $2,275.30 $512.00 $2,560.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $ 57492 | $ 2,874.60
Remote Admin Software, Crestron
5 Mfg. #: SW-ROOMVW-ENT 0 0 0 0 0 1 $1.00 $1.00 $2,841.00 $2,841.00 $2,778.00 $2,778.00 NO BID NO BID
DM 8G Cable, Non-Plenum, Crestron
6| Mfg. Part #: DM-CBL-8G-NP-SP500 0 0 0 0 0 1 $182.02 $182.02 $205.00 $205.00 $200.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID
DM 8G Cable, Plenum, Crestron
7|  Mfg. Part #: DM-CBL-8G-P-SP500 0 0 0 0 0 1 $303.37 $303.37 $341.00 $341.00 $334.00 $334.00 NO BID NO BID
DM 8G Cable Connector, Crestron
8 Mfg. Part #: DM-8G-CONN-100 0 0 0 0 0 1 $280.90 $280.90 $285.00 $285.00 $278.00 $278.00 NO BID NO BID
Extron MDA 3V Composite Video
Distribution Amplifier
9 Mfg. #: 60-439-01 1 1 1 1 1 5 $112.36 $561.80 $114.00 $570.00 $278.00 $1,390.00 $ 100.00| $ 500.00
DVI Distribution Amplifier, Extron
10 Mfg. Part #: 60-886-02 1 1 1 1 1 5 $264.04 $1,320.22 $268.00 $1,340.00 $262.00 $1,310.00 $ 30837 % 1,541.85
Universal Rack Shelf Kit, Extron
11 Mfg. Part #: 60-190-10 1 1 1 1 1 5 $73.03 $365.15 $74.00 $370.00 $73.00 $365.00 $ 87.07 | $ 435.35
Single Link DVI-D Cable 6', Extron
12 Mfg. Part #: 26-649-06 2 2 2 2 2 10 $33.71 $337.10 $23.00 $230.00 $34.00 $340.00 $ 4021 | $ 402.10
HDMI to DVI-D Cable 3', Extron
13 Mfg. Part #: 26-614-01 1 1 1 1 1 5 $22.47 $112.35 $23.00 $115.00 $23.00 $115.00 $ 2694 | $ 134.70
HDMI Cable 3', Extron
14 Mfg. Part #: 26-650-03 1 1 1 1 1 5 $22.47 $112.35 $23.00 $115.00 $23.00 $115.00 $ 2694 | $ 134.68
HDMI Cable 6', Extron
15 Mfg. Part #: 26-650-06 1 1 1 1 1 5 $33.71 $168.55 $35.00 $175.00 $34.00 $170.00 $ 40.36 | $ 201.78
Flexible HDMI Cable 6', Extron
16 Mfg. Part #: 26-663-06 1 1 1 1 1 5 $39.33 $196.65 $40.00 $200.00 $39.00 $195.00 $ 4705 | $ 235.36
Micro VGA Cable 6', Extron
17 Mfg. Part #: 26-567-02 1 1 1 1 1 5 $23.60 $118.00 $24.00 $120.00 $24.00 $120.00 $ 2828 | $ 141.40
Captive Screw to F 3.5 mm, Extron
18 Mfg. Part #: 26-620-01 3 3 3 3 3 15 $14.61 $219.15 $16.00 $240.00 $15.00 $225.00 $ 1747 | $ 262.03
3.5 mm Stereo Audio 6', Extron
19 Mfg. Part #: 26-571-03 3 3 3 3 3 15 $3.37 $50.55 $4.00 $60.00 $4.00 $60.00 $ 405 $ 60.68
Power Conditioner, Juice Goose
20 Mfg. Part #: RM 115 1 1 1 1 1 5 $197.75 $988.75 $186.00 $930.00 $182.00 $910.00 $ 21765( $ 1,088.25




Items Installed Per Classroom M3 Technology Group, Inc. |Xerox Audio Visual Solutions| AVI-SPL Audio Visual Systems, Inc.
MDH [ MDH | MDH [MDH2| MSC
200 | 207 | 213 15 113 | Total Extended Extended
Iltem Description Qty. | Qty. | Qty. [ Qty. | Qty.| Qty. Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price| Unit Price Price
Speakers, JBL In-ceiling
21 Mfg. Part #: Control 26CT 8 4 6 6 0 24 $132.37 $3,176.88 $135.00 $3,240.00 $118.00 $2,832.00 $ 14118 | $ 3,388.29
Speakers, Tannoy 19 White Line Array
21A Mfg. #: 8001-2930 0 0 0 0 2 2 $630.34 $1,260.68 $638.00 $1,276.00 $574.00 $1,148.00 $ 561.00(% 1,122.00
Yoke Mounts Speakers, Tannoy 19 White
21B Mfg. #: 8001-3030 0 0 0 0 2 2 $100.00 $200.00 $102.00 $204.00 $96.00 $192.00 $ 89.00 | $ 178.00
Projector screen, 109", Da-Lite
22 Mfg. Part #: 36457 1 1 0 0 0 2 $214.61 $429.22 $220.00 $440.00 $213.00 $426.00 $ 24940 | $ 498.81
Projector screen, 94", Da-Lite
23 Mfg. Part #: 36453 0 0 0 0 1 1 $187.64 $187.64 $190.00 $190.00 $186.00 $186.00 $ 21837 | $ 218.37
Projector, Panasonic
24 Mfg. Part #: PT-FW430U 1 1 0 0 0 2 $1,830.34 $3,660.68 | $1,635.00 $3,270.00 $1,591.00 $3,182.00 $ 1,965.68 | $ 3,931.37
Projector, Epson
25 Mfg. Part ;#: Powerpl‘ite 485W 0 0 0 0 1 1 $1,491.01 $1,491.01 | $1,325.00 $1,325.00 $1,475.00 $1,475.00 $ 161749 | $ 1,617.49
24" Sympodium, SMART
26 Mfg. Part #: SP524 1 1 1 1 1 5 $2,519.00 $12,595.00 | $2,150.00 $10,750.00 $2,099.00 $10,495.00 $ 2,578.08 | $ 12,890.40
12 inch, Hyper-Cardioid, Audix
27 Mfg. Part #: MAOW12HC 4 4 4 4 0 16 $231.90 $3,710.40 $250.00 $4,000.00 $254.00 $4,064.00 $ 26292|$ 4,206.69
6 inch, Cardioid, Audix
28 Mfg. Part #: M40W6 0 0 0 0 4 4 $220.15 $880.60 $240.00 $960.00 $242.00 $968.00 $ 27160 % 1,086.40
PTZ Camera, Sony
29 Mfg. Part #: EVID100 1 1 1 1 1 5 $841.57 $4,207.85 $875.00 $4,375.00 $742.00 $3,710.00 $ 97157 |$ 4,857.87
Camera Wall Mount Bracket, Sony
30 Mfg. Part #: CAMWMBKT 1 1 1 1 1 5 $68.54 $342.70 $56.00 $280.00 $65.00 $325.00 $ 69.52 | $ 347.59
Video Capture Card, Blackmagic Des
31 Mfg. Part #: BDLKSTUDIO2 1 1 1 1 1 5 $616.85 $3,084.25 $750.00 $3,750.00 $634.00 $3,170.00 $ 62177 % 3,108.85
Floor Cord Protector, Wiremold
32 Mfg. Part #: CDG15 1 1 1 1 1 5 $28.09 $140.45 $30.00 $150.00 $29.00 $145.00 $ 2591 | $ 129.55
PC Locking Kit, Supervisor, Kensington
33 Mfg. Part #: K64617S 1 1 1 1 1 5 $25.84 $129.20 $40.00 $200.00 $30.00 $150.00 $ 2693 | $ 134.63
Rack Security Screws, Raxxess
34 Mfg. Part #: PNTX-100 1 1 1 1 1 5 $16.85 $84.25 $16.00 $80.00 $16.00 $80.00 $ 2021 | $ 101.07
Projector Pole, Chief
35 Mfg. Part #: CMS009 1 1 0 0 0 2 $20.90 $41.80 $22.00 $44.00 $20.00 $40.00 $ 2380 | $ 47.60
Ceiling Mount, Chief
Mfg. Part #: CMS-440
36 1 1 0 0 0 2 $81.57 $163.14 $45.00 $90.00 $56.00 $112.00 $ 9234 | $ 184.69
Projector Mount, Chief
37 Mfg. Part #: RPMAU 1 1 0 0 0 2 $154.38 $308.76 $145.00 $290.00 $117.00 $234.00 $ 15172 | $ 303.44




M3 Technology Group, Inc. |Xerox Audio Visual Solutions AVI-SPL Audio Visual Systems, Inc.
All additional Cabling, terminations, and
hardware neccesary for complete
38 installation not listed above. $1,000.00 $850.00 $1,155.00 $ 6,000.00
39 One Year On-Site Warranty $2,950.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 INCLUDED
Installation and Programming for MDH-
40 200 $2,750.00 $3,600.00 $4,715.00 $ 7,722.00
Installation and Programming for MDH-
41 207 $2,750.00 $3,600.00 $4,715.00 $ 8,019.00
Installation and Programming for MDH-
42 213 $2,000.00 $3,600.00 $4,155.00 $ 7,755.00
Installation and Programming for MDH-
43 215 $2,000.00 $3,600.00 $4,155.00 $ 7,755.00
44| Installation and Programming for MSC-113 $3,000.00 $3,600.00 $4,715.00 $ 8,283.00
BID TOTAL $89,969.17 $100,991.00 $103,234.00 $ 116,942.19
Optional:
Cost for additional classrooms that may
be added during the period of this bid to
45 include installation, engineering,
programming, misc. materials, permits
related to install and travel cost. $2,750.00 $15,942.00 $20,927.00 NO BID
One Year On-site Warranty per Additional Room Installation $600.00 $500.00 $350.00 NO BID
Earliest Possible stat date 11/26/2012 11/12/2012 No guarantee of completion 11/19/2012
sooner than 6 weeks. Make all
Days to complete installation 10 days 20 days reasonable accommodations to
complete by 12/12/12 12/11/2012
FOB UAHuntsville UAHuntsville UAHuntsville UAHuntsville
TERMS Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
WARRANTY 1 year Specs One year
ESTIMATED DELIVERY 11/26/2012 12/7/2012 10 weeks ARO 11/16/2012
YOUR REFERENCE NO. HSV-2187 174586
QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL 2/2/2013 12/31/2013 12/15/2012
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB LB LB

11/8/2012 - BID IS AWARDED TO M3
TECHNOLOGY GROUP INC. THE APPARENT,
LOWEST, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS.

Clarified that Opt. Additional
classroom price does not include

equipment. Equipment prices will be
taken from listed prices per item on

bid.

Clarified that Opt. Additional
Classroom price includes all
equipment needed for room.

Clarified that Opt. Additional
Classroom price includes all
equipment needed for room.

Bid not accepted due to the fact
that Bidder must have Alabama
General Contractor License.

DATE

BUYER

11/8/2012

KDH




